BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MIXTURES

N.B. WEST MID MISSOURI
LEAD BELT MINERAL AREA SIMPSON
MATERIALS CO ASPHALT LLC CONTRACTING MATERIALS CO PARTNERS FRED WEBER INC
IFB - BITUMINOUS co HOLDINGS LLC
MIXTURES
BID OPENING DATE 2780 MARY AVE PO BOX 68 2188 HIGHWAY A | 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL
PSI EI(_)SXI\ﬁgGZ?glK FESFiI'OUzoMxo(sgB?OZB BRENTWOOD MO |VALLEY PARK MO|WASHINGTON MO| RD MARYLAND HEIGHTS
12-5-17 63144 63088 63090 MO 63043
COLD MIX (COST PER TON)
PLANT PICK-UP: $60.00 $64.50 $70.00 NO BID $65.00 NO BID
MINIMUM ORDER (TONS) (IF ANY): — N/A 15 N/A 15 _
COMMENTS:
MODIFIED COLD MIX (COST PER TON)
o $102.50 (SOUTH,
PLANT PICK-UP: $100.00 $110.00 NO BID $95.00 ANTIRE, FESTUS
KINGSHIGHWAY)
MINIMUM ORDER (TONS) (IF ANY): N/A 1 N/A . 1
(*) 18 TON MINIMUM
COMMENTS ON DELIVERED LOADS
HOT MIX (COST PER TON)
$65 PER TON -
KINGSHIGHWAY
$42 PER TON - SOUTH,
PLANT PICK-UP: $38.00 $40.50 $46.00 $44.00 $42.00 ANTIRE, JB
$47 PER TON - FESTUS,
ANTONIA- SUB TO
AVAILABILITY
MINIMUM ORDER (TONS) (IF ANY): N/A 10 2 i 5
) (*) 18 TON MINIMUM
COMMENTS: ON DELIVERED LOADS




BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MIXTURES

IFB - BITUMINOUS
MIXTURES
BID OPENING DATE
12-5-17

LEAD BELT
MATERIALS CO

MINERAL AREA
ASPHALT LLC

N.B. WEST
CONTRACTING
CO

SIMPSON
MATERIALS CO

MID MISSOURI
PARTNERS
HOLDINGS LLC

FRED WEBER INC

PO BOX 607 PARK
HILLS MO 63601

PO BOX 637
FESTUS MO 63028

2780 MARY AVE
BRENTWOOD MO
63144

PO BOX 68
VALLEY PARK MO
63088

2188 HIGHWAY A
WASHINGTON MO
63090

2320 CREVE COEUR MILL
RD MARYLAND HEIGHTS
MO 63043

COMMENTS:

ALL DELIVERIES ARE
SUBJECT TO AN 18
TON MINIMUM HAUL
CHARGE PER LOAD.

ALL DELIEVERIES ARE
SUBJECT TO WAITING
TIME AFTER 15 MINS
ON THE JOB AT $60.00

PER HOUR.

WINTER PRICES ARE
EFFECTIVE 1-1-18
THRU 3-31-18 AND

SUPERSEDE QUOTED

PRICING. BP1 HMA -

FOB - $65.00 PER TON.

LOCATIONS ARE
SEASONAL AND WILL
REQUIRE A MINIMUM
OF 200 TONS TO OPEN.

PLANT OPENING

CHARGES FOR 200
TONS OR LESS =$3,000
BASED ON MAXIMUM

OF 8 HOURS.




BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MIXTURES

IFB - BITUMINOUS

LEAD BELT
MATERIALS CO

MINERAL AREA
ASPHALT LLC

N.B. WEST
CONTRACTING
Cco

SIMPSON
MATERIALS CO

MID MISSOURI
PARTNERS
HOLDINGS LLC

FRED WEBER INC

MIXTURES
BIDOPENING DATE | sosoxarpack | _ronoxasy | ZIOWARYAVE | moooxss | awertera a| smocrcvecocumnt
12-5-17 HILLS MO 63601 | FESTUS MO 63028 63144 53088 63000 MO 63043
HAUL CHART (ATTACHMENT A) COLD MIX FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY (PER TON)
0-5 MILES — $4.25 $4.00 NO BID $4.75
5-10 MILES — $4.75 $4.50 NO BID $5.50
10-15 MILES — $5.50 $5.50 NO BID $5.15 $6.25
15-20 MILES — $6.25 $6.25 NO BID $5.80 $7.00
20-25 MILES — $6.95 $7.00 NO BID $6.45 $7.75
25-30 MILES — $7.25 $7.75 NO BID $7.10 $8.50
30-35 MILES — $8.00 $8.50 NO BID $7.75 $9.50
35-40 MILES — $8.50 $9.25 NO BID $8.40 $10.50
40-45 MILES — $9.00 $10.00 NO BID $9.05 $11.50
45-50 MILES — $9.50 $10.50 NO BID $9.70 $12.50
OVER 50 MILES - $9.50 Lﬁol_éo PER ASK NO BID EvsggSSPl\ilquES $13.50

COMMENTS:

DELIVERY IS SUBJECT
TO AN 18 TON
MINIMUM HAUL
CHARGE PER LOAD.

DELIVERY IS SUBJECT
TO WAITING TIME
AFTER 15 MIONS ON
THE JOB AT $60.00 PER
HOUR.

4/30/17 THEN SUBJECT
TO CHANGE ON A

?é-L?]]I;jEBgTH'IFEg MONTHLY BASIS. SEE
CAN PRICES BE HELD FOR 1 FULL CHANGE ON Aill?llli-l)—ISOCNHAI\EII_DBT_IICI\IIgG
YEAR? IF NOT, DATE PRICES MI\OA,;LHHIO 1|2N5D_E;(§$ 5?38160'2:5 MOE‘ZIS_I:BBIADSIS' 1-May-18 INFORMATION BELOW
EXPIRE: ' INDEX PRICE HAUL RA'Il'E)S (PG 12 &
(NOVEMBER
17)=$316.25 INDEX PRICE BASIS =
$316.50
HAUL CHART (ATTACHMENT B) HOT MIX FOR DELIVERY TO JOB SITE (PER TON)
0-5 MILES — $4.25 NO BID NO BID $4.75
5-10 MILES — $4.75 NO BID NO BID $5.50
10-15 MILES — $5.50 NO BID NO BID $6.80 $6.25
15-20 MILES — $6.25 NO BID NO BID $7.45 $7.00
20-25 MILES — $6.95 NO BID NO BID $8.10 $7.75
25-30 MILES — $7.25 NO BID NO BID $8.75 $8.50
30-35 MILES — $8.00 NO BID NO BID $9.40 $9.50
35-40 MILES — $8.50 NO BID NO BID $10.05 $10.50
40-45 MILES — $9.00 NO BID NO BID $10.70 $11.50
45-50 MILES — $9.50 NO BID NO BID $11.35 $12.50
OVER 50 MILES - $9.50 + $6.20 MILE NO BID NO BID $.65 PER EVERY $13.50

5 MILES




BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MIXTURES

IFB - BITUMINOUS

LEAD BELT
MATERIALS CO

MINERAL AREA
ASPHALT LLC

N.B. WEST
CONTRACTING
Cco

SIMPSON
MATERIALS CO

MID MISSOURI
PARTNERS
HOLDINGS LLC

FRED WEBER INC

MIXTURES
BID OPENING DATE 2780 MARY AVE PO BOX 68 2188 HIGHWAY A | 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL
PSI EI(_)SXhﬁg7622§1K FES:'?JECI\)AXOGSJOZB BRENTWOOD MO |VALLEY PARK MO|WASHINGTON MO | RD MARYLAND HEIGHTS
12-5-17 63144 63088 63090 MO 63043
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED M Y M M M Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION v v v v v v
(YIN):
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED % N Y % Y Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN Y N Y Y Y Y
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND
SIGNATURE Y Y Y Y Y Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:




