BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017

ARCH JOHNSTON CO

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

CENTRAL STONE

CENTRAL STONE

H SAND AND GRAVEL

FRED WEBER INC.

SIMPSON MATERIALS CO

INC. ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS | COMPANY - MORSE MILL| COMPANY - ANTONIA
CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017 £790 TRALTMAN 5200 HILLSBORO HOUSE
1-31-17 12520 STATE ROUTE 21 6800 BUSSEN ROAD QUARRY ROAD SPRINGS RD. 1195 SMIZER MILL RD 1195 SMIZER MILL RD PO BOX 69 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 1053 HEADQUARTERS PARK DR
DESOTO MO 63020 EUREKA MO 63025 HOUSE SPRINGS MO FENTON MO 63026 FENTON MO 63026 IMPERIAL MO 63052 MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043 FENTON MO 63026
PEVELY MO 63070 63051
STOCKPILE LOCATIONS:
DESOTO BUILDING
2960 LEE PYLE ROAD
HILLSBORO BUILDING
5275 STATE HIGHWAY B AT
BUTCHER BRANCH ROAD
HOUSE SPRINGS BUILDING
6460 STATE HIGHWAY MM
In emergency, can we call you after YES NO NO NO YES YES YES YES YES
regular hours? Yes or No
DONALD WEBB RESOURCE INTEGRATED
If yes name party to call DIANNA JOHNSTON RANDY HACKWORTH | RANDY HACKWORTH |  CHUCK SMREKER CENTER SCOTT LACY
(866) 739-8855
ORDER PLACEMENT:
(314) 602-8845 STONE (Festus) 838 VFW
telephone number (314) d02.3083 (314) 435-4707 (314) 435-1707 (314) 267-5828 DRIVE FESTUS MO 63028 (314) 660-1852
(SOUTH) 4200 NEW
BAUMGARTNER, ST. LOUIS
MO
BID ALL AVAILABLE
CATEGORIES CRUSHED STONE
DRANLICTS
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - $10.75
14 N/A _ _ _ SOUTH . NO BID VALLEY PARI; | SECYCLE -NO
BARNHART QUARRY -$11
38" N/A $9.60 $8.10 $9.80 $8.75 $9.25 FESTUS - $7.95 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
SOUTH - NO BID o
BARNHART QUARRY - $10.50
172" N/A $10.90 $8.70 $9.80 $9.25 FESTUS - $11.50 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
SOUTH - NO BID A
. FESTUS - $7.95 BARNHART QUARRY - $7.50
3/ $6.70 $9.60 $8.90 $9.60 $6.50 SOUTH - $7.95 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - $10.25
. FESTUS - $7.50 BARNHART QUARRY - $7.50
1 $8.70 $9.60 $8.90 $9.60 $7.65 $8.50 SOUTH. $7.95 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - $10.25
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - NO BID
1&1/4 N/A _ _ _ SOUTH- NG BID VALLEY PAREISECYCLE -NO
BARNHART QUARRY - $7.00
1&1/2" N/A $8.30 _ $8.30 $7.50 FESTUS - $7.35 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
SOUTH - $8.20 b
BARNHART QUARRY - $7.00
. FESTUS - NO BID
183/4 N/A _ _ _ SOUTH- NG BID VALLEY PAR;IFI;ECYCLE -NO
BARNHART QUARRY - $7.00
. FESTUS - $7.00
2 $7.40 $8.30 $7.60 $8.30 $7.25 $7.50 SOUTH. $7.70 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - $8.00
. FESTUS - NO BID
3 $7.40 _ _ _ $8.00 SOUTH- NG BID VALLEY PAR;IFI;ECYCLE -NO
BARNHART - NO BID
. FESTUS - $7.45
4 $7.40 $8.30 $7.60 _ SOUTH. $7.95 VALLEY PAR;IEECYCLE -NO
BARNHART - NO BID
. FESTUS - NO BID
5 N/A _ _ _ SOUTH - NO BID VALLEY PAR;EECYCLE -NO
BARNHART - NO BID
6" $12.50 $8.40 $7.75 FESTUS-NO BID VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO

SOUTH - NO BID

BID
—




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017

ARCH JOHNSTON CO

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

CENTRAL STONE

CENTRAL STONE

H SAND AND GRAVEL

FRED WEBER INC

SIMPSON MATERIALS CO

INC. ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS | COMPANY - MORSE MILL| COMPANY - ANTONIA
CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017 T P ——
1-31-17 12520 STATE ROUTE 21 6800 BUSSEN ROAD QUARRY ROAD SPRINGS RD. 1195 SMIZER MILL RD 1195 SMIZER MILL RD PO BOX 69 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 1053 HEADQUARTERS PARK DR
DESOTO MO 63020 EUREKA MO 63025 HOUSE SPRINGS MO FENTON MO 63026 FENTON MO 63026 IMPERIAL MO 63052 MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043 FENTON MO 63026
PEVELY MO 63070 63051
MINUS
Cost per Ton
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - $1.00 SCREENING
1 $2.50 $1.00 $1.00 _ $1.00- SCREENINGS | $1.00 - SCREENINGS SOUTH 51,00 SCREENING | VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - $1.00
31" NIA $5.70 $5.60 $5.10 sy :112277 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - $2.00
' SCREENING
. FESTUS - NO BID BARNHART QUARRY- NO BID
12 NIA - — $5.10 SOUTH - NO BID VALLEY PARK - NO BID
. FESTUS - $4.25 BARNHART QUARRY - $4.50
o $5.20 8570 8540 $5.70 $5.25 SOUTH - $4.25 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - $6.00
. FESTUS - $4.25 BARNHART QUARRY - $4.50
1 $5.20 $5.70 $5.40 $5.70 $5.00 $5.25 TS TS Wty
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - NO BID
181/ NIA _ _ _ e o VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - $4.95
18112 NIA _ _ _ $5.00 jrioibor VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - $6.00
2 $5.20 $5.70 $5.40 $5.70 $5.00 $5.00 FESTUS - $4.95 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
SOUTH - $4.95 .
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - NO BID
28112 NIA _ _ _ e oo VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - NO BID
3 $5.20 _ _ _ $5.00 $5.00 e oD VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
. FESTUS - $5.25
4 N/A $5.70 $5.40 _ SOUTH - $5.25 VALLEY PAREISECYCLE -NO
BARNHART QUARRY - NO BID
1/2" - 4" Minus Backfill N/A $5.70 $5.40 FESTUS - $5.25 VALLEY PARK RECYCLE - NO
- SOUTH - $5.25 A
COST PER TON
FESTUS - $4.95 BARNHART QUARRY - $4.50
MODOT TYPE 1 OR 5 BASE $5.50 PER TON $6.10 $5.60 $6.10 NIA $5.25 $13.00 e

SOUTH - $4.95




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017

ARCH JOHNSTON CO

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

CENTRAL STONE

CENTRAL STONE

H SAND AND GRAVEL

FRED WEBER INC

SIMPSON MATERIALS CO

INC. ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS COMPANY - MORSE MILL| COMPANY - ANTONIA
CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017 $799 TRAUTMAN 5200 HILLSBORO HOUSE
1-31-17 12520 STATE ROUTE 21 6800 BUSSEN ROAD UARRY ROAD SPRINGS RD. 1195 SMIZER MILL RD 1195 SMIZER MILL RD PO BOX 69 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 1053 HEADQUARTERS PARK DR
DESOTO MO 63020 EUREKA MO 63025 Q HOUSE SPRINGS MO FENTON MO 63026 FENTON MO 63026 IMPERIAL MO 63052 MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043 FENTON MO 63026
PEVELY MO 63070 pubiey
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
COST PER TON VALLEY PARK PLANT
P-GRAVEL $12.00 _ _ _ N/A N/A $8.50 NO BID N/A
N/A ALL OUR PRODUCTS ARE
SCREENED GRAVEL N/A _ _ _ N/A N/A NO BID SCREENED
CREEK GRAVEL N/A _ _ _ N/A N/A NO BID N/A
B-GRAVEL $11.00 _ _ _ N/A N/A $5.00 NO BID N/A
C-GRAVEL $16.00 _ _ _ N/A N/A $15.00 NO BID $16.60
CONCRETE ROCK N/A _ _ _ N/A N/A $15.00 FESTUS ONLY $8.95 $10.25 LIMESTONE GRADE D
FILTER SAND N/A _ _ _ N/A N/A NO BID N/A
SAND $17.50 _ $9.00 _ N/A N/A $15.00 NO BID $16.45 MEDIUM
$6.00 TOP SOIL $1.25 FILL WITH SOME SMALL
DIRT $2.50 _ _ _ $2.35 $1.50 $4.00 FILL DIRT NO BID ROCK
3 %6
OTHER: $8.00
ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES $ N/A _ _ _ $1,500.00 $30 MINIMUM ORDER
DELIVERY ONLY | SAND IS AVAILABLE
COMMENTS: EXCEPT SAND & DIRT | AT OUR JEFFERSON AFTER HOURS OPENING |WE ALSO OFFER A CRUSHED 1/2"
: WHICH CAN BE BARRACKS QUARRY CHARGES GRAVEL FOR $12.50 TON
PICKED UP FOR $6.80/TON
IF YOU CAN NOT HOLD YOUR
PRICE FOR A FULL YEAR, YOU | 1YEARFROM BID
WILL GUARANTEE THIS PRICE DATE N/A _ _ 1/31/2018 1/31/2018 1/31/2018 12/31/2017
TO REMAIN IN EFFECT UNITL:
HAUL CHART MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR
STOCK PILE DELIVERY SEE NOTES BELOW
0-5 miles $3.00 $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $4.00 $3.75 $3.00 $3.75
5-10 miles $3.50 $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $4.50 $4.25 $3.50 $4.25
10-15 miles $3.75 $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $5.00 $4.95 $4.00 $4.90
15-20 miles $4.00 $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 QUOTE BY JOB QUOTE BY JOB $5.00 $6.10
20-25 miles $4.50 $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 " " $5.50 $6.85
25-30 miles $4.75 $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 " " $6.00 $7.60
30-35 miles $5.00 $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 " " $7.00 $8.35
35-40 miles $5.25 $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 " " $7.50 $9.35
40-45 miles $6.00 _ _ _ " " $8.00 $10.35
45-50 miles $6.50 _ _ _ " " $8.50 $11.35
over 50 miles $7.00 + " " $9.00 CALL FOR QUOTE




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017

ARCH JOHNSTON CO

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

CENTRAL STONE

CENTRAL STONE

H SAND AND GRAVEL

FRED WEBER INC

SIMPSON MATERIALS CO

INC. ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS COMPANY - MORSE MILL| COMPANY - ANTONIA
CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017 $799 TRAUTMAN 5200 HILLSBORO HOUSE
1-31-17 12520 STATE ROUTE 21 6800 BUSSEN ROAD UARRY ROAD SPRINGS RD. 1195 SMIZER MILL RD 1195 SMIZER MILL RD PO BOX 69 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 1053 HEADQUARTERS PARK DR
DESOTO MO 63020 EUREKA MO 63025 Q HOUSE SPRINGS MO FENTON MO 63026 FENTON MO 63026 IMPERIAL MO 63052 MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043 FENTON MO 63026
PEVELY MO 63070 63051
ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR ON
SITE DELIVERY
0-5 miles $3.00 $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $4.00 $3.75 $3.00 $3.75 $2.25
5-10 miles $3.50 $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $4.50 $4.25 $3.50 $4.25 $2.50
10-15 miles $3.75 $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $5.00 $4.95 $4.00 $4.90 $2.85
15-20 miles $4.00 $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 QUOTE BY JOB QUOTE BY JOB $5.00 $6.10 $3.10
20-25 miles $4.50 $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 " " $5.50 $6.85 $3.50
25-30 miles $4.75 $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 " " $6.00 $7.60 $4.15
30-35 miles $5.00 $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 " " $7.00 $8.35 $4.75
35-40 miles $5.25 $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 " " $7.50 $9.35 $5.25
40-45 miles $6.00 _ _ _ " " $8.00 $10.35 $5.75
45-50 miles $6.50 _ _ _ " " $8.50 $11.35 $6.50
over 50 miles $7.00 + _ _ _ " " $9.00 CALL FOR QUOTE $0.15
YES
20 TONS MINIMUM FOR ON SITE
MINIMIUM DELIVERY REQUIRED YES NO NO NO YES DELIVERY.
24 TONS MINIMUM FOR
STOCKPILE TO YARD.
LOADS LESS THAN 20 [ LOAD LESS THAN 20 | LOAD LESS THAN 15
IF, YES AMOUNT $ $55.00 TONS, CHARGED AT TONS BILLED AT A | TONS ARE CHARGED $100.00 MINIMUM TONS x APPLICABLE

20 TON RATE

FLAT FEE RATE

AT AFLAT FEE RATE

RATE




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017

CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2017
1-31-17

ARCH JOHNSTON CO

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

BUSSEN QUARRIES -

CENTRAL STONE

CENTRAL STONE

H SAND AND GRAVEL

FRED WEBER INC

SIMPSON MATERIALS CO

INC. ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS COMPANY - MORSE MILL| COMPANY - ANTONIA
8799 TRAUTMAN 5200 HILLSBORO HOUSE
12520 STATE ROUTE 21 6800 BUSSEN ROAD QUARRY ROAD SPRINGS RD. 1195 SMIZER MILL RD 1195 SMIZER MILL RD PO BOX 69 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 1053 HEADQUARTERS PARK DR

DESOTO MO 63020

EUREKA MO 63025

PEVELY MO 63070

HOUSE SPRINGS MO
63051

FENTON MO 63026

FENTON MO 63026

IMPERIAL MO 63052

MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043

FENTON MO 63026

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT

COMPLETED Y M M Y Y Y Y Y Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION v v v v
(YIN):
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y % Y Y Y N Y %
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND
SIGNATURE Y Y Y Y Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
SEE PAGE 12
(F) - FESTUS
(S) - SOUTH
DELIVERY IS SUBJECT TO
AN 18 TON MINIMUM PAGE 128

COMMENTS:

PAGE 16 NOT FILLED
ouT

HAUL CHARGE PER LOAD.
DELIVERY IS SUBJECT TO

WAITING TIME AFTER 15
MINUTES ON THE JOB AT
$60.00 PER HOUR.

MATERIALS ARE SUBJECT

TO AVAILABILITY.

SEE PAGE 14

DELIVERY IS SUBJECT TO

AN 18 TON MINIMUM

HAUL CHARGE PER LOAD.
DELIVERY IS SUBJECT TO

WAITING TIME AFTER 15
MINUTES ON THE JOB
$60.00 PER HOUR.

WE ALSO OFFER A DIRT/ROCK
FIVE FOR $1.25 TON

PAGE 14 STOCKPILE RATES TO
YARD LOCATIONS.
DESOTO - BARNHART - $4.25
VALLEY PARK - $5.75
HILLSBORO - BARNHART - $4.15
VALLEY PARK - $5.25
HOUSE SPRINGS - BARNHART -
$3.20
VALLEY PARK $3.55




ORIGINAL

JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG BID #: 17-0008
Invitation for Bid: CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL Date Issued: 12-30-2016
PRODUCTS 2017

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 31, 2017, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.
KURT WENGERT
Specification | Department of Public Works
Contact: | 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract VICKIE PRATT

Contact: | Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380
SAMPLE ENVELOPE
Mail (3) Three VENDOR NAME
Complete Copies | | VEMPORADDRESS
With Vendor And || CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
Bid Information As JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
Shown In Sample: 729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100
SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

. | The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
Contract Term: agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
UPON APPROVAL OF THE | ¢qnditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
COUNTY COUNCIL AND | ciniract with Jefferson County, Missourl, upon approval of the County Council and County
COUNTY EXECUTIVE | gy ocntive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original apreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the
Vendor | successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

Information: | by the County.

Fred Weber, Inc. Konn Wilson

Company Name Authorized Afent (Print)
2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd %"b

Address Signature

Maryland Heights, MO 63043 i
City/State/Zip Code Title

314-344-0070 1/31/2017 43 0626545
Telephone # Date Tax ID #
slbartlett@fredweberinc.com 314-344-0970
E-mail ) Fax #

Invitiation for Bid 1 of 16 Bidder's Initals%‘



SPECIFICATIONS

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS
This bid is for the purchase of Crushed Stone and Gravel Products for use in the maintenance of roads and
bridges maintained by Jefferson County Public Works.

The County reserves the right to purchase Crushed Stone and Gravel Products at any supplier when the County
determines it is in its best interest due to pricing, or when requirements exceed these guidelines, or for special
materials which are normally only a special order item.

Material shall meet the requirements of Section 1007 "AGGREGATE FOR BASE" of the January 2017
revised version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise approved
by the County Engineer.

TERM OF CONTRACT
This contract will remain in effect for 24 months from the date of acceptance. The County of Jefferson reserves
the right to renew this contract for an additional 24-month period at the same terms and conditions with the
written consent of the successful bidders.

After 12 months in the original contract term, the bidders will be permitted to modify their prices for the
remainder of that term. If the confract is renewed for a subsequent 24-month period, the bidders will be
permitted to adjust prices again once 12 months have elapsed in the renewal period.

BID PRICES
Base price is for materials picked up in your yard by County vehicles. Bidders should also include an add-on
price for hauling to locations specified by the County at time of delivery. Stockpile delivery to County
locations listed below will receive five (5) working days’ notice to fill order. Material will be ordered as
needed.

Site spread delivery will receive a minimum of twenty-four (24) hours’ notice to begin delivery. Delivery order
will be 2 minimum of 200 tons. Delivery distance for site spread to be computed to the center of the project.

Stockpile locations will be as follows:

De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67
Hillsboro Building 5275 State Highway B at Butcher Branch Road
House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES X NO

If yes, name party to call: Resource Integration Center

Order Placement: Stone: (F)-Festus - 838 VFW Drive, Festus MO 63028
Telephone number:  (866) 739-8855 (S)-South - 4200 New Baumgartner, St Louis MO

Invitiation for Bid 11 of 16 Bidder's Initals”



BID ALL AVAILABLE CATEGORIES
CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS

CLEAN STONE MINUS

COST PER TON COST PER TON :

(F)-Festus (8) South (F)-Festus (5) South
1/4" $ 1075 No Bid 1/4" $_1.00 screenings| $1.00 screenings
3/8" $ 795 No Bid 3/8" $ 127 $1.27
12" $ use No Bid 12" $ NoBid No Bid
3/4" $ 755 $7.95 3/4" $ 425 $4.25
1" $ 750 $7.95 " $ 425 $4.25
1&1/4" $ NoBid No Bid 1&1/4" $_ NoBid No Bid
1&1/2" $ 7.35 $8.20 1&1/2" 3 495 $4.95
1&3/4" $ NoBid No Bid A $ 495 $4.95
A $ 700 $7.70 2&1/2" $_ Nonid No Bid
3" $ NoBid No Bid 3" $ NoBid No Bid
4" $ 745 $7.95 4" $_ 525 $5.25
5" $_No Bid No Bid (172" - 4" MINUS
BACKFILL) $525 $5.25

6" $ NoBid No Bid

COST PER TON

MoDOT $ 495 (Festus & South)
Type 1 or S Base

(F)- Festus Location

(S)- South Location

*Delivery is subject to an 18 ton minimum haul charge per load.

*Delivery is subject to Waiting Time after 15 minutes on the job at $60.00 per hour.

*Materials are subject to availability

Bidder's Initals :

Invitiation for Bid 12 0f 16



HAUL CHART

MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON ADD ON PRICE PER TON

FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY FOR ON SITE DELIVERY
0-S5Smiles $ *7° PER TON $ 37 PER TON
5-10miles §$ 425 PER TON § 425 PER TON
10 -15 miles § 490 PER TON $ 490 PER TON
15 -20 miles §_ 610 PER TON $ 610 PER TON
20-25 miles $ 6.85 PER TON § 685 PER TON
25-30miles $ 7.0 PER TON $ 7.60 PER TON
30 -35miles § 835 PER TON $ 835 PER TON
35-40miles $ 935 PER TON $ 935 PER TON
40 - 45 miles § 1035 PER TON $ 1035 PER TON
45 -50miles $§ 11.35 PER TON $ 1135 PER TON
Over 50 miles $Call for Ouote PER TON MILE $call for Quote PER TON MILE

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) No
If yes, amount $_ 100.00

*Delivery is subject to an 18 ton minimum haul charge per load.
*Delivery is subject to Waiting Time after 15 minutes on the job at $60.00 per hour.

Invitiation for Bid 14 of 16 Bidder's Initals #



OR) 3 JvAL
JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG BID #: 17-0008

Invitation for Bid: CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL Date Issued: 12-30-2016
PRODUCTS 2017

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 31, 2017, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.
KURT WENGERT
Specification | Department of Public Works
Contact: | 636-797-5427
kwengert(@jeffcomo.org

Contract | VICKIE PRATT

Contact: | Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380
SAMPLE ENVELOPE
Mail (3) Three || PORMME
Complete Copies | | "#PORADDRESS
With Vendor And | | CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
Bid Information As JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURT

Shown In Sample: 729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

. | The undersigned certifies that hefshe has the authority to bind this company in an
Contract Term: apreement/contract to supply the commeodity or service in accordance with all terms,
UPON APPROVAL OF THE | conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
COUNTY COUNCIL AND | contract with Jefferson County, Misgsouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
COUNTY EXECUTIVE | gy eontive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the
Vendor | successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

Information: | by the County.

Simpson Moretimys . Settlaey

Company Name

Authorizéd Agent,(Print}
/053 feaolyarFins /i e ?745%(

Address “Signati
Frvmon, Mp 63024 Aranr (are-SKLes
City/State/Zip Code = Title

636-2/%- 491/ /-3p17  43-0niRb02
Telephone # Date Tax TD #

s/agz@ S)m psonmatenak Com 634343 4K
E-ma Fax #
10f 16 Bidder's Initals ‘;’{

Invitiation for Bid



B horer &

850 Sujphuir Spromse B, Tnpersar Mo 630 )5

BID ALL AVAILABLE CATEGORIES

CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS
CLEAN STONE MINUS
COST PER TON COST PER TON
/4" $_— /4" $_—
3/8" /)00 3/8" s_{.00
12 5 /0. 50 172" s~
3/4" 3 7.50 3/4" s 4 50
T 5 7.50 T s 450
1&14"  §_— 1&1/4" s
181" 5 700 &1 s~
18347 §.7-90 2" 8600
2n 5 /-00 w1t 57
3 5_8.00 3" 5~
4" s 4" s~
5" 5~ (172" - 4" MINUS _
BACKFILL) § <~
6" 5 7~
COST PER TON

MoDOT

$4{50

Type 1 or 5 Base

Invitiation for Bid

/13-4

12 of 16

Bidder's Initals

=Y A



Vm/ey fw- W tycd Contrere Frms
697 Wesr ﬂwae 2, basy Aw Mo 63088

BID ALL AVAILABLE CATEGORIES

CRUSHED STONE PRODUCTS

CLEAN STONE MINUS

COST PER TON COST PER TON
1/4" $ - 1/4" § -
3/8" s 3/8" $ S0 - SCeeansS
12" § — 1am s —
3/4" $10.25 3/4m g 600
1" $70.25 1" s 500
1&1/4" 1&1/4" $__—
1&172" $ — 1&1/2" g -
1&3/4" § — ot 5 —
2" s 2&1/2" -
K $ - 3 §
v . e
5" s (172" - 4" MINUS
o . - BACKFILL) §_~

Wb alo oFlin A dhrtifeooc
COST PER TON Fu Son B/ 25 o

MoDOT $ 5 00
Type 1 or 5 Base

2@
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Vaweey fopr Pevnr

699 W, owrer fo. Inetamec Somp .
hovey /Am// MO GZO£P  GRAVEL PRODUCTS
COST PER TON

P-GRAVEL s NMA

SCREENED GRAVEL, $§ A4 A pur proc/verss are wrvaretd ¢
u//éﬂsp-

CREEK GRAVEL $_NMA
B-GRAVEL s M
C-GRAVEL s /660
CONCRETEROCK  $/0-35  Aimesrone GEROE s
FILTER SAND s NA
SAND- m@/"m $ /645
DIRT - A/ s /. A5
borthsome s mn )/ toce

Nenbko o/don A CrusHed

Mwimynry orOEL %" grave/ fon IR 50 A

Additional Supplier Fees $ 30- 29 Comments:

If you cannot hold your price for one full year, you will guarantee this price to remain in effect until:

12-8/)- 2017

(DATE YOUR BID PRICES EXPIRE)

st

Invitiation for Bid 13 of 16 Bidder's Initals



HAUL CHART

MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY
(Secrvres Baran™

0-5miles § PER TON
5-10miles $ PER TON
10-15 miles $ PER TON
15 -20 miles § PER TON
20 - 25 miles § PER TON
25-30miles § PER TON
30-35 miles §$ PER TON
35-40 miles $ PER TON
40 - 45 miles § PER TON
45 - 50 miles $ PER TON
Over 50 miles § PER TON MILE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR ON SITE DPELIVERY

§ ZAS PERTON

$ 50  PERTON
5 A5  pErTON
$ Z1/0  PERTON
$ 250 PERTON
$ 4/5  PERTON
§ 4.75 PERTON
$ 5.25 PERTON
$ 5.75  PERTON
§ 6-56  PERTON
s, /5 PER TON MILE

FOANS wnrumun £ ow SR Ok Hery

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) No 9291 AoNS romvrovem 74;1496(2,0:/& 7@ qM
If yes, amount $§ MINImve Fons X Wf/-’cﬂbé ArE

Sroaple Bves Fo Yoo Locwrons

J&I 070
A7/ b orpo ——

/% 744 f/apxmj_g

Invitiation for Bid
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