
BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JUMBO TOILET 

TISSUE

1559673 - 

JUMBO 

TOILET PAPER 

$33.99 / CASE 

OF 12

RPJRT-2-SEL NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: Georgia 

or Equivalent

BRIGHTON 

PROFESSIONAL 

BID # 365379

BEENI 

PACK
NOVA

HOW PACKAGED: 12 ROLLS/ CASE 12/ CASE 12/ CASE

12 ROLLS/ 

1,000 '/ RL/ 

CASE

12 ROLLS

ROLLS PER CASE: 12 12 12 12

BID PRICE PER CASE: $25.98 CS $16.74 $33.99 $19.25 $18.95 CS NO BID NO BID $27.00 NO BID $17.55 $18.54 CS

COMMENTS: (MUST FIT 

SAN JAMAR DISP.)

CAS B140 JRT 

SELECT 3.3x1000' 

2PLY 12 RI/CS

MUST FIT SAN 

JAMAR 

DISPENSER

LAUNDRY 

DETERGENT
NO BID RL7000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: Optional 
PUREX

BID #06354

INTERCHEM 

SPARKLE 

BRIGHT 

LAUNDRY 

DETERGENT

HOW PACKAGED: 5 

Gal/bucket
5 GAL BUCKETS

BID PRICE PER BUCKET: $60.60 (5 GAL) - NO BID $48.41 $59.46/ CASE
$79.14/ 

BUCKET
NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.25 $22.60 EACH

COMMENTS:

SUNBURST 

RELIANCE 

LIQUID 

DETERGENT 

CONCENTRATE 

784205 5 GAL

CASE PACK: 2/ 

2.5 GL/CS

(EASIER TO 

MANEUVER)

ECOLAB 

#6116326 TRI-

STAR 

FLEXYLITE 5 

GAL

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

SMALL TOILET 

TISSUE
1559731 RPTP-2-SEL NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: Optional 

BRIGHTON 

PROFESSIONAL

BID # 365377

NOVA

HOW PACKAGED: By the 

case
BY THE CASE BY THE CASE

BY THE 

CASE
BY THE CASE 

ROLLS PER CASE: 96 96 96
80 ROLLS / 

CASE
96

SHEETS PER ROLL: 500 500 500
550 SHEETS 

PER ROLL
500

BID PRICE PER CASE $43.68 CS $35.24 $40.49 / CASE $28.92 $28.45/ CASE NO BID NO BID $43.00 NO BID $27.95 $26.96 CASE

COMMENTS: 

CAS BO40 PRO 

SELECT STD 

BATH TISSUE 2 

PLY 4x3.2" 

500SHT 96 RI/ CS

SHEET SIZE 

4.5" x3.5" 

SHEET SIZE

KITCHEN TOWELS: 1559475 RPKRT-250 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: Optional 

BRIGHTON 

PROFESSIONAL

BID # 365384

HOW PACKAGED: By the 

Case
BY THE CASE

BY THE 

CASE 

ROLLS PER CASE: 30 30
12 ROLLS / 

CASE

SHEETS PER ROLL: 90
85 SHEETS/ 

ROLL 
5.9" ROLL 

BID PRICE PER CASE: $25.83 CS - $31.99 $18.49 NO BID NO BID $28.00 NO BID $17.65 $19.15 CASE

COMMENTS: 

CAS K085 PRO 

SELECT 

KITCHEN ROLL 

TOWEL 11x8" 2 

PLY 85 SHT 30 RI. 

CS

12 ROLLS OF 

250 

SHEETS/ROLL/

CASE.

9"x11" SHEET 

SIZE (300 

MORE 

SHEETS/CASE)

85 

SHEETS/RO

LL



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

TRASH BAGS: 

LARGE
NO BID 6033096

(A) RL44XH-B

(B) RLHD44XH-

B

DPS4046-6 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: Optional OPTIONAL

HOW PACKAGED: By the 

case

BY THE 

CASE

BAGS PER CASE: 200 $200.00 80/ BOX 250

BAG SIZE: 40"X46" .60mil
200 40"x46" 

.60 mil 
.55 MIL

BID PRICE PER CASE: NO BID - $13.94 / 200 $19.99 / BX $19.37 $19.56
(A) $24.99/ CS

(B) $22.32/ CS

$15.98 PER 

200
NO BID NO BID $22.90 NO BID $18.25 $11.29 CASE

COMMENTS: NEED 

SAMPLE WITH BID

INT-4048-H 

SAMPLE 1

AVAILABLE 

UP REQUEST

HP CAN LINER 

40x46 .5 MIL 

BLACK 250/CS

SEE 

ALTERNATE 

ALSO

AS SAMPLE 

#1

OURS IS PER 

CASE OF 250, 

EQUALS $.073 

PER BAG

TRASH BAGS: 

SMALL
NO BID 6297956

(A) RL10L/M-B-

PERF

(B) RLHD10L/M-B

DPS2233-4 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL 
OPTIONAL 

HOW PACKAGED: BY THE 

CASE

BY THE 

CASE

BAGS PER CASE: 1,000 $1,000.00 90 bg/ BOX

BAG SIZE: 22" x 33" MIL
22"x33" .40 

mil

24x27

.9 mil
24x32

BID PRICE PER CASE: NO BID - $17.48 / 1,000 $13.99 $18.80 $19.42
(A) $31.95/ CS

(B) $19.50/CS

$21.68 PER 

1,000
NO BID NO BID $16.80 NO BID $25.65 $24.92 CASE

COMMENTS: NEED 

SAMPLE WITH BID

INT - 2433-R 

SAMPLE #2

HP CAN LINER 

24x32 .5 MIL 

BLACK 500/CS

SEE 

ALTERNATE 

ALSO

AS PER 

SAMPLE #2

EQUALS $.0257 

PER BAG



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

BAR HAND SOAP 

(NOT IVORY)
NO BID NO BID TPPW-CB075 NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

DIAL 

(WHITE 

MARBLE)

TRANSMACRO 

GOOD DAY 

BAR SOAP

HOW PACKAGED: 100 

BARS PER CASE
1,000 CTN 1,000

OZ. PER BAR: 0.75 3/4 OZ BAR 

BARS PER CASE: 100 1000

BID PRICE PER CASE: NO BID - NO BID $39.33 $43.95/CS NO BID $5.96 $56.49 $89.98 $88.00 $47.15 CASE

COMMENTS: UNWRAPPED

WRAPPED BAR 

SOAP 3/4 OZ 

PLEASANTSCEN

T 1000/CS

OURS IS 

WRAPPED. 

OURS HAS 400 

PER CASE

PACKED 

100/PK/CS, 10 

PK 1 CS, 

AMERFRESH 

BRAND

#1.5 HEM TU 

15 EF 500 

PER CASE

WRAPPED
WRAPPED 

$.088 PER BAR

SINGLE FOLD 

TOWELS: 
1559327 BW470 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

ENVISION

BID #23504

SHEET SIZE: 9" x 10" 

(230MM x 270MM)

9"x10" (230MM x 

270MM)

9"x10" (230MM 

x 270MM)

HOW PACKAGED: BY THE 

CASE
BY THE CASE BY THE CASE 16/ BOX 9"x9 1/4

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 
16 PKS/ 250 

SHEETS
336 250 BROWN 334 250

PACKAGE PER CASE: 16 PKS 4008 63 / CASE 16 9x10 12 16
1,000 PER 

CASE

BID PRICE PER CASE: $26.59 CS $14.39 $22.99 $15.43 $18.51/CS NO BID NO BID $19.22 NO BID $14.31 $14.71 CASE

COMMENTS: 

CAS H165 PRO 

SELECT S-FOLD 

TOWEL

NATURAL 

250SHT/ OK 

16PK/ CS

SEE 

ALTERNATIVE

ICE MELT 

(POTASIUM 

CHLORIDE)

NO BID 71646

5T-

TRACTIONMELT5

0

NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

HOW PACKAGED: 

BAG/BOX

LBS. PER BAG: 50 50#

BID PRICE PER 50 LB: NO BID - $21.99 $5.12 $7.95 BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.49 $570 PALLET

COMMENTS: SMALL 

SAMPLE TO CHECK ROCK 

SIZE TO BE SUBMITTED 

WITH BID: 

CARGILL 

WINTER MELT 

HALITE 50# 

(100% SOD 

CHLOR)

SAMPLE WILL 

BE SENT 

UNDER 

SEPARTE 

COVER



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

INDIVIDUALLY 

WRAPPED 

SANITARY NAPKINS 

(MAXI PADS)

1561208 RC25189973 NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

RMC 

NATURELLE

BID - 04

HOW PACKAGED: BY THE 

CASE
BY THE CASE

PADS PER BOX: 1 EACH 1 EACH

BOXES PER CASE: 250

BID PRICE PER CASE: $50.48 CS - $39.99 $28.41 $36.84/CS NO BID $16.36 $28.98 $25.98 $24.62 $34.77 CASE

COMMENTS: 

HOSPECO 

GARDS MAXI 

SANITARY 

NAPKIN #4 147A 

250/ CS

AMERFRESH 

BRAND
ITEM SN-C 147A

MOP HEADS 10470 RL16COT NO BID NO BID
LAYFLAT 

TYPE 

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

UNISAN

BID - UNS716C

HOW PACKAGED: BULK BULK

MOP HEADS PER CASE: 6
121 CASE SOLD 

PER EACH $4.92

BID PRICE PER CASE: $159.04 / 12/CS -
$41.94 (6.99 

EACH)
$30.36 $9.95/CS NO BID NO BID $14.88 $15.87 $2.69 EACH

COMMENTS: NO WIRE 

AND MUST BE SCREW ON 

TYPE

GOLDEN STAR 

AWM7716R 

BOLT RIVETED 

COTTON WET 

MOP 16 OZ 12./ 

CS

ABCO 

#CM2216$

BLEACH 1008580 NVBL-4 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

PUREBRIGHT

BID # 

KIKBLEACH 3

PURE BIRGHT 

LIQUID 

BLEACH 

HOW PACKAGED: CASE 3 / CASE

GALLONS PER CASE: 4 4
3-1 GALLON 

/CASE

BID PRICE PER CASE: $6.19 CS OF 3 - $2.09 $9.72 $5.92/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.77 $8.90

COMMENTS: .

HOUSEHOLD A-1 

ULTRA BLEACH 

DISINFECTANT 

6% 6 GAL. / CS

SEE 

ADDITIONAL 

PRICING



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

BROOMS NO BID NO BID
#12247-BIG 

MAX
NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

ABCO 

BLEANDED 

NO WIRES 

BROOM 

HOW PACKAGED: 12 DOZEN
2 EACH 1 

CTN
12 PER CASE 12/ CASE

BID PRICE PER DOZEN: NO BID - NO BID $93.00 $76.50/ DOZEN NO BID NO BID $83.88 $93.60 $100.56

COMMENTS: NO WIRE OF 

ANY KIND ON BROOMS. 

(PRISON TYPE)

GOLDEN STAR 

BRP58B CORN 

NO-WIRE 

PRISION BROOM 

WOOD HANDLE. 

GREENWOO

D #596

MIN ORDER IN 

LOTS OF 12 

PER CASE. SEE 

ATTACHED 

LITERATURE

NON-ALCOHOL 

FOAMING HAND 

SANITIZER

NO BID NO BID $55,857.00 RP1120 NO BID NO BID $55,857.00

MANUFACTURER: DEB

DEB INSTANT 

FOAM FREE 

NON-

ALCOHOL

HOW PACKAGED: 1  LITER 

BOTTLES
1 LITER/CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $36.26 $39.99/ CS $49/CASE NO BID NO BID $36.96 $35.64

COMMENTS: MUST FIT 

DEB DISPENSOR.

DEB INSTANT 

FOAM FREE NON-

ALC FOAM 

HAND 

SANITIZER 1L 

6/BX

YES.

(6 BOXES, 1 

LITER/CASE)

ECOLAB 

#6100730 

FOAM HAND 

SANITIZER 

4x1250ML.

ECOLAB 

DISPENSER - 

NO CHARGE

EXACTLY AS 

CURRENTLY 

BEING 

SUPPLIED

WHITE ROLL 

TOWELS
6124267 RPRLBL-1000 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

KIMMBERLY CLARK 

#01000

K.C. SCOTT

BID # 815614

KIMMBERLY 

CLARK #01000

KIMBERLY 

CLARK 

HOW PACKAGED: 12 

PACKAGES PER CASE

12 PACKAGES 

PER CASE 

12 PACKAGES 

PER CASE
6/ CASE

12 

ROLLS/CASE

BID PRICE PER CASE: $89.01 CS $20.33 $59.99 $68.09 $57.79/ CS NO BID NO BID $120.98 $66.45 $106.56 CASE

COMMENTS: 600 FT ROLL

KC 01000 HRT 

WHITE HARD 

ROLL TOWEL 8 x 

1000      12/ CS

12 RLS/ 1000/ 

CS

NOT 

KIMMBERLY 

CLARK

KC#01000



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

ANTI-BACTERIAL 

HAND SOAP
NO BID NO BID RP1110 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: DEB

DEB FOAM 

ANI-

BACTERIAL

HOW PACKAGED: 6 I LITER 

BAGS PER CASE
6/1LITER

BID PRICE PER CASE: NO BID - NO BID $29.64 $28.95/ CS $41.88/CASE NO BID NO BID $29.80 $29.40 CASE

COMMENTS: MUST FIT 

DEB DISPENSOR. 

DEB ANT1L 

REFRESH 

ANTIBAC FOAM 

1L 6/CS

YES.

(6 BOXES/1 

LITER/ CASE)

ECOLAB INC 

#6101088 

NEXA AB 

FOAM HAND 

SOAP.

4x1250ML

$41.88/CASE

ECOLAB 

DISPENSER - 

NO CHARGE

LAUNDRY BLEACH NO BID NO BID RL7300 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL
$10.00

INTECHEM 

KHLOR EXTRA 

LAUNDRY 

BLEACH

HOW PACKAGED: BY THE 

5-GAL BUCKET
5 GAL. PAIL

BID PRICE PER BUCKET: NO BID - NO BID $27.25 $32.02/ CS
$29.50/ 

BUCKET
NO BID NO BID $39.45 $26.45 EACH

COMMENTS: 

SODUIM 

HYPOCHLORITE 

CHLORINE 

BLEACH 12.5% 5 

GAL

2/2.5 GL/CASE 

EASIER TO 

MANEUVER

ECOLAB 

#6115982 

LAUNDRI 

DESTAINER 

5 GAL

ENVIROTEX 

LAUNDRY 

DETERGENT

LAUNDRY 

SOFTENER
NO BID NO BID RL7500 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

INTERCHEM 

SOFTY 

LAUNDRY 

SOFTNER

HOW PACKAGED: BY THE 

5-GAL BUCKET
5 GAL PAIL

BID PRICE PER BUCKET: NO BID - NO BID $41.21 $53.86/ CASE
$107.29/ 

BUCKET
NO BID NO BID $53.00 $28.35 EACH

COMMENTS: 

SUNBURST 

VALU SOFT 

FABRIC 

SOFTNER 791805

2/2.5 GL/CASE 

EASIER TO 

MANEUVER

ECOLAB 

#6100998 TRI 

STAR 

CLEARLY 

SOFT PLUS 5 

GAL

ENVIROTEX 

SOFTNER



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

SCREW ON MOP 

HANDLES
NO BID RL6050-HDLE NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL 

UNISAD

BID # UN5833

BOARDWALK 

SCREW-IN 

MOP HANDLE

HOW PACKAGED: UNIT OF 

12

SOLD PER EACH 

$3.47 

BID PRICE PER UNIT $41.64 CS OF 12 - NO BID $49.08 $3.89/ EACH NO BID NO BID $35.88
$45.15 PER 

CASE OF 12
$3.99 EACH

COMMENTS: SHIP 12/CASE

GOLDEN STAR 

HWM118SF STAY 

FLAT WOOD 

HANDLE DZ

$46.68/ DOZEN
ABCO#0121

0NB
AS SPECIFIED

HI-PERFORMANCE 

NEUTRAL FLOOR 

CLEANER

NO BID NO BID PG02037 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL
ECOLAB

BRULIN 

NEUTRAL 

CLEANER 

HOW PACKAGED: 2.5 GAL
2.5 GALLON/ 2 

CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $95.94 $68.95/ CASE $88.63/ EACH NO BID NO BID

$19.65 PER 2.5 

GAL/ $39.30 

PER CASE OF 

2/2.5 GAL

$40.04 CASE

COMMENTS: MUST 

SUPPLY DISPENSOR. 

JOHNSON 

94996458 RTD 

#66 

PROMINENCE 

HD DAILY CLNR 

5L. BX

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR 

ADDITIONAL 

INFORMATION

ECOLAB 

#6100036 HI 

PERF NEUT 

FLOOR 2.5 

GAL 

DISPENSER 

NO CHARGE

BRULIN 

NEUTRAL 

CLEANER

HI-PERFORMANCE 

NEUTRAL FLOOR 

CLEANER

NO BID NO BID PG02037 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL 

BRULIN 

NEUTRAL 

CLEANER 

HOW PACKAGED: 2.2 

LITER
2- 1.3L 64OZ// 4 CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $95.94 $68.95/ CASE $37.41/CASE NO BID NO BID

$70.22 PER 

CASE OF 4/64 

OZ. (EQUALS 

APPROX $17.55 

PER 64 OZ/

$74.70

COMMENTS: MUST 

SUPPLY DISPENSOR. 

JOHNSON 

94996458 RTD 

#66 

PROMINENCE 

HD DAILY CLRN 

5L. BX

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR 

ADDITIONAL 

INFORMATION

ECOLAB 

#6100082 HI 

PERF ULTRA 

CONC. NEUT 

FLOOR



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

ALL PURPOSE 

DISINFECTANT 

CLEANER

NO BID NO BID
(A) PG02039

(B) PG32535
NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

BRULIN 

MAXIMA 

DISINFECTAN

T 

HOW PACKAGED: 2- 2.2 

LITERS PER BOX
2- 1.3L 64 OZ/ 4-CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $32.39

(A) 

$69.50/CASE

(B) $89.95 

CASE

$21.35/ CASE NO BID NO BID

$62.28 PER 

CASE OF 4/64 

OZ. (1:256 

DILUTION 

RATE) 

$65.99 CASE

COMMENTS: MUST 

SUPPLY DISPENSOR

JOHNSON 

3062637 RTD #5 

VIREX II 256 DIS 

CLNR 1.5L 2/BX

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR 

ADDITIONAL 

INFORMATION 

AND 

ALTERNATIVE

ECOLAB 

#6100792 MS 

PERXOIDE 

DISINFECT.

DISPENSER 

NO CHARGE

BRULIN 

MAXIMA 

DISINFECTANT 

CLEANER

SEE 

ADDITIONAL 

COST

BIO-ENZ ODOR 

CONTROL
NO BID NO BID 

(A) PG38015

(B) NI128ZGA
NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: 

OPTIONAL

HOW PACKAGED: 2 - 2.2 

LITER BOTTLES
2- 1.3L 

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $46.86

(A) $ 118/ CASE

(B) 

$49.95/CASE

$23.03/ CASE NO BID NO BID

$43.40 PER 

CASE OF 4 

GALLONS

COMMENTS: MUST 

SUPPLY DISPENSOR.

JOHNSON 

95773791 J-FILL 

#40 

BREAKDOWN 

ODOR ELIMIN 

CON 2/2.5L/ BOX

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR 

ADDITIONAL 

INFORMATION 

AND 

ALTERNATIVE 

ECOLAB 

#6101023 

QC77 BIO 

ENZ ODOR 

ELIMINATOR

DISPENSOR 

NO CHARGE

BRULIN 

BIOZYME II 

RTU- READY 

TO USE

ACID BATHROOM 

CLEANER
NO BID NO BID PG20542 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER: P & G

BRULIN 

GREEN 

BATHROOM 

CLEANER 

HOW PACKAGED: 2 - 2.2 

LITER BOTTLES
2- 1.3L 64 OZ/ 4-CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: NO BID - NO BID $50.97 $53.25/CASE $45.46/CASE NO BID NO BID

$69.85 PER 

CASE OF 4/64 

OX (1:64 

DILUTION 

RATE)

$75.61

COMMENTS: MUST 

SUPPLY ORDER: 

FULL PALLET 

PER ODER

JOHNSON 

93063461 RTD #9 

CREW SHOWER/ 

TUB/ TILE 

CLEAN 1.5L 2/BX

MUST SUPPLY 

DISPENSOR

FREE OSHA 

APPROVED 

LABELED 

SPRAY 

BOTTLES & 

SPRAYERS

ECOLAB 

QC91 ACID 

BATH 

CLEANER. 

DISPENSOR 

NO CHARGE

BRULIN GREEN 

BATHROOM 

CLEANER



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2018

QUILL 

CORPORATION

AMERICAN 

PRIDE PAPER 

& PLASTIC

INTERBORO 

PACKING 

CORP

COTTON'S 

ACE 

HARDWARE

FORDON 

PACKING 

LTD

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ROYAL 

PAPERS INC

DISPOSE N 

SAVE

ECOLAB 

INC

PHOENIX 

TRADING 

INC DBA 

AMERCARE 

PROCUTS 

INC

BOB 

BARKER 

COMPANY 

INC

CENTRAL 

POLY-BAG 

CORP

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP 

COMPANY

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM & 

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLY 

100 SCHELTER RD

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

87 ARLIGTON 

AVE

LAKEWOOD NJ 

08701

114 BRADEN 

RD

MONTGOMER

GY NY 12549

210 N MAIN ST

DE SOTO MO 

63020

637 

WYCKOFF 

AVE STE 335

WYCKOFF NJ 

07481

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL

INDIANAPOLIS IN 

46268

2701 HEREFORD 

ST

ST. LOUIS MO 

63139

5 GETZIL 

BERGER BLVD 

MONROE NY 

10950

1 ECOLAB 

PLACE EGH-7 

ST. PAUL MN 

55102

17661 128TH 

PLACE NE 

WOODINVILLE 

WA 98072

134 N MAIN ST 

FUQUAY 

VARINA NC 

27526

2400 BEDLE 

PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 

07036

6510 NORTH 

54TH ST

TAMPA FL 

33610

9150 LATTY AVE 

ST. LOUIS MO 

63134

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS 

MO 63132

JANITORIAL 

SUPPLIES 2018

10-24-2017

NOTARIZED WORK 

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

E-VERIFICATION 

DOCUMENTATION (Y/N):
Y N Y N N Y Y Y Y N N Y Y Y N

COPY OF INSURANCE 

PROVIDED
Y N Y Y N Y N Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR 

NOTARIZED LETTER 

STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY 

OWNED IN JEFFERSON 

COUNTY

N N Y Y N Y N Y N Y N Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE BID FORM 

(Y/N)
Y Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT 

INFO:
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

COMPANY INFORMATION 

AND SIGNATURE
Y N Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED
PAGE 17 NOT 

FILLED OUT

SEE 

ATTACHED

SEE 

ATTACHED

PAGE 17 

NOT 

FILLED 

OUT

SEE ATTACHED 

PG 5 & 6

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR 

ALTERNATIVE 

PRICING

SEE 

ATTACHED

SEE 

ATTACHED

SEE 

ATTACHED 

FOR PRICING

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS














































































































































































































































