BID TABULATION - LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

IFB - LIQUID BITUMINOUS
MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE
12-5-17

MISSOURI
PETROLEUM
PRODUCTS CO
LLC

N.B. WEST
CONTRACTING

1620 WOODSON RD
ST. LOUIS MO 63114

2780 MARY AVE
BRENTWOOD MO
63144

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL - DELIVERED COST PER GALLON

MC-30 $3.55 $4.00
MC-3000 $3.40 NO BID
CRS-2 $2.35 NO BID
CRS-2P $2.75 $2.30
SS-1H $2.40 $3.00
HFE-150 $2.50 NO BID
LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL - BULK COST PER GALLON
MC-30 $3.40 $3.75
MC-3000 $3.25 NO BID
CRS-2 $2.20 NO BID
CRS-2P $2.60 $2.15
SS-1H $2.25 $2.75
HFE-150 $2.35 NO BID

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL -

5 GALLON BUCKETS (PER BUCKET)

CRS-2 NO BID NO BID
SS-1H $33.00 $35.00
WILLING TO PROVIDE MONTHLY X X
PRICE ADJUSTMENTS (Y/N):
CAN PRICES BE HELD FOR 1 FULL
MONTH TO
?
YEAR? IF NOT, DATE PRICES MONTH

EXPIRE:
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REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT

COMPLETED Y Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION
Y Y
(YIN):
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR v v
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND v v
SIGNATURE
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A

COMMENTS:




