BID TABULATION - PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018

cortomrion | tecmorogy | THETREEHOUSE | oFFICE SOURCE | OFFICE DEPOT INC
BID TABULATION
PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018
BID OPENING DATE 14697 E EASTER AVE
10-17-17 100 SCHELTER RD PO BOX 413 719RUDDERRD | 6600 NORTH MILITARY
LINCOLNSIRE IL 60069 | o\ ren i v o0 go11p | NORWOOD MA02062 | FENTONMO 63026 | TRAIL BOCA FL 33496
Our Item Item Description Suggested Manuf. Item Quantity Unit Of UNIT COST
Number Manufacturer Number Ordered Measure
e s |
13512 Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M237/AR-M277 Copier, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 0 BOX NO BID $34.06 $18.00 $103.02
13514 Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M350 Copier AG559, 3/Box Sharp AR-5C1 0 BOX NO BID $34.06 $18.00
13555 Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use in RICOH Aficio Ricoh * MXSCXL . BOX NO BID $58.57 $22.00
MP5002
14204 |Toner - Sharp AR270 NT1 also AR310NT Sharp * SHRAR310NT 6 EACH $57.98 $60.01 $56.40 $60.00 $103.32
14205 Toner - Sharp AR450U Sharp * SHRAR450NT 5 EACH $58.51 $47.58 $49.50 $46.00 $73.33
14207 Toner - Sharp ARM255N,355/455 Sharp * AR455NT1 4 EACH $48.76 $53.28 $49.85 $53.00 $73.33
14208  |Toner - RICOH Aficio MP 50022 Copier Ricoh * RIC 841346 2 EACH $56.42 $36.59 $35.30 $40.00
14209  |Toner - Sharp MX-M310 Copier Sharp * SHR MX-312NT 3 EACH $92.23 $68.06 $63.35 $68.00 $103.32
14215  |Toner - Sharp MX-M503N Copier, Black Sharp * SHR-MX500NT 3 EACH $83.00 $60.80 $59.00 $66.00 $107.35
14216 Drum - Sharp MX-M503N Copier Sharp * SHR-MXS00NR 0 EACH NO BID $46.30 $53.00 $42.00
14217 Developer - Sharp MX-M503N Copier Sharp * SHR-MX500NV 0 EACH NO BID $47.56 $51.00 $42.00
14220 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Black Sharp * MX45NTBA 1 EACH $66.68 $55.73 $65.00 $52.00
14221 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Cyan Sharp * MX27NTCA 4 EACH $93.19 $81.35 $75.75 $80.00 $96.66
14222 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Magenta Sharp * MX27NTMA 4 EACH $94.93 $81.35 $75.75 $80.00 $96.66
14223 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Yellow Sharp * MX27NTYA 5 EACH $93.40 $81.35 $75.75 $80.00 $138.69
14224  |Waste Toner Cartridge - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier Sharp * SHRMX270HB 1 EACH $22.73 $21.29 $20.00 $18.00
14230 Toner - Sharp MXM364N Copier, Black Sharp * SHRARMXS60NT 5 EACH NO BID $64.43 $59.95 $65.00
14231 Waste Toner - Sharp MXM364N Copier HP * SHRARMX560HB 0 EACH NO BID $27.47 $26.00 $22.00
14601 Toner - Toshiba E-studio 555/655 Toshiba * T8550 2 EACH $88.22 $71.09 $66.20 $65.00
14603 Toner - Toshiba E-studio 523/523T/603 Toshiba * T7200 0 EACH $82.68 $61.87 $64.70 $65.00
14800  |Toner - Minolta Bizhub 222 Minolta * MLNTN211 1 EACH $48.53 $25.92 $45.00 $36.00 $120.51
15104 Laser Toner - HP 12A, Black HP * HEWQ2612A 0 EACH $68.93 $54.04 $62.00 $50.00 $62.96
15107 Laser Toner - HP 38A, Black HP * HEWQ1338A 3 EACH $160.93 $142.61 $137.00 $135.00 $152.02
15109 Laser Toner - HP 27X, Black HP * HEWC4127X 1 EACH NO BID $26.08 $125.00 $158.31
15119 |Laser Toner - HP 96A, Black HP * HEWC4096A 0 EACH NO BID $19.76 $80.00 $124.48
15120 Laser Toner - HP 61X, Black HP * HEWC8061X 4 EACH $161.15 $136.15 $130.00 $120.00 $145.12
15121  |Laser Toner - HP 15A, Black HP * HEWC7115A 0 EACH $80.74 $65.12 $62.00 $48.00 $69.41
15135 Laser Toner - HP 641A, Black HP * HEWC9720A 2 EACH $197.62 $154.15 $158.00 $148.00 $176.09
15136 Laser Toner - HP 641A, Cyan HP * HEWC9721A 2 EACH $262.09 $207.25 $199.00 $190.00 $238.58
15137 Laser Toner - HP 641A, Yellow HP* HEWC9722A 2 EACH $262.09 $207.25 $199.00 $190.00 $238.58
15138 Laser Toner - HP 641A, Magenta HP * HEWC9723A 2 EACH $262.09 $207.25 $199.00 $190.00 $238.58
15144 |Laser Toner - HP 10A, Black HP * HEWQ2610A 0 EACH $145.16 $124.84 $134.00 $110.00 $137.12
15147 Laser Toner - HP 42X, Black HP * HEWQ5942X 13 EACH $231.17 $183.57 $199.00 $195.00 $223.07
15149 Laser Toner - HP 51A, Black HP* HEWQ7551A 2 EACH $123.41 $106.12 $103.00 $180.00 $116.56
15158  |Laser Toner - LEXMARK T650 Printer, Black Lexmark* LEXT650A11A 0 EACH $148.95 $148.84 $138.00 $120.00 $157.89
15161 Laser Toner - HP 78A, Black HP * HEWCE278A 24 EACH $69.38 $59.46 $56.00 $55.00 $63.37
15165 Laser Toner - HP 90A, Black HP * HEWCE390A 47 EACH $147.27 $121.78 $124.00 $128.00 $139.12
15166  |Laser Toner - HP 647A, Black HP * HEWCE260A 2 EACH $134.74 $120.65 $114.00 $115.00 $128.60
15167 Laser Toner - HP 648A, Cyan HP * HEWCE261A 0 EACH $256.04 $202.26 $229.00 $215.00 $233.09
15168  |Laser Toner - HP 648A, Yellow HP * HEWCE262A 0 EACH $256.04 $202.26 $229.00 $215.00 $233.09
15169 Laser Toner - HP 648A, Magenta HP * HEWCE263A 2 EACH $256.04 $202.26 $229.00 $215.00 $233.09
15179 |Laser Toner - HP 49X, Black HP * HEWQ5949X 0 EACH $165.87 $122.55 $147.00 $119.00 $148.93
15180 Laser Toner - HP 501A, Black HP * HEWQ6470A 4 EACH $137.07 $122.74 $116.00 $118.00 $130.84
15184 |Laser Toner - HP 502A, Cyan HP * HEWQ6471A 2 EACH $146.31 $113.26 $107.50 $110.00 $149.35
15185  |Laser Toner - HP 502A, Yellow HP * HEWQ6472A 1 EACH $146.31 $113.26 $107.50 $100.00 $149.35
15186 Laser Toner - HP 502A, Magenta HP* HEWQ6473A 1 EACH $138.03 $113.26 $107.50 $110.00 $149.35
15188  |Laser Toner - HP 36A, Black HP * HEWCBA436A 4 EACH $70.26 $59.07 $54.00 $55.00 $62.96
15190  |Laser Toner - HP 64A, Black HP * HEWCC364A 16 EACH $147.33 $126.70 $124.00 $125.00 $139.17
15191 |Laser Toner - HP 85A, Black HP * HEWCE285A 3 EACH $60.58 $51.92 $48.00 $48.00 $55.34
15193 |Laser Toner - HP 504A, Black HP * HEWCE250A 9 EACH $115.49 $99.32 $107.00 $108.00 $109.09




BID TABULATION - PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018

BID TABULATION
PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018

BID OPENING DATE

10-17-17

QuILL BEYOND THE TREE HOUSE
cormomarion | TEcmoLoGY e OFFICE SOURCE | OFFICE DEPOT INC
100 SCHELTER RD 14697 E EASTER AVE PO BOX 413 719 RUDDER RD 6600 NORTH MILITARY

LINCOLNSIRE IL 60069

CENTENNIAL CO 80112

NORWOOD MA 02062

FENTON MO 63026

TRAIL BOCA FL 33496

15194  |Laser Toner - HP 504A, Cyan HP * HEWCE251A 3 EACH $235.29 $195.01 $196.00 $199.00 $214.20
15195 Laser Toner - HP 504A, Magenta HP * HEWCE253A 6 EACH $235.29 $195.01 $196.00 $199.00 $214.20
15196  |Laser Toner - HP 504A, Yellow HP * HEWCE252A 5 EACH $235.01 $195.01 $196.00 $199.00 $214.20
15197 Laser Toner - HP 55A, Black HP* HEWCE255A 13 EACH $125.02 $107.51 $104.00 $108.00 $118.09
15210 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black Ricoh * RIC820000 2 EACH NO BID $47.73 $46.90 $52.00

15211 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Yellow Ricoh * RIC820008 2 EACH NO BID $133.86 $130.40 $170.00 $132.47
15212 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Magenta Ricoh * RIC820016 2 EACH NO BID $133.86 $130.40 $170.00 $132.47
15213 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Cyan Ricoh * RIC820024 2 EACH NO BID $133.86 $130.40 $170.00 $215.22
15214  |-aser Drum Unit- Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black Drum Ricoh * RIC402714 1 EACH NO BID $172.57 $171.10 $144.00 $130.14

Unit Photo Conductor
15215 Las.er Drum Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Color Drum Ricoh * RICA02715 . EACH NO BID $480.54 $464.00 $434.00
Unit Photo Conductor

15216 Laser Transfer Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer Ricoh * RIC402717 1 EACH NO BID $216.98 $208.00 $197.00 $178.45
15217 Fuser Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer Ricoh * RIC402718 0 EACH NO BID $326.18 $294.80 $250.00 $285.29
15218 Waste Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Ricoh * RIC402716 1 EACH NO BID $19.18 $17.40 $15.00 $12.16
15220 Laser Toner - HP 126A, Black HP * HEWCE310A 1 EACH $48.39 $35.95 $41.00 $38.00 $41.42
15221 Laser Toner - HP 126A, Cyan HP * HEWCE311A 0 EACH $53.81 $39.98 $45.50 $44.00 $46.07
15222 Laser Toner - HP 126A, Yellow HP * HEWCE312A 0 EACH $83.81 $39.98 $45.50 $44.00 $46.07
15223 Laser Toner - HP 126A, Magenta HP * HEWCE313A 0 EACH $53.81 $39.98 $45.50 $44.00 $46.07
15230  |Laser Toner - HP 650A, Black HP * HEWCE270A 2 EACH $218.70 $170.85 $197.00 $195.00 $199.08
15231 Laser Toner - HP 650A, Cyan HP * HEWCE271A 1 EACH $355.88 $281.13 $320.00 $329.00 $323.98
15232 Laser Toner - HP 650A, Yellow HP* HEWCE272A 1 EACH $355.88 $281.13 $320.00 $329.00 $323.98
15233 Laser Toner - HP 650A, Magenta HP* HEWCE273A 1 EACH $355.87 $281.13 $320.00 $329.00 $323.98
15250 Laser Toner - HP 410X, Black HP* HEWCF410X 16 EACH $121.45 $94.63 $113.00 $114.00 $115.00
15251 Laser Toner - HP 410X, Cyan HP* HEWCF411X 13 EACH $172.77 $126.69 $152.00 $158.00 $153.95
15252 Laser Toner - HP 410X, Yellow HP* HEWCF412X 15 EACH $172.77 $126.69 $152.00 $158.00 $153.95
15253 Laser Toner - HP 410X, Magenta HP * HEWCF413X 14 EACH $172.77 $126.69 $152.00 $158.00 $153.95
15260 Laser Toner - HP 201X, Black HP * HEWCF400X 0 EACH $86.28 $60.55 $72.00 $72.00 $73.58
15261  |Laser Toner - HP 201X, Cyan HP * HEWCF401X 0 EACH $94.70 $67.15 $81.00 $82.00 $81.62
15262 |Laser Toner - HP 201X, Yellow HP * HEWCF402X 0 EACH $94.70 $67.15 $81.00 $82.00 $81.62
15263 Laser Toner - HP 201X, Magenta HP* HEWCF403X 0 EACH $94.70 $67.15 $81.00 $82.00 $81.62
15265  |Laser Toner - HP 87X, Black HP * HEWCF287X 0 EACH $260.79 $193.33 $234.00 $240.00 $234.95
15266 Laser Toner - HP 26X, Black HP* HEWCF266X 0 EACH $165.97 $130.75 $157.00 $162.00 $158.89
15270 Laser Toner - HP508X, Black HP* HEWCF360X 0 EACH $192.85 $142.96 $172.00 $175.00 $173.73
15271 Laser Toner - HP508X, Cyan HP * HEWCF361X 0 EACH $264.20 $197.92 $236.00 $230.00 $240.51
15272 |Laser Toner - HP508X, Yellow HP * HEWCF362X 0 EACH $264.18 $197.92 $236.00 $230.00 $240.51
15273 Laser Toner - HPS08X, Magenta HP * HEWCF363X 0 EACH $264.18 $197.92 $236.00 $230.00 $240.51
15305  |Laser Toner - HP 125A, Black HP * HEWCB540A 0 EACH $71.09 $52.39 $63.00 $55.00 $63.67
15306  |Laser Toner - HP 125A, Cyan HP * HEWCB541A 0 EACH $65.33 $48.15 $57.00 $55.00 $58.52
15307 Laser Toner - HP 125A, Magenta HP* HEWCB543A 0 EACH $65.33 $48.15 $57.00 $55.00 $58.52
15308 Laser Toner - HP 125A, Yellow HP * HEWCB542A 0 EACH $65.33 $48.15 $57.00 $55.00 $58.52
15309 |Laser Toner - HP 35A, Black HP * HEWCBA435A 3 EACH $60.60 $49.88 $49.00 $50.00 $54.78
15311 Laser Toner - HP 05A, Black HP * HEWCES05A 14 EACH $78.38 $62.67 $62.00 $64.00 $71.59
15312 |Laser Toner - HP 29X, Black HP * HEWC4129X 0 EACH $208.80 $153.11 $183.00 $130.00 $186.07
15313 Laser Toner - HP 304A, Black HP * HEWCC530A 6 EACH $107.93 $93.46 $87.00 $94.00 $99.62
15314 |Laser Toner - HP 304A, Cyan HP * HEWCC531A 4 EACH $113.09 $93.82 $87.00 $92.00 $98.19
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15315 Laser Toner - HP 304A, Magenta HP * HEWCC533A 5 EACH $106.38 $93.82 $87.00 $92.00 $98.19
15316 Laser Toner - HP 304A, Yellow HP * HEWCC532A 3 EACH $106.38 $93.82 $87.00 $92.00 $98.19
15317 Laser Toner - HP 45A, Black HP * HEWQS5945A 0 EACH $212.58 $176.21 $198.00 $165.00 $201.27
15318 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CDN, Black Canon * CNMCRTDG118BK 23 EACH $104.61 $103.92 $99.95 $108.00 $105.35
15319 :j:;::’a”er - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CDN, Canon * CNMCRTDG118MA 14 EACH $100.70 $105.86 $99.00 $103.00 $98.58
15320  |Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CDN, Yellow Canon * CNMCRTDG118YW 14 EACH $100.70 $105.86 $99.00 $103.00 $98.58
15321 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CDN, Cyan Canon * CNMCRTDG118CY 17 EACH $100.70 $105.86 $99.00 $103.00 $98.58
15335 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Black Okidata * 44315304 4 EACH $81.92 $83.18 $77.10 $72.00 $85.83
15336  |Laser Toner - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * 44315303 3 EACH $150.55 $166.77 $154.90 $152.00 $172.67
15337 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * 44315302 2 EACH $150.55 $166.77 $154.90 $152.00 $172.58
15338 |Laser Toner - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * 44315301 2 EACH $150.55 $166.77 $154.90 $152.00 $172.58
15339 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Black Okidata * 44315104 2 EACH $68.18 $64.37 $59.80 $59.00 $67.11
15340 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * 44315103 2 EACH $68.18 $68.62 $63.90 $59.00 $71.88
15341 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * 44315102 1 EACH $68.18 $68.62 $63.90 $59.00 $71.88
15342 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * 44315101 1 EACH $68.18 $68.62 $63.90 $59.00 $71.88
15343 Laser Toner - Okidata MB280 Okidata * 56123401 0 EACH NO BID $127.74 $119.40 $84.00 $137.19
15350 Laser Toner - HP 305X, Black HP * HEWCE410X 16 EACH $84.22 $78.03 $74.00 $76.00 $83.16
15351 Laser Toner - HP 305A, Cyan HP * HEWCE411A 15 EACH $94.42 $92.16 $87.00 $86.00 $96.46
15352 Laser Toner - HP 305A, Yellow HP * HEWCE412A 15 EACH $94.42 $92.16 $87.00 $86.00 $96.46
15353 Laser Toner - HP 305A, Magenta HP * HEWCE413A 16 EACH $94.42 $92.16 $87.00 $86.00 $96.46
15354 Laser Toner - HP 83X, Black HP * HEWCF283X 9 EACH $70.40 $52.92 $63.50 $64.00 $80.67
15355 Laser Toner - HP 80X, Black HP* HEWCF280X 36 EACH $137.89 $124.89 $127.00 $128.00 $163.42
15356 Laser Toner - HP 507X, Black HP* HEWCE400X 7 EACH $169.05 $132.78 $159.00 $155.00 $184.84
15357 Laser Toner - HP 507A, Cyan HP* HEWCE401A 5 EACH $187.21 $147.04 $177.00 $169.00 $204.68
15358 Laser Toner - HP 507A, Yellow HP* HEWCE402A 6 EACH $187.21 $147.04 $177.00 $169.00 $214.42
15359 Laser Toner - HP 507A, Magenta HP * HEWCE403A 5 EACH $187.21 $147.04 $177.00 $169.00 $214.42
15370 Laser Toner - HP 312A, Black HP * HEWCF380A 0 EACH $85.74 $60.79 $73.00 $74.00 $84.63
15371 Laser Toner - HP 312A, Cyan HP* HEWCF381A 0 EACH $112.33 $81.40 $97.00 $94.00 $113.31
15372 Laser Toner - HP 312A, Yellow HP * HEWCF382A 0 EACH $112.33 $81.40 $97.00 $94.00 $113.31
15373 Laser Toner - HP 312A, Magenta HP * HEWCF383A 0 EACH $112.33 $81.40 $97.00 $94.00 $113.31
15380 Maintenance Kit - HP LaserJet 4200 Series HP * HEWQ2429A 0 EACH $273.78 $206.86 $197.00 $230.00 $229.57
15381 Maintenance Kit - HP LaserJet 4250 Series HP * HEWQ5421A 3 EACH $195.88 $248.82 $235.00 $230.00 $251.31
15430 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 20, Black HP* HEWC6614D 1 EACH NO BID NO BID $28.00 $34.11
15432 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 56, Black HP * HEWC6656AN 1 EACH $29.69 $24.11 $20.00 $19.00 $28.29
15433 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 57, Tri-Color HP * HEWC6657AN 0 EACH $46.84 $40.02 $39.00 $24.00 $37.91
15440  |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 950XL, Black HP * HEWCNO45AN 59 EACH $35.68 $27.07 $31.00 $30.00 $29.58
15441 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Cyan HP * HEWCNO46AN 34 EACH $28.29 $20.76 $24.00 $21.99 $22.68
15442 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Magenta HP * HEWCNO47AN 31 EACH $28.29 $20.76 $24.00 $21.99 $22.68
15443 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Yellow HP * HEWCNO48AN 35 EACH $28.29 $20.76 $24.00 $21.99 $22.68
15451 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Black HP* HEWC1Q12A 0 EACH $143.54 $131.15 $123.90 $119.00 $56.10
15452 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Cyan HP * HEWB3P19A 0 EACH $133.38 $60.91 $57.55 $55.00 $56.10
15453 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Magenta HP* HEWB3P20A 0 EACH $133.38 $60.91 $57.55 $55.00 $56.10
15454 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Yellow HP * HEWB3P21A 0 EACH $133.38 $60.91 $57.55 $55.00 $56.10
15455 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Photo Black HP * HEWB3P23A 0 EACH $133.38 $60.91 $57.55 $55.00 $56.10
15456 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Grey HP * HEWB3P24A 0 EACH $133.38 $60.91 $57.55 $55.00 $56.10
15468 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Cyan HP* HEWC4911A 0 EACH $41.95 $39.24 $37.10 $30.00 $33.24
15469 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Magenta HP * HEWC4912A 0 EACH $41.95 $39.24 $37.10 $30.00 $33.24
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15470  |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Yellow HP * HEWC4913A 0 EACH $41.95 $39.24 $37.10 $30.00 $33.24
15475 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 97, Tri-Color HP* HEWC9363WN 51 EACH $46.00 $38.36 $36.00 $31.99 $37.24
15477 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 96, Black HP * HEWC8767WN 76 EACH $46.60 $34.36 $30.00 $26.99 $32.86
15482 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 21, Black HP * HEWC9351AN 0 EACH $17.55 $12.36 $13.00 $13.00 $13.64
15515 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 970, Black HP* HEWCN621AM 2 EACH $63.32 $52.28 $56.50 $60.00 $63.09
15516 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Cyan HP * HEWCN622AM 2 EACH $66.72 $54.52 $58.00 $60.00 $65.80
15517 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Magenta HP* HEWCN623AM 2 EACH $66.02 $54.52 $58.00 $60.00 $65.80
15518 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Yellow HP * HEWCN624AM 2 EACH $66.02 $54.52 $58.00 $60.00 $65.80
15532 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Black HP* HEWF6U19AN 7 EACH $37.19 $28.42 $32.50 $36.00 $24.59
15533 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Cyan HP * HEWLOS61AN 5 EACH $28.05 $21.43 $24.80 $26.99 $18.74
15534 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Magenta HP * HEWC0S64AN 5 EACH $28.05 $21.43 $24.80 $26.99 $18.74
15535 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Yellow HP* HEWLOS67AN 5 EACH $28.05 $21.43 $24.80 $26.99 $18.74
15536 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 63XL, Black HP * HEWF6UG4AN 4 EACH $33.35 $23.02 $26.90 $27.50 $25.16
15537 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 63XL, Tri-Color HP* HEWF6U63AN 4 EACH $35.64 $24.12 $28.00 $28.50 $26.36
15538 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 62XL, Black HP * HEWC2PO5AN 0 EACH $35.09 $25.71 $29.90 $28.00 $33.43
15539 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 62, Tri-Color HP* HEWC2PO6AN 4 EACH $19.25 $13.82 $15.50 $16.99 $17.18
15540 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 934XL, Black HP * HEWC2P23AN 15 EACH $30.47 $22.33 $25.70 $26.99 $29.03
15541 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Cyan HP* HEWC2P24AN 3 EACH $20.38 $14.06 $15.90 $14.99 $18.28
15542 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Magenta HP * HEWC2P25AN 3 EACH $20.38 $14.06 $15.90 $14.99 $18.28
15543 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Yellow HP* HEWC2P26AN 6 EACH $20.38 $14.06 $15.90 $14.99 $18.28
15545 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Black Epson * EPST711XXL120 2 EACH NO BID $52.13 $45.00 $35.32
15546 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Cyan EPSON * EPST711XXL220 0 EACH NO BID $58.03 $45.00 $17.65
15547 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Magenta EPSON * EPST711XXL320 0 EACH NO BID $58.03 $45.00 $17.65
15548 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Yellow EPSON * EPST711XXL420 0 EACH $62.55 $58.03 $45.00 $17.65
15550 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Black Epson * EPST159120 2 EACH $19.51 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $16.80
15551 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Cyan Epson * EPST159220 2 EACH $19.07 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $16.80
15552 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Magenta Epson * EPST159320 2 EACH $19.48 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $16.80
15553 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Yellow Epson * EPST159420 2 EACH $19.67 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $21.77
15554 |Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Red Epson * EPST159720 2 EACH $19.82 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $21.77
15555 g}:‘;‘ Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Matte Epson * EPST159820 2 EACH $19.61 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $16.80
15556 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Orange Epson * EPST159920 2 EACH $19.69 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $16.80
15557 g‘gie;iczae'r"idge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Gloss Epson * EPST159020 2 EACH $19.86 $22.90 $21.90 $18.00 $23.74
15590 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 950, Black HP* HEWCNO49AN 3 EACH $25.69 $18.64 $21.20 $19.00 $20.36
15591 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Cyan HP * HEWCNO50AN 1 EACH $18.91 $13.44 $15.00 $14.00 $14.70
15592 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Magenta HP * HEWCNO51AN 0 EACH $18.91 $13.44 $15.00 $14.00 $14.70
15593 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Yellow HP * HEWCNO52AN 1 EACH $18.91 $13.44 $15.00 $14.00 $14.70
15595 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Black HP * HEWC6602A 15 EACH $14.63 $13.03 $12.85 $11.79 $13.41
15596 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Blue HP * HEWC6602B 0 EACH $17.78 $13.03 $12.85 $13.49 $19.79
15597 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Green HP* HEWC6602G 0 EACH NO BID NO BID $13.49 $13.41
15598 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Red HP* HEWC6602R 0 EACH $15.59 $13.03 $12.85 $13.49 $13.41
16101 Fax Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840, High Yield Brother * BRTTN450 6 EACH $43.81 $49.76 $46.10 $44.00 $42.20
16102 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840 Brother * BRTDR420 1 EACH $64.20 $76.63 $70.95 $69.00 $64.68
16104 iaz);ga;;%geu%o;ge;(;2::3.?/'.?bbon Cartridge PFC1170, Brother * BRTPC201 3 EACH $23.56 $24.17 $22.45 $18.99 $21.99
16110  |Fax Cartridge - Brother DCP 7020, MFC-7220 Brother * BRTTN350 0 EACH $55.69 $62.62 $58.00 $38.00 $51.74




BID TABULATION - PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018

BID TABULATION

PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2018

BID OPENING DATE

10-17-17

QuILL BEYOND THE TREE HOUSE
corpomation | TECINOLOGY R OFFICE SOURCE | OFFICE DEPOT INC
100 SCHELTER RD 14697 E EASTER AVE PO BOX 413 719 RUDDER RD 6600 NORTH MILITARY

LINCOLNSIRE IL 60069

CENTENNIAL CO 80112

NORWOOD MA 02062

FENTON MO 63026

TRAIL BOCA FL 33496

16116 Fax Cartridge - Brother TN540 Brother * BRTTN540 EACH $63.39 $72.13 $66.80 $48.00 $60.68
16195 |12 Toner Cartridge - Brother 4100E/4750E/5750€, 3,000 Brother * BRTTN430 EACH $49.98 $56.89 $52.70 $45.00 $47.13
Fax Cartridge - For use with Brother DCP-7030, DCP-7040, HL-
16126 |2140, HL-2170W, MFC-7340, MFC-7345N, MFC-7440N, MFC- Brother * BRTTNG60 EACH $43.81 $49.76 $46.10 $45.00 $42.20
7840W, Black
Multi-Function Machine Toner - DCP-7030, DCP-7040, HL-
17000 2140, HL-2170W, MFC-7340, MFC-7345N, MFC-7440N, MFC- Brother* BRTTN330 EACH $37.11 $41.72 $38.70 $31.99 $35.42
7840W
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS
ADDENDUM INCLUDED: Y N N Y N
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED: Y Y Y Y Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (Y/N): Y N Y N N
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED: Y N Y Y N
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY: Y N Y Y N
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N): Y Y Y Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE: Y N Y Y Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED: N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED




Request for
Proposal:

ORIGINAL INVITATION FOR BID NOTICE ISSUED:

PRINTER-COPIER-FAX SUPPLIES 2018

JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

ADDENDUM #1:

Addendum

Date Issued:
SEPTEMBER 13, 2017

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, OCTOBER 17,2017 AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitiation for Bid

MICHELLE SAUER

Department of Administrative Services
636-797-6249

msauer@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

CONTACT NUMBER

729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100
SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed
upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the
same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with
the written consent of the successful bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized

unless approved in writing by the County.
Rommt Viopngr

QUILL CORPORATION
AWrinr)

Company Name
| Signature

(0O scHeLTER RD.
\0A)017

Address

Livocor s RE T L0V

City/State/Zip Code

K00 -bL24 -4 904

Title

3b-2952904

Telephone # Date Tax ID #
i .CO K00-1§9-801 b
E-mail Fax #

Bidder's Initals

10f3

9-26-2017




ADDENDUM #1:

THE INVITATION FOR BID FOR PRINTER-COPIER-FAX SUPPLIES 2018 BID
SPECIFICATIONS HAS BEEN REVISED.

Addendum 1

Bidder shall initial all pages and return where the Bid Document denotes“BIDDER’S INITIALS: e

This document should be submitted with the original bid/proposal.

Jefferson County MO has an HP Supplies Big Deal to support this bid.
Please contact Jamalyn.Ackley@hp.com with your HP Loc ID and she will get
you added to the bid deal.

Jamalyn Ackley

Public Sector Account Manager
Supplies

CO, NE, MO, KS, AR, OK, WY
Jamalyn.Ackley(@hp.com

M (303) 570-1745

Parker, Colorado

Invitiation for Bid 20f3 Bidder's rnitalgg



In Witness thereof, the payrties hereto have executed this Agreement, in triplicate, as
of this "l day of _ (J(A0D0N 2017:

QUILL CORPORATION County of Jefferson, State of Missouri
Company Name

Signature' Kenneth B. Waller County Executive

Rov Mooymeter

Print

Company Address:
|00 SCHELTER RO

[iNcoLnsHiee T (69
Phone: &D"C}5 L(" L% goq

I hereby certify under section 50.660 RSMo., there is either: (1) a balance of funds, otherwise
unencumbered, to the credit of the appropriation to which the obligation contained herein is chargeable,
and.a cash balance otherwise unencumbered, in the treasury, to the credit of the funds from which
payment is to be made, each sufficient to meet the obligation contained herein; or (2) bonds or taxes
have been authorized by vote of the people and there is a sufficient unencumbered amount of the bonds
yet to be sold or of the taxes levied and yet to be collected to meet the obligation in case there is not a
sufficient unencumbered cash balance in the treasury.

County Auditor

APPROVED AS TO FORM

County Counselor

Invitiation for Bid 30f3 Bidder's Initals S]



JEFFERSON COUNTY

: . DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
@) 729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

’*ﬁﬂ_‘% / HILLSBORO MO 63050

N WWWJEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES
2018

Date Issued:

BID #: 17-0075

9-13-2017

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: FUESDAY, OCTOBER 17, 2017, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitiation for Bid

MICHELLE SAUER

Department of Administrative Services
636-797-6249

msauer(jeftcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Depariment of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

FENDOR NAME
VENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE 5T/PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certities that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted. will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successtul Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing
Company Name

by the County.
(00 SCHELTER. @D, //2

Tﬁ\ddr_gss / Signmre

L eoLnStiee, TL bookd

City/State/Zip Code : Title

LD 6340 WRINT  2e-2952904
elephone ate ax ID #
Fbi_l&@ql/ui ll.comn ¥00-7§9. 201 G
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Office pEpoT OfficeMax

Trish Holland
Business Development Manager _
Public Sector - lllinois and Wisconsin

Office pEPOT

Offi o 800 W. Bryn Mawr Avenue
S B ltasca, IL 60143

. ey Of'bus}néss T+ 773.909.0715
- " patricia.holland@officedepot.com

October 17, 2017

Vickie Pratt

Department of the County Clerk
729 Maple Street / PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO 63050-0100

Dear Vickie,

Thank you for affording Office Depot the opportunity to provide Jefferson County with the following
proposal for Printer, Copier, and Fax Supplies. We want you to have a clear understanding of our
capabilities and are confident that you will find Office Depot to be the best in the industry.

We are prepared to dedicate the appropriate resources and experience to fully accommodate your
program requirements. As one of the most recognized distributors in the office products industry
Office Depot will use the many advantages of our national distribution system, our expertise in'
electronic commerce, and our industry leading approach to managing decentralized program
environments, to ensure that you receive the outstanding service you expect, and the program
consistency that you require.

For over 30 years, Office Depot has strived to provide our customers with the very best in office
products, solutions, and services. Knowledge paired with Support has emerged as a key
commitment for Office Depot in order to develop loyalty and affinity among both our customers ang
employees, making Office Depot the preferred place to shop.

Office Depot is committed to quality and to your satisfaction as our valued customer. We look
forward to building a strong partnership with Jefferson County and are excited to play a role in your

future endeavors and successes. Please contact me directly should you have any questions or
concerns.

Sincerely,

The Office Depot Team

Office Depot's response is contingent upon Jefferson County’s acceptance of the pricing, ang terms
and conditions as set forth in the State of Missouri Master Agreement, Contract # C115144002.

Office Depot, Inc. | 6600 North Military Trail, Boca Raton, FL 33496 | 561.438.4800

You take care of business. We take care of you.



Bid Response

Price Sheets

Certificate of Insurance

State of Missouri contract,
C115144002

Office Depot and NASPO |
Contract







JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63030
WWW.ICFECOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: PRINTER -~ COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES

BID #: 17-0075

Date Issued: 9-13-2017

2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, OCTOBER 17, 2017, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COLNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

MICHELLE SAUER

Department of Administrative Services
636-797-6249

msauer(jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

FENDOR N 1ME

I ENDOR ADDRESS

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

CONTACT NUVBER

SEALED BID (BID N 1VIE)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement'contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified.  This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval ol the County Council and County
Executive, Prices are firm during this agreement term, uniess agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to rencw this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successlul Bidder. Price increases for rencwals are not authorized unless approved in writing
by the County.

Susan Cummings
Autharized Agent (Print)

Sy e
/

Office Depot, Inc
Company Name

6600 North Military Trail

Address “Signature
Boca Rataon, FL 33496 Vice President
City/State/Zip Cade Title
561-438-4800 59-2663954
Telephone # Date Tax ID #

800-593-8830
Fax #

odpbsd1@officedepot.com
E-mail

Office Depot's response is contingent upon Jefferson County's acceptance of the pricing, and terms and conditions as set forth in the

State of Missouri Master Agreement.

Invitiation for Bid

10f26 Bidder's Initals O
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Off * 0ff° M o PROPOSED SPEND
lce DE POT lce ax CORE SPEND | $ 78,457.40

JEFFERSON COUNTY PRICING

Rep Name:

Contact Number:

PROPOSED
REF | CUSTOMER ITEM DESCRIPTION UoM Pk Qty VOLUME |OFFICE DEPOT SKU DESCRIPTION UoM Pk Qty PRICE CONVERTED PRICE | EXTENDED | ITEM ON
NUMBER SKU SPEND STATE OF
MO CORE

1 ARSCL pr Staples- Sharp AR-M237/AR-M277 Copier, ] BOX 3 233203 STAPLES,PRNTR,LEX X850,852,854 EA 3 S 103.02 | § 103.02 Y
2 ARSCL ier Staples- Sharp AR-M350 Copier AG559, 3 BOX 3 N/A 5 s N
3 MXSCXL Bples- Staple Cartridge for use in RICOH Aficig BOX 45 1 N/A S & N
4 SHRAR310NT Toner- Sharp AR270 NTI also AR310NT EACH 1 6 648002 TONER,AR275/235/M277,BK EA 1 S 103.32 | 8 103.32 | S 619.92 |Y
5 SHRAR4SONT Toner - Sharp AR450U EACH 1 5 455217 TONER,ARM355/455,35K YLD EA 1 73.33 |3 73.33 366.65 |Y
6 AR455NT1 Toner- Sharp ARM255N,355/455 EACH 1 4 455217 TONER,ARM355/455,35K YLD EA 1 S 7333 |5 73.33 293.32 |Y
7 RIC841346 Toner- RICOH Aficio MP 50022 Copier EACH 1 2 N/A 5 = N
8 SHRMX312NT Toner- Sharp MX-M310 Copier EACH 1 3 269513 CRTDG,LSR,260,310,BK,25K EA 1 S 103.32 | S 103.32 | 8 308.96 |Y
9 SHRMXSOONT Toner- Sharp MX-M503N Copier, Black EACH 1 3 146077 TONER,MX283,363,BK EA 1 S 107.35 | S 107.35 | S 322.05 |N
10 SHRMXSOONR Drum - Sharp MX-M503N Copier EACH 1 N/A S = N
11 SHRMXSOONV Developer- Sharp MX-M503N Copier EACH 1 N/A 5 r N
12 MX45NTBA Toner- Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Black EACH 1 1 N/A 5 = N
13 MX27NTCA Toner- Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier,Cyan EACH 1 4 7822595 TONER,SHARP,CYAN EA 1 S 96.66 | $ 96.66 | S 386.64 |Y
14 MX27NTMA pner- Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Magen EACH 1 4 782285 TONER,SHARP,MAGENTA EA 1 96.66 | $ 96.66 386.64 |Y
15 MX27NTYA Foner- Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Yellow EACH 1 5 782305 TONER,SHARP,YELLOW EA 1 S 138.69 | $ 138.69 693.45 |N
16 SHRMX270HB  |te Toner Cartridge- Sharp MX 3501N Color Cd EACH 1 1 N/A 5 3 N
17 SHRARMXS560NT Toner- Sharp MXM364N Copier, Black EACH 1 5 N/A S - N
18 | SHRARMX560HB Waste Toner- Sharp MXM364N Copier EACH 1 N/A S - N
19 T8550 Toner- Toshiba E-studio 555/655 EACH T 2 N/A S - N
20 17200 Toner- Toshiba E-studio 523/523T/603 EACH 1 N/A 9 3 N
21 MLNTN211 Toner- Minolta Bizhub 222 EACH il 1 194155 KONICA MINOLTA TN211 - TONER C EA I S 12051 | S 120.51 | $ 120.51 |y
22 HEWQ2612A Laser Toner - HP 12A, Black EACH 2000 154414 CARTRIDGE,LASER,Q2612A EA 2000 ) 62.96 | $ 62.96 Y
23 HEWQ1338A Laser Toner- HP 38A,Black EACH 12000 3 616906 CARTRIDGE,HP LASERIET 4200 EA 12000 (5§ 152.02 | $ 152.02 | § 456.06 |Y
24 HEWC4127X Laser Toner - HP 27X,Black EACH 10000 1 286934 TONER,ULTRA PRECISE,27X% EA 10000 | S 158.31 | § 158.31 158.31 [Y
25 HEWC4096A Laser Toner - HP 96A,Black EACH 5000 808256 TONER,U 2100 SERIES,96A EA 5000 S 124.48 | S 124.48 Y
26 HEWC8061X Laser Toner- HP 61X, Black EACH 10000 4 727351 CARTRIDGE,PRINT SMRT,C8061X,HP EA 10000 |S 145.12 | S 145,12 [ §  580.48 |Y
27 HEWC7115A Laser Toner - HP 15A, Black EACH 2500 727381 CARTRIDGE,PRINT,C7115A,HP EA 2500 S 69.41 | S 69.41 Y
28 HEWC9720A Laser Toner - HP 641A, Black EACH 9000 2 319275 CARTRIDGE,LASERIET 4600,BLACK EA 9000 S 176.09 | § 176.09 352.18 |Y
29 HEWC9721A Laser Toner - HP 641A, Cyan EACH 8000 2 319055 CARTRIDGE,LASERJET 4600,CYAN EA 8000 S 238.58 | § 238.58 477.16 |Y




30 HEWC9722A Laser Toner- HP 641A, Yellow EACH 8000 2 319209 CARTRIDGE,LASERJET 4600,YELLOW EA 8000 S 238.58 | S 238.58 | $ 477.16 |Y
31 HEWC9723A Laser Toner - HP 641A, Magenta EACH 8000 2 319099 CARTRIDGE,LSRJET 4600, MAGENTA EA 8000 S 238.58 | S 238.58 | § 477.16 |Y
32 HEWQ2610A La ser Toner- HP OA, Black EACH 6000 432847 TONER,10A,SMART PRINT EA 6000 S 137.12| $ 137.12 Y
33 HEWQS942X Laser Toner- HP 42X, Black EACH 20000 13 975384 CARTRIDGE,LASER,HP Q5942X EA 20000 | S 223.07 | S 223.07 | $ 2,899.91 |v
34 HEWQ7551A Laser Toner - HP 51A,Black EACH 6500 2 114756 TONER,HP 51A, LASERJET,BLACK EA 6500 S 116.56 | $ 116.56 | $ 233.12 |Y
35 LEXT650A11A Laser Toner- LEXMARK T650 Printer, Black EACH i 355847 CRTDG,RETURN,BK EA 1 S 157.89 | 157.89 Y
36 HEWCE278A Laser Toner - HP 78A,Black EACH 2100 24 231822 TONER,U CE278A,HP,BLACK EA 2100 $ 63379 63.37|$ 1,520.88 |Y
37 HEWCE390A Laser Toner - HP 90A, Black EACH 10000 47 646557 TONER,LASERJET,HP90A,BLACK EA 10000 |$ 139.12 | $ 139.12 | S 6,538.64 |Y
38 HEWCE260A Laser Toner- HP 647A, Black EACH 8500 2 487404 TONER,HP,CE260A,BLACK EA 8500 S 128.60 | 128.60 | $ 257.20 |Y
39 HEWCE261A Laser Toner - HP 648A, Cyan EACH 11000 487764 TONER,HP,CE261A,CYAN EA 11000 (S 233.09 | S 233.09 Y
40 HEWCE262A Laser Toner - HP 648A,Yellow EACH 11000 487908 TONER,HP,CE262A,YELLOW EA 11000 | S 233.09 | $ 233.09 Y
41 HEWCE263A Laser Toner - HP 648A, Magenta EACH 11000 2 487953 TONER,HP,CE263A,MAGENTA EA 11000 |S 233.09| S 233.09 | § 466.18 |Y
42 HEWQS949X Laser Toner - HP 49X, Black EACH 6000 992232 CARTRIDGE,LASERJET,HP Q5949X EA 6000 S 148.93 | S 148.93 Y
43 HEWQ6470A Laser Toner- HP SOIA,Black EACH 6000 4 977952 CARTRIDGE,LASERJET,Q6470A,BLK EA 6000 5 130.84 | S 130.84 | § 523.36 |Y
44 HEWQ6471A Laser Toner - HP 502A,Cyan EACH 4000 2 940584 CARTRIDGE,HP Q6471A,LSRIT,CYAN EA 4000 S 149.35 | § 149.35 | S 298.70 |Y
45 HEWQ6472A Laser Toner - HP 502A, Yellow EACH 4000 1 940648 CARTRIDGE,HP Q6472A,LSRIET,YLW EA 4000 S 149.35 | § 149.35 | § 149.35 |Y
46 HEWQ6473A Laser Toner - HP 502A, Magenta EACH 4000 2 940688 CARTRIDGE,Q6473A,LASERJET,MAGN EA 4000 S 149.35 | $ 149.35 | 149.35 |Y
47 HEWCB436A Laser Toner - HP 36A, Black EACH 2000 ) 463865 TONER,HP 36A,BLACK EA 2000 S 62.96 |5 6296 | S 251.84 |Y
48 HEWCC364A Laser Toner - HP 64A, Black EACH 10000 16 3592430 TONER,HP CC364A,BLACK EA 10000 | S 139.17 | § 139.17 | § 2,226.72 |Y
49 HEWCE285A Laser Toner - HP 85A, Black EACH 1600 3 231939 TONER,LJ CE285A,HP,BLACK EA 1600 S 55.34 | S 55.34 | S 166.02 |Y
50 HEWCE250A Laser Toner - HP 504A, Black EACH 5000 9 866355 TONER,CE250A,HP,BLACK EA 5000 S 109.09 | $ 109.09 | & 981.81 |Y
51 HEWCE251A Laser Toner - HP 504A, Cyan EACH 7000 3 866370 TONER,CE251A,HP,CYAN EA 7000 S 214.20 | S 214.20 | § 642.60 |Y
52 HEWCE253A Laser Toner - HP 504A, Magenta EACH 7000 6 866540 TONER,CE253A,HP, MAGENTA EA 7000 S 21420 | $ 21420 | S 1,285.20 |Y
53 HEWCE252A Laser Toner - HP 504A, Yellow EACH 7000 5 866545 TONER,CE252A,HP,YELLOW EA 7000 S 214.20| $ 21420 | s 1,071.00 |Y
54 HEWCE255A Laser Toner - HP 55A, Black EACH 6000 13 554463 TONER,HP LJ CE255A,BLACK EA 6000 S 118.09 | $ 118.09 | $ 1,535.17 |Y
55 RIC820000 er Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Bl EACH 1 2 N/A $ - N
56 RIC820008 br Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Yel EACH 1 2 131436 RICOH TONER CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 13247 | $ 132.47 | S 264.94 |Y
57 RIC820016 I Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Mag| EACH 1 2 131427 RICOH TONER CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 13247 | $ 132.47 | § 264.94 |Y
58 RIC820024 ber Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Cy EACH 1 2 400505 TONER,C811DN 20K YLD,CYN EA 1 S 215.22 |8 215.22 | S 430.45 |N
59 RIC402714 icoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black Drum Un EACH 1 1 426245 DRUM,SP C811DN,BLACK EA 1 S 130.14 | S 130.14 | S 130.14 |Y
60 RIC402715 icoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Color Drum Ur] EACH 1 1 N/A S - N
61 RIC402717 br Transfer Unit- Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Prir| EA 1 1 426355 TRANSFER BELT,RIC SP C811DN EA 1 S 17845 | S 17845 | S 178.45 |Y
62 RIC402718 Fuser Unit- Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer EACH 1 426405 FUSER UNIT,RICOH,SP C811DN EA 1 S 285.29 | § 285.29 Y
63 RIC402716 Waste Toner- Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN EACH 1 1 426345 WASTE BOTTLE,RICOH EA 1 5 12.16 | S 1216 | S 12.16 |Y
64 HEWCE310A Laser Toner- HP 126A, Black EACH 1200 1 991764 TONER,HP LJ 126A,BLACK EA 1200 s 41.42 (S 41425 41.42 |Y
65 HEWCE311A Laser Toner- HP 126A,Cyan EACH 1000 991773 TONER,HP LU 126A,CYAN EA 1000 S 46.07 | S 46.07 Y
66 HEWCE312A Laser Toner- HP 126A,Yellow EACH 1000 991791 TONER,HP LJ 126A,YELLOW EA 1000 S 46.07 | S 46.07 Y
67 HEWCE313A Laser Toner- HP 126A, Magenta EACH 1000 991854 TONER,HP LI126A,MAGENTA EA 1000 S 46.07 | S 46.07 Y




68 HEWCE270A Laser Toner- HP 6504, Black EACH 13500 2 101202  |TONER,HP L) CE270A,BLACK EA 13500 | 199.08 | § 199.08 | $  398.16 |Y
69 HEWCE271A Laser Toner - HP 6504, Cyan EACH 15000 1 101247  |TONER,HP U CE271A,CYAN EA 15000 | $ 323.98 | $ 323.98 |5 323.98 |Y
70 HEWCE272A Laser Toner- HP 650A, Yellow EACH 15000 1 101283  |TONER,HP U CE272A,YELLOW EA 15000 |$ 323.98 | $ 32398 |5 323.98 |Y
71 HEWCE273A Laser Toner- HP 650A, Magenta EACH 15000 1 101292  |TONER,HP LICE273A,MAGENTA EA 15000 |$ 323.98 | $ 32398 |5 32398 |Y
72 HEWCF410X Laser Toner- HP 410X, Black EACH 6500 16 308739  |TONER 410X BLACK HY EA 6500 |$ 115.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 1,840.00 |Y
73 HEWCF411X Laser Toner - HP 410X,Cyan EACH 5000 13 415481  |HP410X,HIGH YIELD, TONER,CYAN EA 5000 |$ 153.95 | § 153.95 | $ 2,001.35 |Y
74 HEWCF412X Laser Toner- HP 410X, Yellow EACH 5000 15 833522  |HP410X,HIGHYIELD, TONER,YELLOW EA 5000 |$ 153.95 | § 153.95 | $ 2,309.25 |Y
75 HEWCF413X Laser Toner- HP 410X,Magenta EACH 5000 14 102029  [HP410X,HIGHYIELD, TONER,MAGNTA EA 5000 |[$ 153.95 | § 153.95 | $ 2,155.30 |Y
76 HEWCF400X La ser Toner- HP 201X, Black EACH 2800 470809  |HP 201X HY BLK TONER EA 2800 |$ 7358 | § 73.58 Y
77 HEWCF401X Laser Toner - HP 201X, Cyan EACH 2300 470874  |HP 201X HY CYAN U TONER EA 2300 S 8162 |5 81.62 Y
78 HEWCF402X La ser Toner- HP 201X, Yellow EACH 2300 470978 HP 201X HY YLLW Ul TONER EA 2300 S 81.62 | S 81.62 Y
79 HEWCF403X Laser Toner - HP 201X, Magenta EACH 2300 471036  |HP 201X HY MAG TNR EA 2300 | S 816253 81.62 Y
80 HEWCF287X Laser Toner- HP 87X, Black EACH 18000 530540  |HP 87X HIGH YIELD BLACK TONER EA 18000 | S 234.95 | $ 234.95 Y
81 HEWCF266X Laser Toner- HP 26X,Black EACH 9000 553571  |TONER 26X BLACK HIGH YIELD EA 9000 |S 158.89 | $ 158.89 Y
82 HEWCF360X Laser Toner - HPS08X,Black EACH 12500 508937 |TONER,HP,508X HY,BLK,0RG,U EA 12500 |$ 17373 | $ 173.73 Y
83 HEWCF361X Laser Toner- HP508X, Cyan EACH 9500 508953  |HP 508X HY CYAN ORG LJ TNR EA 9500 S 240515 240.51 Y
84 HEWCF362X Laser Toner- HPS08X, Yellow EACH 9500 508039  |HP 508X HY YLLW ORG LJ TNR EA 9500 S 24051 | $ 240.51 Y
85 HEWCF363X Laser Toner- HP508X, Magenta EACH 9500 509123  |HP 508X HY MAG U TNR EA 9500 |S 24051 | $ 240.51 Y
86 HEWCB540A Laser Toner - HP 125A, Black EACH 2200 444550  |TONER,HP CB540A,BLACK EA 2200 |S 63.67 | 5 63.67 Y
87 HEWCB541A Laser Toner- HP 125A, Cyan EACH 1400 444590  |TONER,HP CB541A,CYAN EA 1400 |$ 5852 % 58.52 Y
88 HEWCB543A Laser Toner - HP 125A, Magenta EACH 1400 444630  |TONER,HP CB543A,MAGENTA EA 1400 | 5852 | % 58.52 Y
89 HEWCB542A Laser Toner- HP 125A, Yellow EACH 1400 444625  |TONER,HP CB542A,YELLOW EA 1400 | S 5852 | % 58.52 Y
90 HEWCB435A Laser Toner - HP 35A,Black EACH 1500 3 636645  [TONER,HP 35A,BLACK EA 1500 | $ 5478 | 5478 |$  164.34 |Y
91 HEWCES05A Laser Toner - HP 05A, Black EACH 2300 14 878270 [TONER,HP CES05A,BLACK EA 2300 |$ 7159 | § 7159 | $ 1,002.26 |Y
92 HEW(C4129X Laser Toner - HP 29X, Black EACH 10000 346843  [TONER,LJ5000,C4129X EA 10000 |$ 186.07 | $ 186.07 Y
93 HEWCC530A Laser Toner - HP 304A, Black EACH 3500 6 287850  [TONER,HP LJ CC530A,BLACK EA 3500 |$ 99.62 | $ 99.62 | $  597.72 |¥
94 HEWCC531A Laser Toner - HP 304A, Cyan EACH 2800 4 287855  [TONER,HP LJ CC531A,CYAN EA 2800 |$ 98.19 | $ 98.19|$ 392.76 |Y
95 HEWCC533A Laser Toner - HP 304A, Magenta EACH 2800 5 287865  |TONER,HP LJ CC533A,MAGENTA EA 2800 | 98.19 | $ 98.19 | $  490.95 |Y
96 HEWCC532A Laser Toner - HP 304A, Yellow EACH 2800 3 287860  |TONER,HP LJ CC532A,YELLOW EA 2800 |$ 98.19 | $ 98.19 [ §  294.57 |¥
97 HEWQ5945A Laser Toner - HP 45A, Black EACH 18000 224280  |TONER,LASERIET,Q5945A,BLACK EA 18000 | S 201.27 | $ 201.27 Y
98 | CNMCRTDG118BK pner - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CD]  EACH 3400 23 574974  [TONER,CANON 118,BLACK EA 3400 | 105.35 | § 105.35 | $ 2,423.05 |Y
99 | CNMCRTDG118MA fer - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CDN|  EACH 2900 14 575082  |TONER,CANON 118,MAGENTA EA 2900 S 98.58 | $ 98.58 [ $ 1,380.12 |v
100 | CNMCRTDG118YW her - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660CD]  EACH 2900 14 575163  |TONER,CANON 118, YELLOW EA 2900 | S 98.58 | § 98.58 [ $ 1,380.12 |y
101 | CNMCRTDG118CY pner - Canon MF8380CDW, Canon LBP7660C0  EACH 2500 17 575028 |TONER,CANON 118,CYAN EA 2900 |$ 98.58 | $ 98.58 [ $ 1,675.86 |v
102 44315304 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Black EACH 1 4 444228  |TONER,F/C610 SERIES,BK EA 1 S 85.83 |5 85835 34332 |y
103 44315303 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Cyan EACH | 3 444219  |TONER,F/C610 SERIES,CN EA 1 $ 172,67 | § 172,67 |$ 518.01|Y
104 44315302 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Magenta EACH 1 2 444156  |TONER,F/C610 SERIES,MG EA 1 5 172.58 | § 17258 S 34516 |Y
105 44315301 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Yellow EACH 1 2 444138  |TONER,F/C610 SERIES,YEL EA 1 5 172.58 | § 17258 |$ 34516 |Y




106 44315104 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Black EACH 1 2 444129  |DRUM,F/C610 SERIES,BK EA 1 S 67.11| 5 67.11 (S 134.22 |y
107 44315103 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Cyan EACH 1 2 444102 |DRUM,F/C610SERIES,CN EA 1 S 71.88 | S 7188 (S 14376 |Y
108 44315102 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Magenta EACH 1 1 444093 DRUM,F/C610SERIES,MG EA 1 S 7188 | S 71.88|5S 71.88 |y
109 44315101 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Yellow EACH 1 1 442122  |DRUM,F/C610 SERIES,YEL EA 1 S 71.88 | S 71.88 | 71.88 |y
110 56123401 Laser Toner - Okidata MB280 EACH 1 676554  [TONER,HC PRINT CART,BK EA 1 S 137.19 | $ 137.19 Y
111 HEWCE410X Laser Toner - HP 305X, Black EACH 4000 16 756697  |TONER,HP 305X,LASERJET,BLACK EA 4000 S 83.16 | § 83.16 | S 1,330.56 |Y
112 HEWCE411A Laser Toner - HP 305A, Cyan EACH 2600 15 756706  |TONER,HP 305A,LASERIET,CYAN EA 2600 $ 96.46 | § 96.46 | $ 1,446.90 |Y
113 HEWCE412A Laser Toner - HP 305A, Yellow EACH 2600 15 756724  |TONER,HP 305A,LASERJET, YELLOW EA 2600 $ 96.46 | § 96.46 | 5 1,446.90 |Y
114 HEWCE413A Laser Toner - HP 305A, Magenta EACH 2600 16 756769  |TONER,HP 305A,LASERJET, MAGENTA EA 2600 S 96.46 | S 96.46 | § 1,543.36 |Y
115 HEWCF283X Laser Toner - HP 83X, Black EACH 2200 9 968332  [TONER,HP,83X,HY,BLACK EA 2200 S 80.67 | S 80.67|$ 726.03 |Y
116 HEWCF280X Laser Toner - HP 80X, Black EACH 6900 36 385819  [TONER,HP 80X,BLACK EA 6900 S 163.42 |3 163.42 | S 5,883.12 |Y
117 HEWCE400X Laser Toner - HPS507X, Black EACH 11000 7 679882  |HP 507X BLACK LI TONER CRTRDGE EA 11000 |$ 184.84 | 5 184.84 | § 1,293.88 |Y
118 HEWCE401A Laser Toner - HP 507A, Cyan EACH 6000 5 680134  [TONER HP 507A CYAN CRTRDGE EA 6000 S 204.68 | 3 204.68 | $ 1,023.40 |Y
119 HEWCE402A Laser Toner - HP 507A, Yellow EACH 6000 6 680143  [TONER HP 507A YELLOW CRTRDG EA 6000 S 214.42 | $ 21442 | $ 1,286.52 |Y
120 HEWCE403A Laser Toner - HP 507A, Magenta EACH 6000 5 680206 |TONER HP 507A MAGENTA CRTRD EA 6000 S 21442 | $ 214.42 |5 1,072.10 |Y
121 HEWCF380A Laser Toner - HP 312A, Black EACH 2400 489313  |TONER,HP 312A,BLACK EA 2400 S 84.63 | 3 84.63 Y
122 HEWCF381A Laser Toner - HP 312A, Cyan EACH 2700 489997  |TONER,HP 312A,CYAN EA 2700 S 11331 |3 113.31 Y
123 HEWCF382A Laser Toner - HP 312A, Yellow EACH 2700 490006 |TONER,HP 312A,YELLOW EA 2700 S 113.31 | $ 113.31 Y
124 HEWCF383A Laser Toner - HP312A, Magenta EACH 2700 490060 |TONER,HP 312A,MAGENTA EA 2700 S 113.31 | $ 113.31 Y
125 HEWQ2429A Maintenance Kit - HP Laserlet 4200 Series EACH 200000 588800  [KIT,MAINT 110V LI 4200,BLACK EA 200000 | $ 229.57 | 8 229.57 Y
126 HEWQ5421A Maintenance Kit - HP Laserlet 4250 Series EACH 225000 3 866696  |MAINTENANCE KIT,LI4250/4350 KT 225000 | $ 251313 251.31|$  753.93 Y
127 HEWC6614D Inkjet Cartridge - HP 20, Black EACH 500 1 384601 |CARTRIDGE,INK,#20,C6614DN,610C EA 500 S 34118 34.11|$ 34.11 |
128 | HEWCE656AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 56, Black EACH 520 1 419672  |CARTRIDGE,INK,HP #56,BLACK EA 520 S 28.29 | % 28.29 | S 28.29 |Y
129| HEWCE657AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 57, Tri-Color EACH 500 154605  |CARTRIDGE,INK,HP#57,TRI-COLOR EA 500 S 37.91|$ 37.91 Y
130| HEWCND45AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 950XL, Black EACH 2300 59 781692  [INK,HP,950,XL,BLACK EA 2300 S 29.58 | $ 2958 |$ 1,745.22 |¥
131| HEWCNO4G6AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Cyan EACH 1 34 781764  [INKHP,951 XL CYAN EA 1 S 22,68 | $ 2268|8 77112|Y
132 | HEWCND47AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Magenta EACH 1 31 782034  [INKHP,951 XL, MAGENTA EA 1 S 22,68 | $ 2268 (S 703.08 |Y
133 | HEWCNOD48AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951XL, Yellow EACH 1 35 782043  [INKHP,951XL YELLOW EA 1 S 22,68 | S 2268|$ 793.80 Y
134 HEWC1Q12A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Black EACH 1 790769  |727 PHOTO BLACK INK CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 56.10 | $ 56.10 Y
135 HEWB3P19A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Cyan EACH 1 790778  |727 CYAN INK CARTRIDGE 130ML EA 1 S 56.10 | $ 56.10 Y
136 HEWB3P20A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Magenta EACH 1 790787 727 MAGENTA INK CARTRIDGE 130M EA 1 S 56.10 | $ 56.10 Y
137 HEWB3P21A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Yellow EACH 1 790796  |727 YELLOW INK CARTRIDGE 130ML EA 1 S 56.10 | $ 56.10 Y
138 HEWB3P23A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Photo Black EACH 1 790769  [727 PHOTO BLACK INK CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 56.10 | $ 56.10 Y
139 HEWB3P24A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 727, Grey EACH 1 790742  |727 GRAY INK CARTRIDGE 130ML EA 1 S 56.10 | § 56.10 Y
140 HEWC4911A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Cyan EACH 1430 697971  |CARTRIDGE,INK,HP #82,CYAN EA 1430 $ 3324 $ 33.24 Y
141 HEWC4912A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Magenta EACH 1430 909100  |INKCART,#82,MAGENTA EA 1430 S 33.24 | § 33.24 Y
142 HEWC4913A Inkjet Cartridge - HP 82, Yellow EACH 3200 909109  [INKCART,#82 YELLOW EA 3200 S 33.24 | S 33.24 Y
143 | HEWC9363WN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 97, Tri-Color EACH 560 51 440648  |INK CARTRIDGE,TRICOLOR,97,HP EA 560 S 37.24 | S 37.24 | $ 1,899.24 |y




144 | HEWC8767WN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 96, Black EACH 860 76 440520  |INK CARTRIDGE,96,BLACK,HP EA 860 $ 3286 | 8 32.86 | S 2,497.36 |Y
145 | HEWC9351AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 21, Black EACH 190 891320  |CARTRIDGE,INKJET,HP 21,BLACK EA 190 $ 13.64 | $ 13.64 Y
146 | HEWCNG21AM Inkjet Cartridge - HP 970, Black EACH 3000 2 753433 |INK,970,HP,BLACK EA 3000 |$ 63.09 | $ 63.09 | S 126.18 |Y
147 | HEWCB622AM Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Cyan EACH 2500 2 753469  |INK,HP 971,CYAN EA 2500 |$ 65.80 [ S 65.80 |  131.60 |Y
148 | HEWCB623AM Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Magenta EACH 2500 2 753550  |INK,HP 971, MAGENTA EA 2500 S 65.80 | S 65.80 (S 13160 |Y
149 | HEWCB624AM Inkjet Cartridge - HP 971, Yellow EACH 2500 2 753559  |INK,HP 971,YELLOW EA 2500 | $ 65.80 | S 65.80 | §  131.60 |Y
150 | HEWF6U19AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Black EACH 1 7 380433 |HEWLETT PACKARD,952XL,BLACK EA 1 S 2459 | S 2459 s 17213 |y
151 | HEWLOS61AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Cyan EACH 1 5 262331  [HEWLETT PACKARD,952XL,CYAN EA 1 5 18.74 [ S 18.74 | § 93.70 |Y
152 | HEWCO0S64AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Magenta EACH 1600 5 641642  |HEWLETT PACKARD,952XL,MAGENTA EA 1600 |$ 18.74 | S 1874 | $ 93.70 |¥
153 | HEWLOS67AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 952XL, Yellow EACH 1 5 254037  [HEWLETT PACKARD,952XL,YELLOW EA 1 $ 18.74 | § 18.74 | $ 93.70 |Y
154 | HEWFG6UB4AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 63XL, Black EACH 1 4 523218  [INK,CARTRIDGE,HP 63XL,BLACK EA 1 $ 25.16 | $ 2516 | $  100.64 |Y
155 | HEWFGUB3AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 63XL, Tri-Color EACH 1 4 509489  [INK,CARTRIDGE,HP 63XL,MULTI EA 1 s 2636 | 5 2636 |5 105.44 |Y
156 | HEWC2PO5AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 62XL, Black EACH 1 667932  |INKHP,62XL,BLACK EA 1 s 33435 33.43 Y
157 | HEWC2PO6AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 62, Tri-Color EACH 1 4 668049  |INK,HP,62,TRI-COLOR EA 1 5 17.18 | § 17.18| $ 68.72 |Y
158 | HEWC2P23AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 934XL, Black EACH 1 15 572919  [INK,HP,934,XL,BLACK EA 1 s 29.03 | ¢ 20.03|$ 43545 |Y
159 | HEWC2P24AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Cyan EACH 1 3 572928  |INK,HP935,XL,CYAN EA 1 S 18.28 | $ 18.28 | $ 54.84 |Y
160 | HEWC2P25AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Magenta EACH 1 3 572937  |INK,HP935,XL,MAGENTA EA 1 S 18.28 | $ 18.28 | 5 54.84 [¥
161| HEWC2P26AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 935XL, Yellow EACH | 6 572946  |INK,HP935,XL,YELLOW EA 1 s 18.28 | $ 18.28 | $  109.68 |¥
162 | EPST/11XXL120 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Black EACH | 2 127033 EPSON WORKFORCE INK XXL EA 1 S 35.32 |3 3532 (S 70.64 |Y
163 | EPST711XXL220 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Cyan EACH 1200 649833  [INK,676XL220,CYAN,DURABRITE EA 1200 |$ 1765 $ 17.65 Y
164 | EPST711XXL320 | Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Magenta EACH 12000 649842  [INK,676XL320,MAG DURBRITE ULTR EA 12000 |$ 17.65 [ $ 17.65 Y
165 | EPST711XXL420 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Yellow EACH 1200 649887  |EPSON,676XL420,DURBRITE,YELLOW EA 1200 |$ 17.65 | $ 17.65 Y
166 EPST159120  |Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer EACH 1 2 694003  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 $ 16.80 | $ 16.80 | $ 33.60 |Y
167 EPST159220 |Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer]  EACH 1 2 694156  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 $ 16.80 [ $ 16.80 | $ 33.60 |Y
168 EPST159320  frtridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, N EACH 1 2 694147  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 $ 16.80 | § 16.80 | $ 33.60 |¥
169 EPST159420  [artridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, EACH 1 2 694183  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 2177 (S 2177 | s 43,54 |Y
170 EPST159720 | Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printeff ~ EACH 1 2 693958  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 2177 |8 21.77 | 43,54 |Y
171 EPST159820  [tridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, M ~ EACH 1 2 694129  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 16.80 | § 16.80 | 5 33.60 |Y
172 EPST159920  [artridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, EACH 1 2 694138  |EPSON 159 - PRINT CARTRIDGE EA 1 S 16.80 | $ 16.80 | 5 33.60 |Y
173 EPST159020  |idge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Glos| ~ EACH 1 2 694246  |EPSON 159 - INK OPTIMIZER CART EA 1 $ 23.74 |8 23.74 |8 47.48 |N
174 | HEWCNO49AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 950, Black EACH 1000 3 781386  |INK,HP,950,BLACK EA 1000 |$ 2036 | § 2036 (S 61.08 |Y
175| HEWCNOS0AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Cyan EACH 700 1 781413  |INK,HP,9515,CYAN EA 700 $ 14.70 | § 1470 | 3 14.70 |Y
176 | HEWCNO51AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Magenta EACH 700 781494  |INK,HP,951, MAGENTA EA 700 $ 14.70 | $ 14.70 Y
177 | HEWCNO52AN Inkjet Cartridge - HP 951, Yellow EACH 700 1 781539  |INK,HP,951,YELLOW EA 700 5 1470 | § 14.70 | $ 14.70 |¥
178 HEWCE602A Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Black EACH 1 15 840208 |CARTRIDGE,INKIET,HP BLACK EA 1 5 13415 13.41|% 20115 |y
179 HEWC6602B Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Blue EACH 1 392785  [INK,HP C6602B,BLUE EA 1 5 19.79 | § 19.79 Y
180 HEWC6602G Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Green EACH 1 840208  [CARTRIDGE,INKJET,HP BLACK EA 1 s 1341 13.41 Y
181 HEWC6602R Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Red EACH 1 835576  |CARTRIDGE,INKIET,HP,RED EA 1 5 13.41($ 13.41 Y




182 BRTTN450 hx Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840, High Yie EACH 2600 695769 TONER,BROTHER TN450,HY,BLACK EA 2600 S 42208 42.20 253.20 |Y
183 BRTDR420 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840 EACH 12000 534489 DRUM,BROTHER DR420,BLACK EA 12000 (5§ 64.68 | § 64.68 64.68 |Y
184 BRTPC201 [Thermal Ribbon Cartridge PFC1170, 1270, 15 EACH 450 207779 PRINT CARTRIDGE,FAX,PC201 EA 450 S 21998 21.99 65.97 |Y
185 BRTTN350 Fax Cartridge - Brother DCP 7020, MFC-7220 EACH 2500 970568 TONER,LASER,BROTHER TN350BLK EA 2500 5 51.74 | S 51.74 Y
186 BRTTN540 Fax Cartridge - Brother TN540 EACH 3500 533360 TONER,LASER,BROTHER TN540,BLK EA 3500 $ 60.68 | S 60.68 Y
187 BRTTN430 r Cartridge - Brother 4100E/4750E/ 5750E, 3, EACH 3000 997541 TONER,MFC8300,TN430,STD EA 3000 S 47.13 | S 47.13 235.65 |Y
188 BRTTN660 0, DCP-7040, HL-2140, HL-2170W, MFC-7340, EACH 2600 576090 TONER,BROTHER, TN660,BLACK EA 2600 $ 42,20 | S 42.20 Y
189 BRTTN330 130, DCP-7040, HL-2140, HL-2170W, MFC-734 EACH 1500 692005 TONER,TN-330,BLACK EA 1500 $ 35.42 | S 35.42 3542 |Y




