
BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-01-08

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

NAPA AUTO   
TIRE & PARTS 

JIM SPOOLER 
SALES

EAGLE 
AUTOMOTIVE 
JEFF CO AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

AUTO ZONE 
INC.

AIRCONDITIONER

BRAND
NO BID NAPA N/A AC DELCO FOUR SEASON

COMPRESSOR 
WORKS, 

FACTORY AIRE
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%

ALTERNATORS

BRAND NO BID RAYLOC N/A AC DELCO JNI ACT DURALAST 
(REMY, MPA)

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 20% 10% 50%
BEARINGS

BRAND NO BID SKF N/A AC DELCO BCA 
BEARINGS TIMKEN

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A TIMKEN N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A 15% N/A
THROW OUT BEARINGS

BRAND NO BID SKF N/A BCA BCA 
BEARINGS TIMKEN

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 10% -10% 50%
BRAKES

BRAND

NO BID
UNITED 
WORLD 
BRAKE

N/A AC DELCO WORLD CAR

DURALAST 
(FEDERAL, 

MOGUL, 
MORSE))

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -18% N/A J - 20% -5% 50%
BRAKES HYDRAULIC

BRAND NO BID UNITED N/A NO BID RAYBESTOS BRAHEWARE
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -18% N/A NO BID -10% 50%

CARBURETORS
BRAND NO BID NAPA N/A NO BID HYGRADE GP SORENSON

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -13% N/A NO BID -10% 50%
CHASSIS PARTS

BRAND NO BID NAPA N/A AC DELCO MOOG DURALAST     
(TRW)

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A MCQNAY 
NORRIS N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -10% N/A
CLUTCH REBULT 
PRESSURE PLATE

BRAND NO BID MBI N/A NO BID PRECISION STANDARD 
FLYWHEELS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -17% N/A NO BID 5% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A NO BID CERTIFIED N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A NO BID 5% N/A
REBULT CLUTCH DISC

BRAND NO BID MBI N/A NO BID PRECISION CUMBERLAND 
FENCO

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -17% N/A NO BID 5% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A NO BID CERTIFIED N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A NO BID 5% N/A
REBULT CLUTCH DISC

BRAND NO BID MBI N/A NO BID PRECISION CUMBERLAND 
FENCO

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -17% N/A NO BID 5% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A NO BID CERTIFIED N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A NO BID 5% N/A



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-01-08

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

NAPA AUTO   
TIRE & PARTS 

JIM SPOOLER 
SALES

EAGLE 
AUTOMOTIVE 
JEFF CO AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

AUTO ZONE 
INC.

COMMENTS: NO BID N/A N/A NO BID NEW CLUTCH 
KIT -5% N/A

ENGINE PARTS

BRAND
NO BID

CLEVITE 
FEDERAL 
MOGUL

N/A AC DELCO SEALED 
POWER

MELLING 
HSDTINGS 
BADGER

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -20% N/A J - 20% -5% 50%
EXHAUST SYSTEMS

BRAND NO BID WALKER HEAVY DUTY WALKER WALKER ARVIN 
MAREMONT

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -20% 0% J - 10% -10% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A GOERCIC N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -5% N/A
FILTERS

BRAND
NO BID NAPA N/A AC DELCO WIX

FRAM STP 
(HONEYWELL 
CHAMP LABS)

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -50% N/A J - 30% -37% 50%
GASKETS

BRAND NO BID FELPRO N/A FEL PRO FEL PRO ROL, FEL PRO
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 10% -12% 50%

GEARS

BRAND NO BID BALKAMP N/A AC DELCO CLOYES       
SEAL POWER CLOYES

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%
 IGNITION ELECTRICAL

BRAND NO BID ECHLIN N/A AC DELCO STANDARD 
IGN WELLS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -17% N/A J - 20% -12% 50%
IGNITION  WIRE SETS

BRAND
NO BID BELDIN N/A AC DELCO STANDARD 

IGN

BOSCH 
GENERAL 

CABLE
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% N/A J - 20% -12% 50%

BATTERIES

BRAND
NO BID NAPA EXIDE N/A AC DELCO ELLIS 

BATTERY

DURALAST 
(JOHNSON 
CONTROL)

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -18% N/A 0% -27% 50%
GLOW PLUGS

BRAND NO BID CHAMPION N/A AC DELCO MOTORCRAFT BOSCH 
AUTOLITE

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 10% -5% 50%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A CHAMPION N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -5% N/A
LAMPS

BRAND
NO BID WAGNER WAGONER WAGNER WAGNER

SYLANIA, EIKO 
(FEDERAL 
MOGUL)

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -15% 0% J - 10% -15% 50%
PUMPS - FUEL - NEW

BRAND
NO BID

NAPA 
FEDERAL 
MOGUL

N/A AC DELCO AIRTEX AIRTEX

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%
PUMPS WATER NEW



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-01-08

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

NAPA AUTO   
TIRE & PARTS 

JIM SPOOLER 
SALES

EAGLE 
AUTOMOTIVE 
JEFF CO AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

AUTO ZONE 
INC.

BRAND NO BID NAPA         
TRU-FLOW N/A AC DELCO AIRTEX ASC

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 20% -15% 50%
PUMPS WATER REBULT

BRAND NO BID NAPA    
CARDONE N/A AC DELCO A-1 A1 - CARDONE

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%
RUBBER PRODUCTS

BRAND
NO BID NAPA GATES BREEZE AC DELCO GATES

KELLY 
SPRINGFIELD 
GOODYEAR

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -12% 0% J - 20% -10% 50%
SHOCK ABSORBERS

BRAND NO BID NAPA 
MONROE N/A AC DELCO MONROE GABRIEL 

SACKS
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -20% N/A J - 20% -15% 50%

SPARK PLUGS
BRAND NO BID CHAMPION N/A AC DELCO AC PLUGS ALL BRANDS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -10% N/A J - 20% -15% 50%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A AC PLATINUM N/A

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -5% N/A
TRANSMISSION

BRAND NO BID ATP N/A AC DELCO CHAMPION PRO KING
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -18% N/A J - 20% -15% 50%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A ATP N/A
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -10% N/A

U-JOINTS
BRAND NO BID NAPA N/A AC DELCO PRECISION NEAPRO

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID -17% N/A J - 20% -10% 50%
BRAKES

1 SET DM 225

BRAND
NO BID WORLD 

BRAKE N/A AC DELCO RAYBESTOS
DURALAST 

GOLD 
FEDERAL 

NUMBER NO BID CMD7545 N/A 170699M PGD699M DG699
LIST PRICE NO BID $19.15 N/A $88.38 $103.76 $54.96

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 18% N/A 20% -61.5% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $13.79 N/A $70.70 $39.95 $27.48
1 SET MD 659

BRAND
NO BID WORLD 

BRAKE N/A AC DELCO RAYBESTOS
DURALAST 

GOLD 
FEDERAL 

NUMBER NO BID CMD7387A N/A 170698 PGD698 DG698
LIST PRICE NO BID $14.89 N/A $49.89 $96.90 $60.74

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 18% N/A 20% -61.5% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $10.72 N/A $39.91 $37.31 $30.37
1 SET DE 544

BRAND
NO BID WORLD 

BRAKE N/A NO BID RAYBESTOS
DURALAST 

GOLD 
FEDERAL 

NUMBER NO BID CMD8269 N/A NO BID PGD1159C DG61159
LIST PRICE NO BID $31.10 N/A NO BID $105.24 $59.22

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 18% N/A NO BID -61.5% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $22.39 N/A NO BID $40.64 $29.61

MUFFLER .
BRAND NO BID WALKER N/A WALKER WALKER SUPER C



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-01-08

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

NAPA AUTO   
TIRE & PARTS 

JIM SPOOLER 
SALES

EAGLE 
AUTOMOTIVE 
JEFF CO AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

AUTO ZONE 
INC.

NUMBER NO BID 21351 N/A 21351 21351 151277
LIST PRICE NO BID $73.81 N/A $173.46 $150.90 $109.78

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 20% N/A 10% -55% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $59.05 N/A $156.11 $67.90 $54.89

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A WALKER 
CLAMP N/A N/A

NUMBER NO BID N/A N/A 35337 N/A N/A
LIST PRICE NO BID N/A N/A $3.33 N/A N/A

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A 10% N/A N/A
NET AMOUNT NO BID N/A N/A $2.99 N/A N/A

CLUTCH
ORGANIC LINING

BRAND NO BID MBI N/A NO BID PRECISION N/A
NUMBER NO BID LP1505134 N/A NO BID CD5139 N/A

LIST PRICE NO BID $420.82 N/A NO BID $191.10 N/A
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 17% N/A NO BID -50% N/A
NET AMOUNT NO BID $349.25 N/A NO BID $95.55 N/A

CERAMIC BUTTONS
BRAND NO BID MBI N/A NO BID PRECISION N/A

NUMBER NO BID LP1714146 N/A NO BID CD5139CB6 N/A
LIST PRICE NO BID $738.81 N/A NO BID $230.20 N/A

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 17% N/A NO BID -50% N/A
NET AMOUNT NO BID $613.21 N/A NO BID $115.10 N/A
OIL FILTER

BRAND NO BID NAPA GOLD N/A WIX WIX FRAM
NUMBER NO BID 1799 N/A 51799 51799 PH7138

LIST PRICE NO BID $20.86 N/A $62.41 $54.90 $62.98
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 50% N/A 10% -68.5% 50%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $10.43 N/A $56.17 $17.29 $31.49
BATTERIES

BRAND
NO BID NAPA N/A AC DELCO ELLIS 

BATTERY

DURALAST 
(JOHNSON 
CONTROL)

NUMBER NO BID 7236 N/A 31TS HP31 31-90
LIST PRICE NO BID $64.42 N/A $90.27 $115.95 $151.98

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 18% N/A 0% -27% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $52.83 N/A $90.27 $84.64 $75.99

TRANSMISSION

BRAND NO BID ATP N/A MOTORCRAFT WIX CHAMP

NUMBER NO BID 1-9751 N/A FT105 58955 TF403
LIST PRICE NO BID $10.84 N/A $33.98 $36.42 $17.98

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 18% N/A 10% -68.5% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $8.90 N/A $30.58 $11.47 $8.99
OIL FILTER

BRAND NO BID NAPA GOLD N/A AC DELCO WIX FRAM
NUMBER NO BID 1040 N/A PF47 51040 PH3387A

LIST PRICE NO BID $3.96 N/A $9.82 $10.40 $6.82
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 50% N/A 20% -68.5% 50%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $1.98 N/A $7.85 $3.28 $3.41
AIR FILTERS

BRAND NO BID NAPA GOLD N/A WIX WIX FRAM
NUMBER NO BID 6253 N/A 46253 46253 CA9563

LIST PRICE NO BID $8.96 N/A $23.62 $23.62 $24.28
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 50% N/A 10% -68.5% 50%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $4.48 N/A $21.26 $7.44 $12.14
COMMENTS REFER TO BID REFER TO BID


