
BID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2017

LIGHTLE 

ENTERPRISES OF 

OHIO LLC

CUSTOM 

PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

VULCAN SIGNS
OSBURN 

ASSOCIATES INC

J & A TRAFFIC 

PRODUCTS
MD SOLUTIONS

CLEN INDUSTRIES 

INC

PO BOX 329

FRANKFORT OH 

45628

PO BOX 54091

JACKSON MS 39288

PO BOX 1850

FOLEY AL 36536

PO BOX 912

LOGAN OH 43138

605 W 40 HWY

BLUE SPRINGS MO 

64014

8225 ESTES PKWY

PLAIN CITY OH 

43064

15510 OLIVE BLVD 

STE 215

CHESTERFIELD MO 

63017

Street sign blanks are to be constructed of 

GREEN 3M HIGH INTENSITY 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING on .080 

EXTRUDED ALUMINUM BLADES.

9" HI-INTENSITY STREET SIGN BLANKS

9" X 24" ALUMINUM $11.63 $11.75 $10.14 $11.97 NO BID NO BID $11.55

9" X 30" ALUMINUM $14.53 $14.80 $12.78 $14.96 NO BID NO BID $14.10

9" X 36" ALUMINUM $17.44 $17.52 $15.10 $17.96 NO BID NO BID $16.95

9" X 42" ALUMINUM $20.34 $20.45 $17.71 $20.91 NO BID NO BID $19.92

9" X 48" ALUMINUM $23.25 $23.44 $20.20 $23.94 NO BID NO BID $22.60

9" X 54" ALUMINUM $26.16 $26.37 $21.23 $26.89 NO BID NO BID $25.60

9" X 60" ALUMINUM $29.06 $29.30 $23.58 $29.93 NO BID NO BID $28.30

HIGHWAY SIGNS ARE TO BE 

CONSTRUCTED OF 3M REFLECTIVE 

PRISMATIC SHEETING, AS 

DESIGNATED, ON .080 ALUMINUM. ALL 

LETTERS, NUMBERS, LEGENDS, ETC. 

SHALL BE CONSTRUCTED OF 3M 

REFLECTIVE MATERIAL

HI-INTENSITY PRISMATIC, TYPE III 

SHEETING

R1-1  STOP SIGNS 24" X 24" $16.10 $14.21 $13.84 $14.30 NO BID NO BID $15.95

R1-1  STOP SIGNS 30" X 30" $24.98 $22.20 $21.25 $22.34 NO BID NO BID $24.14

R1-1  STOP SIGNS 36" X 36" $36.15 $31.60 $30.46 $32.17 NO BID NO BID $35.53

R1-2 YIELD SIGNS 30" X 30" $14.21 $12.00 $11.86 $12.04 NO BID NO BID $13.31

R1-2 YIELD SIGNS 36" X 36" $18.40 $16.05 $15.87 $17.28 NO BID NO BID $18.48

W3-1 STOP AHEAD SIGNS 36" X 36" $27.50 $23.50 $22.60 $23.98 NO BID NO BID $41.19

W3-2 YIELD AHEAD SIGNS 36" X 36" $27.50 $23.50 $22.60 $23.98 NO BID NO BID $22.90

W3-3 SIGNAL AHEAD SIGNS 36" X 36" $27.50 $23.50 $23.04 $23.98 NO BID NO BID $38.99

W3-5 REDUCED SPEED AHEAD SIGNS 36" 

X 36"
$27.50 $23.50 $22.17 $23.98 NO BID NO BID $41.19

RF-9 OR N-5 18" (RED REFLECTOR ON RED) $15.50 $18.71 $15.18 $28.64 NO BID NO BID $15.95

The following signs are to be constructed of 

3M FLORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 

DIAMOND GRADE PRISMATIC, TYPE XI 

SHEETING ON .080 ALUMINUM.

DIAMOND GRADE PRISMATIC TYPE XI 

SHEETING

S1-1 SCHOOL ZONE 30" X 30" $39.25 $31.56 $33.40 $34.63 NO BID NO BID $43.61

S3-1 SCHOOL BUS STOP AHEAD SYMBOL 

30" X 30"
$39.25 $33.15 $34.09 $34.63 NO BID NO BID $43.61

S4-3 "SCHOOL" 24" X 8" $8.42 $7.00 $7.53 $7.39 NO BID NO BID $10.72

W16-7P (DIAGONAL ARROW) 30" X 18" $23.55 $18.95 $20.22 $20.78 NO BID NO BID $28.32

W16-9P "AHEAD" 30" X 18" $23.55 $18.95 $20.22 $20.78 NO BID NO BID $28.32

ROADWAY SIGNS 2017

2-28-2017



BID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2017

LIGHTLE 

ENTERPRISES OF 

OHIO LLC

CUSTOM 

PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

VULCAN SIGNS
OSBURN 

ASSOCIATES INC

J & A TRAFFIC 

PRODUCTS
MD SOLUTIONS

CLEN INDUSTRIES 

INC

PO BOX 329

FRANKFORT OH 

45628

PO BOX 54091

JACKSON MS 39288

PO BOX 1850

FOLEY AL 36536

PO BOX 912

LOGAN OH 43138

605 W 40 HWY

BLUE SPRINGS MO 

64014

8225 ESTES PKWY

PLAIN CITY OH 

43064

15510 OLIVE BLVD 

STE 215

CHESTERFIELD MO 

63017

ROADWAY SIGNS 2017

2-28-2017

The following standard signs are to be 

constructed of 3M HI-INTENSITY 

PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE SHEETING ON 

.080 ALUMINUM.  (APPROPRIATE 

COLORS WILL BE ORDERED AS 

NEEDED.)

PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE SHEETING

5" X 7" $1.60 $2.32 $1.80 $1.04 NO BID NO BID $2.36

10" X 30" $8.96 $7.69 $7.36 $7.98 NO BID NO BID $9.18

12" X 6" $2.60 $2.49 $2.29 $1.92 NO BID NO BID $2.53

12" X 9" $3.50 $4.73 $2.85 $2.88 NO BID NO BID $2.69

12" X 12" $4.40 $5.05 $3.93 $3.84 NO BID NO BID $4.67

12" X 18" $6.45 $5.88 $5.81 $5.76 NO BID NO BID $6.60

12" X 36" $12.90 $10.96 $10.17 $11.52 NO BID NO BID $12.37

18" X 6" $3.50 $3.53 $3.18 $2.88 NO BID NO BID $3.30

18" X 15" $8.10 $8.75 $7.67 $7.20 NO BID NO BID $8.25

18" X 18" $9.68 $8.75 $8.67 $8.64 NO BID NO BID $9.29

21" X 15" $9.42 $8.53 $8.93 $8.37 NO BID NO BID $9.62

24" X 6" $4.40 $4.20 $3.95 $3.84 NO BID NO BID $4.40

24" X 8" $5.80 $5.46 $4.97 $5.12 NO BID NO BID $5.88

24" X 10" $7.20 $6.56 $6.58 $6.40 NO BID NO BID $7.31

24" X 12" $8.60 $7.80 $7.74 $7.68 NO BID NO BID $8.25

24" X 18" $12.90 $10.96 $10.17 $11.52 NO BID NO BID $12.37

24" X 24" $17.20 $14.61 $13.56 $15.36 NO BID NO BID $16.50

24" X 30" $21.50 $18.30 $16.95 $19.20 NO BID NO BID $20.62

24" X 36" $25.80 $21.92 $20.34 $23.04 NO BID NO BID $24.75

24" X 48" $34.40 $28.25 $27.12 $30.72 NO BID NO BID $33.00

27" X 18" $14.51 $13.43 $11.98 $12.96 NO BID NO BID $14.85

30" X 15" $13.44 $13.43 $10.61 $12.01 NO BID NO BID $13.20

30" X 18" $16.13 $13.43 $12.71 $14.40 NO BID NO BID $15.80

30" X 30" $26.88 $22.85 $21.19 $24.00 NO BID NO BID $25.57

30" X 36" $32.25 $26.85 $25.43 $28.80 NO BID NO BID $30.96

30" X 42" $37.63 $31.45 $29.66 $33.60 NO BID NO BID $36.75

30" X 48" $43.00 $35.80 $33.90 $38.40 NO BID NO BID $41.25

30" X 60" $53.75 $44.75 $42.38 $48.00 NO BID NO BID $50.71

36" X 6" $6.45 $6.05 $5.86 $5.76 NO BID NO BID $6.60

36" X 12" $12.90 $10.96 $10.17 $11.52 NO BID NO BID $12.21

36" X 18" $19.35 $16.56 $15.26 $17.28 NO BID NO BID $18.59

36" X 20" $21.50 $18.45 $16.95 $19.20 NO BID NO BID $22.00

36" X 24" $25.80 $22.10 $20.34 $28.04 NO BID NO BID $24.75

36" X 30" $32.25 $27.60 $25.43 $28.80 NO BID NO BID $30.96

36" X 36" $38.70 $33.08 $30.51 $34.56 NO BID NO BID $36.85

36" X 48" $51.60 $44.15 $40.68 $46.08 NO BID NO BID $49.50

40" X 18" $21.50 $18.30 $16.95 $19.20 NO BID NO BID $22.20

48" X 9" $12.90 $11.15 $11.62 $11.52 NO BID NO BID $13.20

48" X 18" $25.80 $21.35 $20.34 $23.04 NO BID NO BID $24.75

48" X 30" $43.00 $35.55 $33.90 $38.40 NO BID NO BID $41.25

48" X 48" $68.80 $57.00 $52.24 $61.44 NO BID NO BID $66.00

54" X 42" $67.73 $56.10 $53.39 $60.48 NO BID NO BID $69.30

60" X 24" $43.00 $35.60 $33.90 $38.40 NO BID NO BID $41.25

60" X 30" $53.75 $44.50 $42.38 $48.00 NO BID NO BID $51.59

60" X 36" $64.50 $53.40 $50.85 $57.60 NO BID NO BID $61.87
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SIGN BRACKETS for Extruded Blades to fit 

CHANNEL POSTS.

Length of slot-5-1/2" - width of slot - .280

90X STYLE $2.90 $3.05 $2.70 $4.25 $3.95 $2.75 $2.75

180X STYLE $2.90 $3.05 $2.70 $4.25 $3.95 $2.75 $2.75

CROSS PIECE BA7A STYLE $3.10 $3.05 $3.30 $4.25 $3.50 $2.75 $3.55

CROSS PIECE UNIV 457X $3.80 $3.05 $3.20 $7.75 $4.10 $2.75 $3.55

STOP/SLOW PADDLES- 18" sign on 60" 

wooden handles (NON REFLECTIVE)

1-11 $15.55 $16.53 $16.10 $39.34 $21.50 NO BID $16.85

12+ $15.30 $16.53 $16.10 $36.33 $20.00 NO BID $16.85

STOP/SLOW PADDLES - 24" SIGN ON 60" 

WOODEN HANDLES (NON REFLECTIVE) 

1-11 $38.94 $24.79 $23.95 $54.92 $26.60 NO BID $22.49

12+ $38.50 $24.79 $23.95 $52.92 $25.10 NO BID $20.84

STOP / SLOW PADDLES  - 18"  SIGN ON 

60" WOODEN HANDLES (ENGINEER 

GRADE REFLECTIVITY

1-11 $16.90 $21.67 $16.10 $33.48 $24.25 NO BID $18.90

12+ $16.55 $21.67 $16.10 $31.83 $22.75 NO BID $18.90

STOP /SLOW PADDLES - 24" SIGN ON 

60" WOODEN HANDLES ( ENGINEER 

GRADE REFLECTIVITY) 

1-11 $40.44 $34.15 $23.95 $46.98 $29.25 NO BID $28.05

12+ $40.00 $34.15 $23.95 $44.92 $27.75 NO BID $26.34

STOP/ SLOW PADDLES 18" SIGN ON 60" 

WOODEN HANDLES (HIGH INTENSITY 

REFLECTIVITY) 

1-11 $21.30 $25.00 $19.95 $35.74 $29.50 NO BID $22.94

12+ $20.90 $25.00 $19.95 $33.78 $28.00 NO BID $22.94

STOP/ SLOW PADDLES - 24" SIGN ON 

60" WOODEN HANDLES ( HIGH 

INTENSITY REFLECTIVITY) 
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1-11 $48.30 $40.00 $28.75 $51.46 $34.80 NO BID $32.39

12+ $47.90 $40.00 $28.75 $48.28 $33.30 NO BID $30.25

CAUTION TAPE (YELLOW WITH BLACK 

LETTERING) 3"X1000'

1-11 $12.50 $13.15 $25.85 NO BID $16.50 NO BID NO BID 

12+ $11.80 $11.69 $25.85 NO BID $15.50 NO BID NO BID

TEMPORARY HIGHWAY MARKING 

TAPE (YELLOW) 4" X 150'

1-11 $49.80 $54.17 NO BID NO BID $49.50 NO BID NO BID

12+ $47.90 $54.00 NO BID NO BID $47.00 NO BID NO BID

TEMPORARY HIGHWAY MARKING 

TAPE  (WHITE) 4" X150'

1-11 $49.80 $54.17 NO BID NO BID $49.50 NO BID NO BID

12+ $47.90 $54.00 NO BID NO BID $47.00 NO BID NO BID

WHITE (HIGH INTENSITY) LETTERS 

AND NUMBERS

PRICE PER PACK OF 25 COUNT

2" SERIES  B $3.90 $3.76 $3.95 $12.78 $5.61 $4.19 NO BID

3" SERIES  B $5.95 $6.28 $4.95 $13.15 $6.50 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES  B $6.90 $8.53 $6.50 $13.74 $9.95 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES  B $8.80 $25.09 $9.25 $14.49 $11.83 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES  B $10.10 $21.62 $12.05 $15.41 $14.00 $9.11 NO BID

2" SERIES C $4.05 $4.24 $3.95 $12.88 $6.11 $4.79 NO BID

3" SERIES C $6.15 $6.78 $4.95 $13.37 $7.11 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES C $7.10 $9.90 $7.75 $14.13 $10.11 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES C $9.05 $13.54 $11.15 $15.10 $12.95 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES C $10.40 $25.12 $15.25 $16.28 $15.33 $9.11 NO BID

2" SERIES D $4.20 $10.75 $5.75 $12.97 $6.50 $4.19 NO BID

3" SERIES D $6.35 $14.07 $5.75 $13.59 $7.78 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES D $7.30 $11.27 $9.25 $14.53 $10.89 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES D $9.30 $15.86 $13.20 $15.48 $14.17 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES D $10.70 $49.72 $18.20 $17.18 $16.78 $9.11 NO BID

5" SERIES E (HIGHWAY) $9.50 $25.00 $16.96 $16.33 $15.56 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES E (HIGHWAY) $10.95 $25.00 $18.95 $18.06 $18.40 $9.11 NO BID

"LOWER CASE" LETTERS:

6" SERIES B $11.70 $39.50 $12.50 $15.41 $14.00 $9.11 NO BID

3" SERIES B $6.90 $15.75 $6.75 $13.15 $6.50 $4.80 NO BID
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BLACK (NON-REFLECTIVE) LETTERS 

AND NUMBERS

The following letters and numbers are to be 

constructed of BLACK 3M ENGINEER 

GRADE REFLECTIVE SHEETING and are 

to be PRESSURE SENSITIVE.

PRICE PER PACK OF 25 COUNT

2" SERIES  B $3.70 $2.95 $2.25 $12.62 $3.11 $4.19 NO BID

3" SERIES  B $5.60 $4.44 $2.95 $12.91 $4.00 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES  B $6.50 $5.16 $3.75 $13.30 $4.94 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES  B $8.40 $12.28 $4.50 $13.80 $6.11 $7.65 NO BID

6" SERIES  B $9.50 $12.81 $5.45 $14.42 $7.56 $9.11 NO BID

2" SERIES C $3.85 $3.23 $2.95 $12.74 $3.39 $4.19 NO BID

3" SERIES C $5.80 $4.44 $3.50 $13.05 $4.33 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES C $6.70 $5.76 $4.15 $13.55 $5.33 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES C $8.65 $7.17 $5.15 $14.20 $6.61 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES C $9.70 $13.96 $6.25 $15.01 $8.22 $9.11 NO BID

2" SERIES D $3.98 $10.75 $3.15 $12.88 $3.72 $4.19 NO BID

3" SERIES D $5.98 $6.90 $4.25 $13.20 $4.72 $4.80 NO BID

4" SERIES D $6.88 $6.38 $4.95 $13.82 $5.78 $5.74 NO BID

5" SERIES D $8.88 $8.40 $5.95 $14.62 $7.17 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES D $9.90 $23.90 $7.10 $15.64 $8.89 $9.11 NO BID

5" SERIES (E HIGHWAY) $9.10 $25.00 $6.25 $15.02 $7.78 $7.63 NO BID

6" SERIES (E HIGHWAY) $10.20 $25.00 $6.95 $16.18 $9.67 $9.11 NO BID

"LOWER CASE LETTERS" :

6" SERIES B $10.90 $39.25 $5.50 $14.42 $7.55 $9.11 NO BID

3" SERIES B $6.50 $15.50 $2.95 $12.91 $4.00 $4.80 NO BID

MINIMUM ORDER OF SIGNS FOR NO 

SETUP FEE:
10 SIGNS IDENTICAL

10 ONLY APPLIES 

TO NON STOCK 

SIGNS

50 20 25 PER LAYOUT

SETUP FEES FOR THE FOLLOWING 

SIZE SIGNS:

12" X 18" $25.00 $35.00 $20.00 $6.36 NO BID NO BID $25.00

18" X 18" $30.00 $35.00 $20.00 $9.54 NO BID NO BID $25.00

18" X 24" $40.00 $35.00 $20.00 $12.72 NO BID NO BID $30.00

24" X 24" $40.00 $35.00 $20.00 $16.96 NO BID NO BID $30.00

24" X 30" $40.00 $35.00 $20.00 $21.20 NO BID NO BID $40.00

30" X 30" $40.00 $35.00 $25.00 $26.50 NO BID NO BID $40.00

MINIMUM DOLLAR AMOUNT OF 

ORDER, IF ANY
$2,500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 __ $100.00 $0.00

NUMBER OF DAYS BETWEEN ORDER 

AND DELIVERY ON SITE
30- 40 DAYS 18 30 30 10-14 DAYS

10-15 CUSTOM 

PRODUCTS

IF YOU CANNOT HOLD YOUR PRICES 

FOR ONE FULL YEAR, YOU WILL 

GUARANTEE THESE PRICES TO 

REMAIN IN EFFECT UNTIL:

DATE YOUR BID PRICES EXPIRE: 2/24/2019 END OF CONTRACT 2 YEARS 12/31/2017
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NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
Y Y Y Y Y Y N

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION 

(Y/N):
N Y Y N N N N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED N Y Y N N N Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER 

STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL 

PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON 

COUNTY

Y Y N N N N Y

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y N

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y Y N

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
Y Y Y N Y Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:
INSURANCE 

EXPIRED

HAVE LETTER 

STATING NO 

PERONAL 

PROPERTY 

OWNED IN 

COUNTY BUT IT 

IS NOT 

NOTARIZED

NO INTIAL ON 

PAGE 1

NO SIGNATURE 

ON PAGE 17

PAGE 9 & 10 NOT 

APPLICABLE, 

WILL ABIDE BY 

THIS REQUEST IF 

COMPANY HIRES 

EMPLOYEES IN 

THE FURTURE

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS


