

HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018 5-14-2018	JEFFERSON COUNTY LUMBER	THE ELDEN CO. INC.	SHERWIN WILLIAMS	COTTON'S ACE HARDWARE	BUTLER SUPPLY INC	ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS CO INC	HOPSON LUMBER	QUILL
	P.O. BOX 935 1000 MAIN ST. IMPERIAL MO 63052	6556 JONAS PLACE ST. LOUIS MO 63134	506 BAILEY RD CRYSTAL CITY MO 63019	210 N MAIN ST. DESOTO MO 63020	4106 HUNT ROAD FARMINGTON MO 63640	2710 LOCUST ST. ST. LOUIS MO 63103	918 SOUTH MAIN ST DESOTO MO 63020	100 SCHELTER ROAD LINCOLNSH IRE IL 60069
BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED % DISCOUNT								
HAND TOOLS- shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles								
MANUFACTURER			N/A	RAZOR BACK	NO BID	CODE 3	SEE ATTACHMENT	
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL		MSRP OR LIST		
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%		43.3% OFF LIST	10% UNLESS IT IS A SALE ITEM (NET)	
POWER HAND TOOLS- drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.								
MANUFACTURER				DEWALT, MAKITA BLACK AND DECKER, IRWIN, ETC	GREENLEE, KLEIN, MILWAUKEE, IDEAL	AERVOE	SEE ATTACHMENT	
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL	CONTRACTOR PRICING	MSRP OR LIST		
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%	5%	25% OFF LIST	10% UNLESS IT IS A SALE ITEM (NET)	

HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018 5-14-2018	JEFFERSON COUNTY LUMBER	THE ELDEN CO. INC.	SHERWIN WILLIAMS	COTTON'S ACE HARDWARE	BUTLER SUPPLY INC	ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS CO INC	HOPSON LUMBER	QUILL
	P.O. BOX 935 1000 MAIN ST. IMPERIAL MO 63052	6556 JONAS PLACE ST. LOUIS MO 63134	506 BAILEY RD CRYSTAL CITY MO 63019	210 N MAIN ST. DESOTO MO 63020	4106 HUNT ROAD FARMINGTON MO 63640	2710 LOCUST ST. ST. LOUIS MO 63103	918 SOUTH MAIN ST DESOTO MO 63020	100 SCHELTER ROAD LINCOLNSH IRE IL 60069
MANUAL HAND TOOLS- hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.								
MANUFACTURER				CRAFTSMAN, IRWIN, CRESCENT, OESSEY, ETC	GREENLEE, KLEIN, MILWAUKEE, IDEAL	GATEWAY SAFETY FLARE	SEE ATTACHMENT	
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL	CONTRACTOR PRICING	MSRP OR LIST		
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%	5%	25% OFF LIST	10% UNLESS IT IS A SALE ITEM (NET)	
MISC. CONCRETE EQUIPMENT - REBAR CHAIRS, INSULATING, BLANKETS, PRE-MIX, ETC.								
MANUFACTURER				QUIKCRETE	NO BID		SEE ATTACHMENT	
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL				
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%			10% UNLESS IT IS A SALE ITEM (NET)	
FASTNERS - CHAINS, RATCHET STRAPS, ETC								
MANUFACTURER				CAMPBELL, HILLMAN, ETC	NO BID			
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL				
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%				
METAL MATERIAL - ANGLES, PLATES, PIPES, TUBING, ETC								
MANUFACTURER				STEEL CITY, CRESSLINE, GENOVA,	NO BID			
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING			OUR RETAIL				
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING			5%				

HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018 5-14-2018	JEFFERSON COUNTY LUMBER	THE ELDEN CO. INC.	SHERWIN WILLIAMS	COTTON'S ACE HARDWARE	BUTLER SUPPLY INC	ED ROEHR SAFETY PRODUCTS CO INC	HOPSON LUMBER	QUILL
	P.O. BOX 935 1000 MAIN ST. IMPERIAL MO 63052	6556 JONAS PLACE ST. LOUIS MO 63134	506 BAILEY RD CRYSTAL CITY MO 63019	210 N MAIN ST. DESOTO MO 63020	4106 HUNT ROAD FARMINGTON MO 63640	2710 LOCUST ST. ST. LOUIS MO 63103	918 SOUTH MAIN ST DESOTO MO 63020	100 SCHELTER ROAD LINCOLN SH IRE IL 60069
PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT - ANY COLOR								
MANUFACTURER			SHERWIN WILLIAMS	RUSTOLEUM, VALSPAR, KRYLON, KENNINGTON, CLARK . ROYAL ACE	KRYLON		SEE ATTACHMENT	
PRICING BID SHEET	CONTRACTOR PRICING		0.0TM2321 - YELLOW \$8.63 0.0TM2320 - WHITE \$8.67	OUR RETAIL	CONTRACTOR PRICING			
PERCENT DISCOUNT	CONTRACTOR PRICING		60%	5%	5%		10% UNLESS IT IS A SALE ITEM (NET)	
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS								
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED	Y	Y	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (Y/N):	Y	Y	N	N	Y	Y	SEE ATTACHED	N/A
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED	Y	Y	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY	Y	Y	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N)	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO:	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE	Y	N	N	Y	Y	Y	Y	N/A
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
COMMENTS:		SEE ATTACHED SERVICE CHARGE \$60 ONE MAN HOURLY RATE \$105 24 HOUR EMERGENCY SERVICE OVERTIME RATE \$153	SEE ATTACHED PAGES 9 & 10 NOT COMPLETE. STATE OF MO CONTRACT CC170426001				SEE ATTACHED	NO BID



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
 729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
 HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

**Specification
Contact:**

KURT WENGERT
 Department of Public Works
 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

**Contract
Contact:**

VICKIE PRATT
 Department of Administrative Services
 636-797-5380

**Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:**

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:
 UPON APPROVAL OF THE
 COUNTY COUNCIL AND
 COUNTY EXECUTIVE

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

**Vendor
Information:**

JEFFERSON COUNTY LBR. ED KOTTMEIER
 Company Name Authorized Agent (Print)

P.O. BOX 935, 1000 MAIN ST. Ed Kottmeier
 Address Signature

IMPERIAL, MO 63052 Pres.
 City/State/Zip Code Title

636-464-5350 4/17/18 43-0341580
 Telephone # Date Tax ID #

ek@jeffersoncountylumber.com 636-467-1506
 E-mail Fax #

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles		CONTRACTOR PRICING	CONTRACTOR PRICING
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.			
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.			
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.			
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.			
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.			
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color			



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND
SUPPLIES 2018

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract
Contact:

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:
UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

Vendor
Information:

<u>THE EDELEN CO. INC.</u>	<u>JAMES ROBBERS</u>
Company Name	Authorized Agent (Print)
<u>6556 JONAS PLACE</u>	<u>James Robbers</u>
Address	Signature
<u>ST. LOUIS, MO 63134</u>	<u>PROJECTS MANAGER</u>
City/State/Zip Code	Title
<u>314-521-2060</u>	<u>4/18/18</u>
Telephone #	Date
<u>JRobbers@EdeLenCoOR.com</u>	<u>43-1038053</u>
E-mail	Tax ID #
	<u>314-521-1783</u>
	Fax #

JR

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles			
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.			
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.			
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.			
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.			
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.			
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color			

GR



EDELEN DOOR & WINDOW

6556 JONAS PLACE
ST. LOUIS MO 63134
(314) 521-2060 FAX (314) 521-8512

2018 Service Hours and Rates

Hours:

Monday – Friday 7:00 am – 5:00 pm

Service Charge-----\$60.00

One Man Hourly Rate.....\$105.00

Additional Charges:

24 Hour Emergency Service

Overtime Rate-----\$153.00

Contact: Todd Edelen 314-713-5859

Jim Robbers 314-713-5861

Or call 314-521-2060 and leave message



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND
SUPPLIES 2018

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification

Contact:

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract

Contact:

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:
UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

Sherwin Williams

Company Name

Emily Sparks

Authorized Agent (Print)

506 Bailey Road

Address

Emily Sparks

Signature

Crystal City, MO 63019

City/State/Zip Code

Sales Representative

Title

314-791-0365

Telephone #

5-1-18

Date

34-0526850

Tax ID #

emily.r.sparks1s@gmail.com

E-mail

Fax #

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widgets Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED



MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Hand Tools — shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles	n/a		
Power Hand Tools — drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.			
Manual Hand Tools — hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.			
Misc. Concrete Equipment — Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.			
Fasteners — Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.			
Metal Material — Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.			
Pavement Marking Paint — Any Color	Sherwin Williams	0.0TM2321 - Yellow - \$8.63 0.0TM 2320 - White - \$8.67	60%

Alternative Bid



NOTICE OF CONTRACT RENEWAL

State Of Missouri
Office Of Administration
Division Of Purchasing
PO Box 809
Jefferson City, MO 65102-0809
<http://oa.mo.gov/purchasing>

CONTRACT NUMBER CC170426001	CONTRACT TITLE Paint and Paint Materials
AMENDMENT NUMBER 001	CONTRACT PERIOD March 1, 2018 through February 28, 2019
REQUISITION/REQUEST NUMBER N/A	SAM II VENDOR NUMBER/MissouriBUYS SYSTEM ID 3405268503 E / MB00108666
CONTRACTOR NAME AND ADDRESS The Sherwin-Williams Company 2401 Bernadette Drive Suite 205 Columbia, MO 65203	STATE AGENCY'S NAME AND ADDRESS State of Missouri Various State Agency Locations
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE OF MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS: Contract CC170426001 is hereby amended pursuant to the attached amendment #001 dated 2/8/18.	
BUYER Kristina Cramer	BUYER CONTACT INFORMATION Email: kristina.cramer@oa.mo.gov Phone: (573) 751-1695 Fax: (573) 526-9816
SIGNATURE OF BUYER 	DATE February 16, 2018
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING  Karen S. Boeger	

PRICING PAGE

<u>LINE ITEM</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>UNIT</u>	<u>1st RENEWAL PRICE</u>
CATEGORY A - TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT			
1	UNSPSC Code: 31211521 <i>Ready Mix Paint</i> Latex, White 1 - Gallon Brand: <u>Sherwin-Williams, Pro Park</u> Model No.: <u>B97WD2434</u>	1 Gallon	\$ <u>12.16</u>
2	UNSPSC Code: 31211521 <i>Ready Mix Paint</i> Latex, Yellow 1 - Gallon Brand: <u>Sherwin-Williams, Pro Park</u> Model No.: <u>B97WD2467</u>	1 Gallon	\$ <u>11.90</u>
3	UNSPSC Code: 31211521 <i>Ready Mix Paint</i> Latex, White 5 - Gallon Pail Brand: <u>Sherwin-Williams, Pro Park</u> Model No.: <u>B97WD2434</u>	5 Gallon Pail	\$ <u>60.50</u>
4	UNSPSC Code: 31211521 <i>Ready Mix Paint</i> Latex, Yellow 5 - Gallon Pail Brand: <u>Sherwin-Williams, Pro Park</u> Model No.: <u>B97WD2467</u>	5 Gallon Pail	\$ <u>59.50</u>
5	UNSPSC Code: 31211521 <i>Ready Mix Paint</i> Firm, Fixed Discount Firm, Fixed percentage discount to apply to all other Traffic Marking Paint and Paint Sizes	PCNT	40%



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
 729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
 HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification

Contact:

KURT WENGERT
 Department of Public Works
 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract

Contact:

VICKIE PRATT
 Department of Administrative Services
 636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

**Mail (3) Three
 Complete Copies
 With Vendor And
 Bid Information As
 Shown In Sample:**


<i>VENDOR NAME</i>	
<i>VENDOR ADDRESS</i>	
<i>CONTACT NUMBER</i>	DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI 729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100 HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100
<i>SEALED BID: (BID NAME)</i>	

Contract Term:

**UPON APPROVAL OF THE
 COUNTY COUNCIL AND
 COUNTY EXECUTIVE**

**Vendor
 Information:**

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

<u>COTTON'S ACE HARDWARE</u>	<u>JEFF SOLOMON</u>
Company Name	Authorized Agent (Print)
<u>210 N. MAZIN ST.</u>	
Address	Signature
<u>DR SOTO, MO 63020</u>	<u>STORE MANAGER</u>
City/State/Zip Code	Title
<u>636-586-3230</u>	<u>4/24/18</u>
Telephone #	Date
<u>ace16724@cottausinc.com</u>	<u>46-4293991</u>
E-mail	Tax ID #
	<u>636-586-4913</u>
	Fax #

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles	RAZOR BACK	OUR RETAIL	5%
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.	DEWALT, MAKITA BLACK & DECKER IRWIN, ETC		
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.	CRAFTSMAN, IRWIN CRESCENT BRESSA, ETC		
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.	QUICKCRETE.		
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.	CAMPBELL, HILLMAN ETC		
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.	STEEL CITY, CRESSLER, GENOVA		
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color	RUSTOLUIM, VALSPAN KRYLON, CLARK & KENSINGTON, ROYAL ACE		



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND
SUPPLIES 2018

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification

Contact:

KURT WENGERT

Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract

Contact:

VICKIE PRATT

Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor

Information:

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

Butler Supply, Inc.

Company Name

4106 Hunt Road

Address

Farmington, MO 63640

City/State/Zip Code

573-756-6492

Telephone #

dgault@butlersupply.com

E-mail

David Gault

Authorized Agent (Print)

Signature

Vice President

Title

05/15/2018

Date

430202827

Tax ID #

573-756-5208

Fax #

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles	NO BID		
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.	GREENLEE KLEIN MILWAUKEE IDEAL	Contractor Pricing	5%
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.	GREENLEE KLEIN MILWAUKEE IDEAL	Contractor Pricing	5%
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.	NO BID		
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.	NO BID		
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.	NO BID		
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color	KRYLON	Contractor Pricing	5%

ORIGINAL



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: **HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND
SUPPLIES 2018**

Date Issued: **4-12-2018**

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

**Specification
Contact:**

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

**Contract
Contact:**

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

**Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:**

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME
VENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER
DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100
SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:
UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

**Vendor
Information:**

Ed Roehr Safety Products Co., Inc.

Company Name

Authorized Agent (Print)

2716 Locust St.

Address

Signature

St. Louis, MO 63103

City/State/Zip Code

Title

(314) 533-9344

Telephone #

Date

Tax ID #

scott@edroehrsafety.com

E-mail

Fax #

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles	Code 3	MSRP or List	43.3% off List
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.	AERVOE	MSRP or List	25% off List
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.	Gateway Safety Flare	MSRP or List	25% off List
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.			
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.			
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.			
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color			



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
 729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
 HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

BID #: 18-0035

Invitation for Bid: **HIGHWAY MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES 2018**

Date Issued: 4-12-2018

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MAY 15, 2018, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

**Specification
Contact:**

KURT WENGERT
 Department of Public Works
 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

**Contract
Contact:**

VICKIE PRATT
 Department of Administrative Services
 636-797-5380

**Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:**

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER

**DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
 JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
 729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
 HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100**

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

Contract Term:

**UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE**

**Vendor
Information:**

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing by the County.

Hopson Lumber Co.

Company Name

Stoke Wischmeier

Authorized Agent (Print)

918 South Main St

Address

Stoke Wischmeier

Signature

DeSoto MO 63020

City/State/Zip Code

President

Title

636-586-3311

Telephone #

05/15/18

Date

43-0328760

Tax ID #

sales@hopsonlumberco.com

E-mail

636-586-6700

Fax #

AFFIDAVIT OF WORK AUTHORIZATION

(Continued)

CURRENT BUSINESS ENTITY STATUS

I certify that Hopson Lumber Co. (Business Entity Name) **MEETS** the definition of a business entity as defined in section 285.525, RSMo., pertaining to section 285.530, RSMo., as stated above.

Stokely R. Wischmeier

Authorized Business Entity
Representative's Name
(Please Print)

Stokely R. Wischmeier

Authorized Business Entity
Representative's Signature

Hopson Lumber Co.

Business Entity Name

05/15/2018

Date

As a business entity, the grantee, sub grantee, contractor, or subcontractor must perform/provide the following. The grantee, sub grantee, contractor, or subcontractor shall check each to verify completion/submission:

- ☒ * Enroll and participate in the E-Verify federal work authorization program
(Website: <http://www.dhs.gov/e-verify>;
Phone: 888-464-4218; Email: e-verify@dhs.gov) with respect to the employees hired after enrollment in the program who are proposed to work in connection with the services required herein;

AND

- ☒ * Provide documentation affirming said company's/individual's enrollment and participation in the E-Verify federal work authorization program. Documentation shall include a page from the E-Verify Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) listing the grantee's, subgrantee's, contractor's, or subcontractor's name and the MOU signature page completed and signed, at minimum, by the grantee, subgrantee, contractor, or subcontractor and the Department of Homeland Security – Verification Division; (if the signature page of the MOU lists the grantee's, subgrantee's, contractor's, or subcontractor's name, then no additional pages of the MOU must be submitted).

* Hopson Lumber Co. would be exempt from the E-Verify federal work authorization program because we do not perform any substantial duties applicable to a federal contract. At most, we would deliver to a jobsite but perform no duties.

PRICING SHEET

Bidder shall complete spaces provided for materials or supplies bid and percentage discount from specified price list.

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Widgets	ABC Company, Widget Manufacturer, and Widgets ABC Company	Manufacturers retail sheet (included)	5%

BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

MATERIAL OR SUPPLY	MANUFACTURER	PRICING BID SHEET	PERCENT DISCOUNT
Handle Tools – shovels, rakes, axes, scrapers, breaker bars, etc. including replacement handles	See attachment		10% unless it is a sale item (net).
Power Hand Tools – drills, grease guns, grinders, saws, etc.	See attachment		10% unless it is a sale item (net)
Manual Hand Tools – hammers, saws, pliers, wrenches, screwdrivers, etc.	See attachment		10% unless it is a sale item (net)
Misc. Concrete Equipment – Rebar chairs, insulating blankets, pre-mix, etc.	See attachment		10% unless it is a sale item (net).
Fasteners – Chains, Ratchet Straps, etc.			
Metal Material – Angles, Plates, Pipes, Tubing, etc.			
Pavement Marking Paint – Any Color	See attachment		10% unless it is a sale item (net)

HOPSON LUMBER COMPANY
918 SOUTH MAIN STREET
DESOTO, MO 63020

Material or Supply

Manufacturer

Pricing Bid Sheet

✓ 1. Handle Tools

Sallyer, True
Temper, Tru Pro.

See attachment

✓ 2. Power Hand Tools

DeWalt, Skil
Milwaukee,
Bosch, Dremel

✓ ✓

✓ 3. Manual Hand Tools

Stanley, Estwing
Vaughn, Lutz

✓ ✓

✓ 4. Misc. Concrete

Quickrete

✓ ✓

✓ 5. Pavement Marking
Paint

Krylon

✓ ✓

HOPSON LUMBER COMPANY
918 SOUTH MAIN STREET
DESOTO, MO 63020

Handle Tools

<u>Item</u>	<u>Mfg'er</u>	<u>Price</u>
Round Point Shovel	Salyer	29.99
Drain Spade	Salyer	18.99
Post Hole Digger H/Duty	Salyer	47.99
Garden Shovel	True Temper	15.99
Single Bit Ax	Salyer	29.99
Temper	Tru Pro.	31.49
6" Hoe	Salyer	22.99

Power Hand Tools

Item	Mfg'er	Price-Net
7/4 Circular Saw	Skil	49.99
3/8" Keyless Drill	DeWalt	69.99
4 1/2" Grinder	DeWalt	59.99
7/4" Circular Saw	DeWalt	124.99
Reciprocal Saw	Milwaukee	129.99
3.8amp Dremel	Dremel	134.99
80amp Rotary Hammer	Bosch	199.99

Manual Hand Tools

[illegible]

CONCRETE

5/2018

DESCRIPTION	# Per Bag		
Portland Cement	94	15.99	NET Sale
Mortar Type N	70	14.99	Net Sale
Premix 5000 Mix	80	6.99	
Premix Concrete	80	4.25	NET Sale
Premix Mortar	80	7.15	
← Premix Topping	80	6.99	
Vinyl Patch	40	14.99	
Driveway Patch	60	13.30	
Mississippi Lime	50	12.99	
All Purp. Stone		3.50	NET Sale
Pond Pebbles		4.75	NET Sale
Tube Sand	60	4.99	
Silica Sand	75	7.99	
Play Sand	50	5.99	
Sona Tube 6" x 12'		1.90 per ft.	14.99 full
Sona Tube 8" x 12'		2.40 per ft.	18.99 full
Sona Tube 12" x 12'		3.99 per ft.	35.99 full
Mortar Colors:			
97A Super Black		17.99	
10A Light Buff		11.99	
20A Dark Buff		N/S	
37A Deep Brown		14.99	
44A Deep Red		13.99	

HOPSON LUMBER COMPANY
918 SOUTH MAIN STREET
DESOTO, MO 63020

Marking Paint

<u>Item</u>	<u>Mfg'er</u>	<u>Price</u>
Spray Marking Paint	- Krylon	- 5.99/Spray Can