
BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

IN AN EMERGENCY CAN WE CALL 

YOU AFTER REGULAR HOURS
YES YES 

NAME OF PARTY TO CALL
TONY 

BARBAROTTO
MIKE HILL

TELEPHONE (618) 781-3571 (573) 380-0719

MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED:

ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES: 

COMMENTS

15" NO BID $9.18

18" NO BID $13.03

21" NO BID $17.91

24" NO BID $23.64

30" NO BID $33.87

36" NO BID $48.07

COMMENTS: A-2000 22' LENGTH

15" $8.45 NO BID

18" $11.10 NO BID

21" NO BID NO BID

24" $17.95 NO BID

30" $28.88 NO BID

30" $31.16 NO BID

36" $37.88 NO BID

42" $52.98 NO BID

48" $60.71 NO BID

54" NO BID NO BID

60" $91.96 NO BID

THERMOPLASTIC CULVERT PIPE (PAGE 11) 

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

POLYVINYL CHLORIDE (PVC) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 11)

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (DOUBLE WALLED) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 12)

POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (TRIPLE WALLED) - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 12)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

15" $7.69 NO BID $8.25

18" $10.19 NO BID $11.35

21" NO BID NO BID N/A

24" $16.12 NO BID $18.73

30" $26.03 NO BID $28.73

36" $30.70 NO BID $35.12

42" $40.30 NO BID $48.00

48" $49.10 NO BID $53.90

54" NO BID NO BID N/A

60" $77.50 NO BID N/A

15" NO BID

18" NO BID

21" NO BID

24" NO BID

30" NO BID

36" NO BID

42" NO BID

48" NO BID

54" NO BID

60" NO BID

66" NO BID

72" NO BID

84" NO BID

IN AN EMERGENCY CAN WE CALL 

YOU AFTER REGULAR HOURS
YES

NAME OF PARTY TO CALL
KEITH BUSSEN OR 

TOM GRECO

TELEPHONE
(314) 913-2737

(314) 575-6276

MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED: YES

ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES: NONE

COMMENTS

PRICING BASED 

UPON FULL 

LOADS, SMALL 

DELIVERY 

CHARGES WILL 

BE ADDED TO 

ALL 

SMALL/SHORT 

LOAD - VARIES 

BASED UPON 

SIZE/QTY/ 

LOCATION.

- PAILS OF 

LUBRICANT AND 

SEWERTITE AS 

NEEDED - $46/ 

PAIL

- MINIMUM 3 

WEEKS NOTICE 

ON ELLIPTICAL 

PURCHASES.

- MINIMUM 3 DAY 

NOTICE FOR ALL 

SCHEDULED 

DELIVERIES

POLYETHTLENE PIPE - CORRUGATED - COST PER FOOT (PAGE 13)

POLYETHTLENE PIPE - STEEL REINFORCED - COST PER FOOT  (PAGE 13) 

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE -  (PAGE 14) 



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

15" N/A NO BID 

18" N/A NO BID 

21" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

54" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

15" $104.00 NO BID 

18" $137.60 NO BID 

21" $200.00 NO BID 

24" $200.00 NO BID 

30" $291.20 NO BID 

36" $421.20 NO BID 

42" $528.80 NO BID 

48" $656.00 NO BID 

54" $848.40 NO BID 

60" $1,018.40 NO BID 

72" $1,440.00 NO BID 

84" $2,287.20 NO BID 

96" $2,870.00 NO BID 

15" $330.00 NO BID 

18" $363.00 NO BID 

21" $462.00 NO BID 

24" $495.00 NO BID 

30" $682.00 NO BID 

36" $1,116.50 NO BID 

42" $985.00 NO BID 

48" $1,172.00 NO BID 

54" $1,667.00 NO BID 

60" $1,930.00 NO BID 

72" UPON REQUEST NO BID 

84" UPON REQUEST NO BID 

96" UPON REQUEST NO BID 

ROUND PIPES CLASS III PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

15" N/A NO BID 

18" N/A NO BID 

21" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

54" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

15" $126.00 NO BID 

18" $163.60 NO BID 

21" $210.00 NO BID 

24" $282.80 NO BID 

30" $437.20 NO BID 

36" $715.20 NO BID 

42" $794.88 NO BID 

48" $952.00 NO BID 

54" $1,208.00 NO BID 

60" $1,452.80 NO BID 

72" $2,160.00 NO BID 

84" UPON REQUEST NO BID 

96" UPON REQUEST NO BID 

15" N/A NO BID 

18" N/A NO BID 

21" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

54" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

CLASS V PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

18" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

18" $402.40 NO BID 

24" $484.00 NO BID 

30" $672.80 NO BID 

36" $807.60 NO BID 

42" $1,037.60 NO BID 

48" $1,256.00 NO BID 

60" $1,836.80 NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

18" $511.85 NO BID 

24" $654.10 NO BID 

30" $837.75 NO BID 

36" $1,392.70 NO BID 

42" $1,769.60 NO BID 

48" $2,190.00 NO BID 

60" $4,223.70 NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

18" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - ELLIPTICAL PIPES (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS III PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15) 

CLASS V PRICE PER 7.5' SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

18" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

18" N/A NO BID 

24" N/A NO BID 

30" N/A NO BID 

36" N/A NO BID 

42" N/A NO BID 

48" N/A NO BID 

60" N/A NO BID 

72" N/A NO BID 

84" N/A NO BID 

96" N/A NO BID 

IN AN EMERGENCY CAN WE CALL 

YOU AFTER REGULAR HOURS
YES YES YES

NAME OF PARTY TO CALL MIKE HILL GREG BRAUNER GREG BRAUNER

TELEPHONE (573) 380-0719 (573) 690-1533 (573) 690-1533

MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED: YES NO NO 

ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES: $4,000.00

COMMENTS

CORRUGATED METALLIC CULVERT PIPE (PAGE 16)

CLASS V PRICE PER 8' SECTION (PAGE 15)

CLASS V FLARED END SECTION (PAGE 15)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

15" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $12.45 $11.57 $12.28

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $12.45 $11.57 $12.28

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $74.84 $53.55 $95.10

18" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $14.94 $13.69 $14.53

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $14.94 $13.69 $14.53

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $97.04 $69.40 $123.25

21" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $17.43 $16.30 $17.30

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $17.43 $16.30 $17.30

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $116.45 $83.50 $148.30

24" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $19.92 $18.26 $19.38

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $19.92 $18.26 $19.38

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $144.83 $103.55 $184.00

30" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $24.90 $22.41 $23.79

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $24.90 $33.62 $35.84

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $264.35 $174.70 $335.85

36" COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $40.67 $36.80 $39.10

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $40.67 $55.20 $58.65

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $426.12 $281.55 $541.40

42" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $47.31 $43.12 $45.82

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $47.31 $64.68 $68.73

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $803.73 $666.00 $1,021.20

48" COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $53.95 $49.12 $52.19

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $53.95 $73.68 $78.29

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $935.34 $760.70 $1,188.45

COMMENTS: 
(12' WIDE CONN 

BANDS) 

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION) (PAGE 17)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

54" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $71.38 $66.48 $70.49

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $71.38 $132.96 $140.98

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,108.54 $935.55 $1,408.50

60" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $79.12 $72.79 $77.18

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $79.12 $145.58 $154.36

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,662.82 $1,403.40 $2,112.75

66" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $86.86 $79.43 $84.22

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $86.86 $158.86 $168.44

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,787.52 $1,508.65 $2,271.20

72" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $94.60 $86.49 $91.70

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $94.60 $172.98 $183.40

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,981.54 $1,672.40 $2,517.70

84" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $110.08 $100.68 $106.74

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $110.08 $201.36 $213.48

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,341.80 $1,976.45 $2,975.45

96" COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $126.42 $114.87 $121.79

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $126.42 $229.74 $243.58

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $3,106.70 $2,622.00 $3,947.30

108" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $181.46 $164.51 $174.42

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $181.46 $329.02 $348.84

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A N/A

120" COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $201.24 $182.60 $193.60

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $201.24 $365.20 $387.20

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A N/A

METALLIC COATED RIVETED PIPE (3" x 1") " CORRUGATION)  (PAGE 17)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

17 x 13 - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $13.05 $12.31 $13.06

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $13.05 $12.31 $13.06

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $75.28 $50.85 $95.65

21 x 15- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $15.66 $14.43 $15.31

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $15.66 $14.43 $15.31

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $88.28 $59.60 $112.20

24 x 18"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $18.27 $17.12 $18.17

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $18.27 $17.12 $18.17

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $107.41 $72.55 $136.50

28 x 20"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $20.88 $19.23 $20.41

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $20.88 $19.23 $20.41

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $126.54 $85.45 $160.75

35 x 24"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $35.67 $31.92 $33.92

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $35.67 $47.88 $50.88

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $212.02 $159.45 $269.40

42 x 29"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $42.63 $37.92 $40.29

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $42.63 $56.88 $60.44

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $335.35 $236.75 $426.10

49 x 33"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $49.59 $44.40 $47.18

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $49.59 $66.60 $70.77

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $577.83 $425.60 $734.20

57 x 38"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $56.55 $50.48 $53.64

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $56.55 $75.72 $80.46

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $720.54 $608.15 $915.50

METALLIC COASTED RIVETED PIPE ARCH) 2 2/3" x1/2"   CORRUGATION) (PAGE 18)



BID TABULATION - ROADYWAY DRAINAGE PIPE

MIDWEST 

MUNICIPAL 

SUPPLY

FRED WEBER 

REINFORCED 

CONCRETE 

PRODUCTS

CONTECH 

ENGINEERED 

SOLUTIONS

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

METAL 

CULVERTS INC

40 TUCKER DR

CASEYVILLE IL 

62232

12950 GRAVIOS RD

ST. LOUIS MO 63127

140 AIRPORT IND 

DR SIKESTON MO 

63801

PO BOX 330

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

PO BOX 330 

JEFFERSON CITY 

MO 65102

 ROADWAY DRAINAGE PIPE 

2018

1-9-2018

60 x 46" - COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $73.87 $68.31 $72.42

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $73.87 $136.62 $144.84

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,028.15 $867.75 $1,306.35

66 x 51"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $81.88 $74.87 $79.38

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $81.88 $149.74 $158.76

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,357.96 $1,146.10 $1,725.40

73 x 55"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $89.89 $81.76 $86.68

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $89.89 $163.52 $173.36

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,822.19 $1,537.90 $2,315.25

81 x 59"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $97.90 $89.23 $94.60

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $97.90 $178.46 $189.20

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,919.19 $1,619.75 $2,438.50

95 x 67"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $113.92 $104.83 $11.14

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $113.92 $209.66 $222.28

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,147.83 $1,812.75 $2,729.00

112 x 75"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $130.83 $120.43 $127.69

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $130.83 $240.86 $255.38

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,782.44 $2,348.35 $3,535.35

128 x 83"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $187.79 $171.64 $181.98

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $187.79 $343.28 $363.96

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A N/A

142 x 91"- COATING TYPE: NO BID GALV/ ALUM II GALVANIZED ALUMINIZED

COST PER FOOT: NO BID $208.26 $194.64 $206.36

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $208.26 $389.28 $412.72

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A N/A

15" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $16.35 $14.27

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $16.35 $14.27

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $74.84 $53.55

18" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $19.62 $16.88

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $19.62 $16.88

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $97.04 $69.40

21" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $22.89 $20.10

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $22.89 $20.10

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $116.45 $83.50

24" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $26.16 $22.51

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $26.16 $22.51

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $144.83 $103.50

30" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $32.70 $27.64

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $32.70 $41.46

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $264.35 $174.70

36" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $53.41 $43.70

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $53.41 $65.55

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $426.12 $281.55

42" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $62.13 $51.21

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $62.13 $76.82

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $803.73 $666.00

48" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $70.85 $58.33

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $70.85 $87.50

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $935.34 $760.70
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54" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $102.92 $78.50

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $102.92 $157.00

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,108.54 $935.55

60" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $114.08 $85.95

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $114.08 $171.90

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,662.82 $1,403.40

66" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $125.24 $93.79

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $125.24 $187.58

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,787.52 $1,508.65

72" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $136.40 $102.12

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $136.40 $204.24

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,981.54 $1,672.40

84" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $158.72 $118.87

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $158.72 $237.74

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,341.80 $1,976.45

96" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $182.28 $135.63

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $182.28 $271.26

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $3,106.70 $2,622.00

108" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $263.75 $194.24

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $263.75 $388.48

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A

120" - COST PER FOOT NO BID $292.50 $215.60

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $292.50 $431.20

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A
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17X13 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $16.80 $15.18

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $16.80 $15.18

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $75.28 $50.85

21X15 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $20.16 $17.79

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $20.16 $17.79

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $88.28 $59.60

24X18 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $23.52 $21.11

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $23.52 $21.11

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $107.41 $72.55

28X20 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $26.88 $23.72

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $26.88 $23.72

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $126.54 $85.45

35X24 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $45.92 $37.91

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $45.92 $56.87

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $212.02 $159.45

42X29 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $54.88 $45.03

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $54.88 $67.55

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $335.35 $236.75

49X33 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $63.84 $52.73

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $63.84 $79.10

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $577.83 $425.60

57X38 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $72.80 $59.95

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $72.80 $89.93

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $720.54 $608.15
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60X46 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $106.24 $80.65

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $106.24 $161.30

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,028.15 $867.75

66X51 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $117.76 $88.40

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $117.76 $176.80

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,357.96 $1,146.10

73X55 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $129.28 $96.53

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $129.28 $193.06

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,822.19 $1,537.90

81X59 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $140.80 $105.35

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $140.80 $210.70

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $1,919.19 $1,619.75

95X67 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $163.84 $123.77

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $163.84 $247.54

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,147.83 $1,812.75

112X75 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $188.16 $142.20

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $188.16 $284.40

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID $2,782.44 $2,348.35

128X83 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $270.08 $202.66

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $270.08 $405.32

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A

142X91 - COST PER FOOT NO BID $299.52 $229.81

CONNECTING BANDS (EA): NO BID $299.52 $459.62

FLARED END SECTIONS (EA): NO BID N/A N/A

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
Y Y N Y Y

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION 

(Y/N):
Y Y N N N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y Y Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED 

LETTER STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN 

JEFFERSON COUNTY

Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
Y Y Y Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:

SUBMITTED 

ADDITIONAL 

PRICING FOR 

ALUMINIZED SEE 

NEXT 
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REQUIRED DOCUMENTS


