BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO| WINTER BROTHERS |  BRM LLC (BASIC FRED WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MILL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
2-26-2019 6800 BUSSEN ROAD | 8799 TRAUTMAN | o P INGS RD | PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1053 HEADQUARTERS
EUREKA MO 63025 | QUARRY RDPEVELY| 5 sk spriNGS MO MO 63052 llgér\wc:ﬁEﬁc'Jw 6||3_(|)_2|;D “Fgéﬁ%'ﬁy ella_gng g:sngsg/:ATg eRaTogé 1303?3326\!\\/1(')0653?5731 BONNE TERREMO | MILL RD MARYLAND | - PARK FENTON MO
MO 63070 63051 63628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026
In emergency, can we call you after NO NO NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
regular hours? Yes or No
RESOURCE
INTERGRATION
CENTER (RIC)
ORDER
PLACEMENT
STONE
RANDY RANDY DIANNA K (F) - FESTUS - 838
If yes name party to call CHUCK SMREKER HACKWORTH HACKWORTH JOHNSTON CHRIS MCKIM DWAYNE HOLST VFW DRIVE, SCOTT LACY
FESTUS MO 63028
(S) - SOUTH - 4200
NEW
BAUMGARTNER,
ST. LOUIS MO
314-660-1852
telephone number 314-267-5828 314-435-1707 314-435-1707 314-402-3983 (314)-347-7037 (573)-579-1074 (866)-739-8855 MOBILE
BID ALL AVAILABLE
CATEGORIES CRUSHED
STONE PRODUCTS
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
" FESTUS - NO BID
1/4 - - $11.30 N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID N/A
" FESTUS - $11.00
3/8 $10.20 $10.90 $10.20 $9.50 $8.75 N/A $8.55 SOUTH - NO BID $10.00
" FESTUS - $11.00
1/2 $11.40 $9.20 $11.40 $9.50 N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID $10.00
" FESTUS - $7.95
3/4 $10.10 $9.40 $10.10 $8.75 $8.95 N/A SOUTH - $9.00 $8.60
" FESTUS - $7.50
1 $10.10 $9.40 $10.10 $8.75 $7.65 $8.95 $6.90 (BROWN) SOUTH - $9.00 $7.50
" FESTUS - NO BID
1&1/4 - - - N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID $7.50
" FESTUS - $7.50
1&1/2 $8.80 - $8.80 $7.50 N/A N/A SOUTH - $9.00 $7.50
" FESTUS - NO BID
1&3/4 - - - N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID $7.50
" FESTUS - $7.00
2 $8.80 $8.10 $8.80 $7.50 $7.25 $7.65 $6.20 SOUTH - $8.00 $7.25
3" - - - $8.00 $7.65 $6.20 FESTUS - NO BID $7.25

SOUTH - NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO| WINTER BROTHERS |  BRM LLC (BASIC FRED WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MILL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
2-26-2019 6800 BUSSEN ROAD | 8799 TRAUTMAN | o P INGS RD | PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1053 HEADQUARTERS
EUREKA MO 63025 | QUARRY RDPEVELY| 5 sk spriNGS MO MO 63052 llgér\wc:ﬁjc')w P “Fgéﬁ%'ﬁy pesieg g:sngsg/:ATg eRaTo;é 1303?3326\!\\/1(')0653225731 BONNE TERREMO | MILL RD MARYLAND | - PARK FENTON MO
MO 63070 63051 63628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026
" FESTUS - $7.00
4 $8.80 $8.10 - $7.65 N/A SOUTH.s800 |7+25 (6x2 CLEAN)
" FESTUS - NO BID
5 - - - N/A $5.80 SOUTH - NO BID $7.25
" FESTUS - NO BID
6 - - - $7.75 $8.40 N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID N/A
MINUS
Cost per Ton
—
FESTUS - $1.00
" SCREENING $1.00
1/4 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 $1.00 $2.50 $3.40 SOUTH - $1.00 SCREENINGS
SCREENING
" FESTUS - NO BID
3/8 $6.10 $6.00 $6.10 N/A $4.35 SOUTH - NO BID N/A
" FESTUS - NO BID
12 - - - N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID N/A
" FESTUS - $4.25
3/4 $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.50 N/A SOUTH - $4.25 $5.00
" FESTUS - $4.25
1 $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 $6.00 SOUTH - $4.25 $5.00
" FESTUS - NO BID
1&1/4 - - - N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID N/A
" FESTUS - NO BID
1&1/2 - - - $5.25 N/A N/A SOUTH - NO BID $5.00
" FESTUS - $4.95
2 $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 $6.20 SOUTH - $4.95 $5.00
" FESTUS - NO BID
2&1/2 - - - N/A N/A SOUTH - NG BID N/A
" FESTUS - NO BID
3 - - - $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 N/A SOUTH - NO BID N/A
" FESTUS - $5.25
4 $6.00 $5.70 - N/A $6.20 SOUTH - $5.25 $5.00
TV : FESTUS - $5.25
1/2" - 4" Minus Backfill $6.00 $5.70 - $4.00 $3.90 SOUTH - $5.25 N/A
COST PER TON
MODOT TYPE 1 OR 5 BASE $6.40 $5.90 $6.40 $13.00 $5.25 $5.50 $6.20 9525 (FESTUS OR $5.20

SOUTH)




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO | WINTER BROTHERS | BRM LLC (BASIC | -pn \WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MiLL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
-26- 8799 TRAUTMAN 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1053 HEADQUARTERS
o et o | QUARRY BB PEvLY | |00 A oz | oo | beaosamo o | touossy | OMWNETERREMO | ML RDMARYLAID | pAfk FENTON o
MO 63070 63051 63628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
COST PER TON
P-GRAVEL - - - $9.00 N/A N/A $13.00 $11.00 N/A NO BID N/A
SCREENED GRAVEL - - - $8.50 N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A
CREEK GRAVEL - - - N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A
B-GRAVEL - - - $6.00 N/A N/A $10.00 $26.10 N/A NO BID N/A
C-GRAVEL - - - $16.50 N/A N/A $20.00 $11.95 N/A NO BID $17.45
$17.45 (C GRAVEL)
LIMESTONE
CONCRETE ROCK - - - $16.50 N/A N/A N/A - $8.25 NO BID GRADE D MODOT
$0.50
FILTER SAND - - - FILL SAND $6.00 N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A
SAND - $10.00 - $19.50 N/A N/A $17.50 $12.00 N/A NO BID $17.45
$7.50 TOP SOIL $30/ SINGLE BANK $8.00
$5.50 FILL DIRT AXLE LOAD PULLVERIZED
DIRT - - . NO BID
3" x 6" GRAVEL $6.50 NIA $45/LADEM AXLE| AND SCREENED N/A ° N/A
$8.50 LOAD $11
MINIMUM LOAD
ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES $ - . $1,500.00 CHARGE IS $30
AFTER HOURS BA;:EIA'MELZOTNON
COMMENTS: (?:i’;IGNEC; THSE MATERIALS
ABOVE
IF YOU CAN NOT HOLD YOUR
PRICE FOR A FULL YEAR, YOU PRICES GOOD FOR
WILL GUARANTEE THIS PRICE TO N/A N/A N/A N/A 12/31/2019 2/28/2020 2/28/2020 ONE YEAR.
REMAIN IN EFFECT UNITL:
HAUL CHART MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR
STOCK PILE DELIVERY SEE NOTES BELOW
0-5 miles $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $3.00 $3.75 $4.00 $3.25 $3.75
5-10 miles $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $3.50 $4.25 $4.50 $3.50 $4.25
10-15 miles $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $4.00 $4.95 $5.00 $3.75 $5.00
15-20 miles $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 $5.00 QUOTE BY JOB | QUOTEBY JOB $4.00 $6.25
20-25 miles $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 $5.50 $4.50 $7.00




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO | WINTER BROTHERS |  BRM LLC (BASIC | -p-b \WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MILL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
8799 TRAUTMAN 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1053 HEADQUARTERS
2-26-2019 6800 BUSSEN ROAD | 1 oo "0 ey v | HOUSE SPRINGS RD | PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL | 1195 SMIZER MILL RD | 1195 SMIZER MILLRD | 12520 STATERT 21 13088 GRAVIOSRDST.| - v o on Bt | eRE e s P e 1 0l 2t
EUREKA MO 63025 MO 63070 HOUSE ggg;xjes MO MO 63052 FENTON MO 63026 | FENTON MO 63026 | DESOTO MO 63020 LOUIS MO 63127 53628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 3025
25-30 miles $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 $6.00 $4.95 $7.75
30-35 miles $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 $7.00 $5.25 $9.00
35-40 miles $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 $7.50 N/A $10.00
40-45 miles - - - $8.00 N/A $11.00
45-50 miles - - - $8.50 N/A $12.00
over 50 miles - - - $9.00 N/A CALL FOR

QUOTE




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO | WINTER BROTHERS | BRM LLC (BASIC | -p-n \WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MiLL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
2-26-2019 6800 BUSSEN ROAD |  E799 TRAUTMAN |5 1o SpRINGS RD | PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1058 HEADQUARTERS
UREKAMO 63075 | QUARRY RDPEVELY | [ice coniceno | MoG082 || FENTONMOGSizs | FENTONMOG3026 | DESOTOMO&%20 | LOISMOSsizr | EONMETERREMO | MILLRDMARYLAND | PARK FENTON MO
MO 63070 63051 63628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026
ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR ON
SITE DELIVERY

0-5 miles $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $3.00 $3.75 $4.00 $3.25 $4.00 $3.75 $2.25

5-10 miles $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $3.50 $4.25 $4.50 $3.50 $4.25 $4.25 $2.50

10-15 miles $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $4.00 $4.95 $5.00 $3.75 $5.50 $5.00 $2.85

15-20 miles $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 $5.00 QUOTEBY JOB | QUOTEBY JOB $4.00 $6.25 $6.25 $3.35

20-25 miles $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 $5.50 $4.50 $7.00 $7.00 $3.50

25-30 miles $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 $6.00 $4.95 $7.75 $7.75 $4.15

30-35 miles $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 $7.00 $5.25 $8.50 $9.00 $4.75

35-40 miles $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 $7.50 N/A $9.25 $10.00 $5.25

40-45 miles - - $8.00 N/A $10.25 $11.00 $5.75

45-50 miles - - - $8.50 N/A $11.25 $12.00 $6.50

over 50 miles - - - $9.00 N/A $0.20 Cgb'&:_(éR $9.00

MINIMIUM DELIVERY REQUIRED NO NO NO YES YES YES N/A YES
FEES APPLIED FOR | FEES APPLIED FOR | FEES APPLIED FOR NOQ?J%LT'\E/ERY
SHORT LOADS SHORT LOADS SHORT LOADS 15 TON MINIMUM .
IF, YES AMOUNT $ VARY BY VARY BY VARY BY $60.00 CHARGE %;LB%ANTI\JEERITIAEIE&;{SE $100.00
LOCATION LOCATION LOCATION

QUARRY




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN BUSSEN BUSSEN CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE
QUARRIES - QUARRIES - QUARRIES - H SAND AND COMPANY - COMPANY - MORSE |ARCH JOHNSTON CO | WINTER BROTHERS | BRM LLC (BASIC | Lp-n \WEBER INC SIMPSON
GRAVEL INC MATERIAL ROCK MINERALS) MATERIALS CO
CRUSHED STONE AND ANTIRE TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS ANTIONA MILL
GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019 5200 HILLSBORO
8799 TRAUTMAN 6801 VOTECHRD | 2320 CREVE COEUR | 1053 HEADQUARTERS
2-26-2019 6800 BUSSEN ROAD | oo "o oy v | HOUSE SPRINGS RD | PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL | 1195 SMIZER MILL RD | 1195 SMIZER MILLRD | 12520 STATERT 21 13088 GRAVIOSRDST.| - i e roe vt | o eRie s Be 1 0 e St
EUREKA MO 63025 MO 63070 HOUSE GSBP(I)?SI;\IGS MO MO 63052 FENTON MO 63026 | FENTON MO 63026 | DESOTO MO 63020 LOUIS MO 63127 3628 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION v v v N v v v N N v N
(Y/IN):
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED \4 ' Y Y Y Y Y \4
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y N
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y N Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND
SIGNATURE Y Y Y N Y Y Y N Y Y Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A IN/A N/A
(F) - FESTUS
(';?_CSA(;'JOT: LOCATION 850
LOCATION SULPHUR SPRINGS
RD
*DELIVERY IS
SUBJECT TO AN 18 PER;?;;EQIE T
TON MINIMUM YARDS:
HAUL CHARGE :
COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED PER LOAD. DESOTO - $4.50
*DELIVERY IS TON
SUBJECT TO
WAITING TIME H”‘Lsi%?\lo $4.50
AFTER 15 MINUTES
ON THE J0B $60.00 | HOUSE SPRINGS -
PER HOUR $3.35 TON
’ FOR ANY
PRODUCT ON THIS
ALL MATERIALS BID PACKAGE.

ARE SUBJECT TO
AVAILABILITY.




JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL
PRODUCTS 2019

BID #: 19-0013

Date Issued: 1-25-2019

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

ONE YEAR CONTRACT
WITH TWO ONE YEAR
RENEWAL OPTIONS
UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitiation for Bid

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@)jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
VENDOR NAME
VENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for two additional one-year terms with the written consent of the
successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

by the County. ‘ |
(Winter Bestheos mcdfer‘fr&( @JAHS mﬁk\\f‘f’\
‘,.-’ Authorized Agent (Print)

Company Name
, \
ch}(

\ M ES (‘}TT‘GLU\:,( S ’_ﬁixs_c,\

Address Signature
51“ Lou_{‘S /WO é3/37 &}a /e /qoa e m.ﬁ}'\qﬁ er”
City/State/Zip Code Title  “
(219) 843~ 1400 8) 4
Telephone # " 'Date Tax ID #
e ek B nterbrothersouterial o (3&/} Y- 146>
E-mail Fax #

Bidder's Initak@m

10of 16




HAUL CHART

MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY FOR ON SITE DELIVERY
@ﬁles $ 1% PERTON $ PER TON
5 (Dmites 54 B omkeR $ PER TON
10 Bmiles $ 5 2~ bR TON $ PER TON
15 -@niles $ @ 22 PER TON $ PER TON
20 @nﬂes $ 7% PERTON $ PER TON
25 miles i 2~ pErTON $ PER TON
30 @mﬂes s 8 = PER TON $ PER TON
35 -iles s 9 - PER TON $ PER TON
40 -iles $ 10?2’ PER TON $ PER TON
45 iles s = PER TON $ PER TON
Over 50 miles $ -:;"9 PER TON MILE $ PER TON MILE

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) No

If yes, amount $ [6‘\13,\ ONL D s L"\\cwgc_

Invitiation for Bid 14 of 16 Bidder's |nita|sf ]A Y\



