
BID TABULATION - PAPER SUPPLIES 2020

SUPPLY 

CONCEPTS INC
QUILL LLC

OFFICE DEPOT 

INC 

STAPLES 

CONTRACT & 

COMMERCIAL LLC

290 AXMINISTER 

DR FENTON MO 

63026

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

6600 N MILITARY 

TRL BOCA RATON 

FL 33496

8941 SPRINGDALE 

AVE ST LOUIS MO 

63134

 Our Item
Number

Item Description
Suggested

Manufacturer
Manuf. Item

Number

Unit Of

Measure

10300
Envelopes - Coin Envelopes White Wove - Printmaster, SFI, #5-1/2, 24, 3-1/8 x 5-1/2, Gummed, 

Mailpoint Flap (500/Box, 5000/Ctn)
Quality Park 5170832 BOX BSN 04443 $18.79 NO BID NO BID 

10306 Envelopes - Booklet Envelopes, 6 x 9, White, #6-1/2, 24, 20M, Gummed, Wallet Flap (500/Ctn) National 2256159 BOX QUA 37181 $84.41 NO BID $57.28

10307
Envelopes - 9 x 12 Catalog Envelopes Brown Kraft OECS - Seville, SFI, #10-1/2, 28, 9 x 12, Kraft, 

Vellum, Gummed, Mailpoint Flap (250/Ctn)
National 5252741 BOX BSN 42100 $26.55 NO BID $15.36

10309
Envelopes - 8 1/ 2 x 12 Jiffylite Self- Seal Mailer, Side Seam, #2, 8 1/ 2 x 12, Golden Brown, 

100/Carton
Seal Air Corp SEL10187 EACH 25CT $25.34 NO BID 25 CT $ 23.09 $28.28

10310
Envelopes -10 1/ 2x16 Padded Self-Seal Mailer, Side Seam, #5, 10 1/ 2x16, Golden Brown, 

100/Carton
Seal Air Corp SEL21489 EACH 25CT $34.47 NO BID $47.89 $75.40

10311
Envelopes - #15, 10 x 15 Catalog Envelopes Brown Kraft OECS - Vellum, Gummed, Mailpoint Flap 

(500/Ctn)
National 2198401 BOX

250CT BSN 42115 

$55.52
NO BID $63.95

10314
Envelopes - #10 Window, Commercial Window Left Hand Envelopes, 4-1/8 x 9-1/2, White, 

Gummed, Commercial Flap, (500/Box, 2500/Ctn)
National 2140238 BOX

500/BOX BSN 04468 

$20.92
QUILL WW10RW $25.18 $24.26

10315
Envelopes - #9 Regular, Commercial Envelopes White, 3-7/8 x 8-7/8, Gummed, Commercial Flap 

(500/Box, 2500/Ctn)
National 2139741 BOX

500/BOX BSN 04469 

$21.74
QUILL WW9ES $20.14 $18.16

10316
Envelopes - #10 Regular, Commercial Envelopes White, 4-1/8 x 9-1/2, Gummed, Commercial Flap 

(500/Box, 2500/Ctn)
National 2256150 BOX

500/BOX BSN 04467 

$13.18
QUILL WW10ES $16.71 $18.99

10317
Envelopes - #10 Window, Commercial Window Right Hand Envelopes, White, 4-1/8 x 9-1/2, 

Gummed, Commercial Flap, (500/Box, 2500/Ctn)
National 2256120 BOX

ZCMPM1024RHW 

$12.21
NO BID $17.13

10319
Envelopes - #9 Window, Commercial Window Envelopes, White, 3-7/8 x 8-7/8, Gummed, 

Commercial Flap, Poly Window (500/Box, 2500/Ctn)
National 2256161 BOX BSN 99710 $21.97 QUILL WW9WES $26.31 NO BID 

10330 Envelopes - 9" x 12" Catalog Envelope, 24.00 lb, Gummed, White, 250/Box Universal UNV44104 BOX BSN 42102 31.24 QUILL 0E91224W $20.37 $19.41 $28.78

10331 Envelopes - 9" x 12" Tamper-Indicating Envelopes - Peel & Seal - Tyvek - 100 / Box - White Quality Park QUAR2400 BOX $99.54 NO BID $134.99 $654.95

10332 Envelopes - 6" x 9" -  Tyvek -  Peel & Seal - 100 / Box - White Business Source BSN65699 BOX $32.78 QUILL 72016 $22.32 $62.39 $46.99

10700 Copy Paper - Letter, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV21200 REAM SLC 851120 $3.03 QUILL 720222 $5.11 $44.24 $3.20

10701 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Pink, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11224 REAM SLC 851120PK $4.30 QUILL 720567 $5.36 $7.69 $5.64

10702 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Canary, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11201 REAM SLC 851120CY $4.30 QUILL 720563 $5.36 $3.99 $5.64

10703 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Goldenrod, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11205 REAM SLC 851120GD $4.30 QUILL 720565 $5.36 $4.89 $5.64
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10704 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Green, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11203 REAM SLC 851120GN $4.30 QUILL 720561 $5.36 $3.99 $5.64

10705 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Blue, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11202 REAM SLC 851120BE $4.30 QUILL 720559 $5.36 $3.99 $5.64

10706 Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb., Buff, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11206 REAM HAM 10332-5 $6.68
HAMMERMILL 

103325UNI $6.62
$4.89 $6.05

10707 Copy Paper - Legal, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV24200 REAM SLC 851420 $4.45 QUILL 720223 $6.71 $44.99 $6.31

10711 Copy Paper - 11 x 17, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 5 Reams/Carton Universal UNV28110 REAM SLC-111720 $3.46 QUILL 7201117 $9.80 $40.99 $9.62

10713
Letterhead - 8-1/2 x 11, 20lb, White, 91 Bright, Perfect Laser, 25% Cotton Fibers, Watermarked, 

(500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn)
Capitol 2085221 REAM SLC 851125 $16.85 NO BID NO BID 

10802 Cover - Letter, 80#, 94 Brightness, Laser Capatible, White, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Wausau 56981 2276022 REAM WY 292877 $14.76 NO BID NO BID 

10804 Card Stock - Letter, 90#, Buff, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Wausau 2288963 REAM DM 81058 $6.82 NO BID $25.69

10805 Card Stock - Letter, 65#, White, 250 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Finch 6073124 REAM WY 292338 $6.00 NO BID NO BID 

10806 Card Stock - Letter, 65#, Green, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Ream/Carton Wausau 2288907 REAM 114095 $6.86
67# 250 SHEETS/PACK 

DOMTAR 81040 $5.17
$8.70

10807 Card Stock - Letter, 110#, Cherry, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Wausau 2262297 REAM DM 81056 $8.14 NO BID $26.49

10810 Card Stock - Astroparche Vellum Cover, 65lb, Ancient Gold, 8-1/2 x 11, 250/Pkg Astroparche 6055237 REAM WAU 26428 $13.51 NO BID NO BID 

10900 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 2 Part, Reverse, Letter (2/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 2063251 REAM NCR 5914 $27.13 NO BID NO BID 

10901 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 3 Part, Reverse, Letter (3/Set, 501/Pkg, 5010/Ctn) Mead 2241308 REAM NCR 5900 $33.54 NO BID NO BID 

10902 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 4 Part, Reverse, Letter (4/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 2241305 REAM 117306 $32.91 NO BID NO BID 

10903 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 4 Part, Straight, Letter (4/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 2216205 REAM NC 36490 $49.37 NO BID $21.77

10904 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 5 Part, Reverse, Letter (5/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 5060750 REAM NC 38071 $34.06 NO BID NO BID 

10905 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 5 Part, Straight, Letter (5/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 5062311 REAM MD60458 $34.06 NO BID NO BID 

10918 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 2 Part, Reverse, Legal (2/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 5202999 REAM 127806 $34.78 NO BID NO BID 

10919 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 3 Part, Reverse, Legal (3/Set, 501/Pkg, 5010/Ctn) Mead 2241309 REAM NC 36492 $39.18 NO BID NO BID 

10920 NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 4 Part, Reverse, Legal (4/Set, 500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn Mead 2230434 REAM NC 36493 $41.89 NO BID NO BID 

10923 NCR Padding Compound - 1 Gallon, Liquid (4/Ctn) Mead 5000301 GALLON MD 26366 $158.84 NO BID NO BID 
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10960 Crack-N-Peel - 8 1/2" x 11", Fluorescent Orange, 100/Pkg Fasson 2249448 PACKAGE 119618 $21.96 NO BID NO BID 

10972
Paper - 3 Hole Punch, Letter, 20#, 92 Bright, Smooth, Left, White, (500 Sheets/Ream, 10 

Reams/Carton)
International Paper 2251795 REAM SLC 85113 $3.39 QUILL 7203HP $5.63 $4.81

10980
Color Copy Paper - Letter, 28#, 100 Bright, Smooth, Photo White (500 Sheets/Ream, 8 

Reams/Carton

NO SUBSTITUTE 

Hammermill
2312967 REAM HAM 10246-7 $9.98 NO BID $9.30

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

Y Y N Y

Y Y Y Y

Y Y Y Y

N/A N/A N/A N/A

MADE NOTE OF 

ADDENDUM 1

MADE NOTE OF 

ADDENDUM 1

MADE NOTE OF 

ADDENDUM 1

MADE NOTE OF 

ADDENDUM 1
COMMENTS:

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED:

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (Y/N):

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED:

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY:

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N):

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO:

COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE:

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED:


