
BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

ANTIRE

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

TRAUTMAN

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

HOUSE SPRINGS

H SAND AND 

GRAVEL

CENTRAL STONE 

COMPANY - 

ANTIONA 

CENTRAL STONE 

COMPANY - MORSE 

MILL 

ARCH JOHNSTON CO 

INC

WINTER BROTHERS 

MATERIAL

BRM LLC (BASIC 

ROCK MINERALS)
FRED WEBER INC

SIMPSON 

MATERIALS CO

6800 BUSSEN ROAD 

EUREKA MO 63025

8799 TRAUTMAN 

QUARRY RD PEVELY 

MO 63070

5200 HILLSBORO 

HOUSE SPRINGS RD 

HOUSE SPRINGS MO 

63051

PO BOX 69 IMPERIAL 

MO 63052

1195 SMIZER MILL RD 

FENTON MO 63026

1195 SMIZER MILL RD 

FENTON MO 63026

12520 STATE RT 21 

DESOTO MO 63020

13098 GRAVIOS RD ST. 

LOUIS MO 63127

6801 VOTECH RD 

BONNE TERRE MO 

63628

2320 CREVE COEUR 

MILL RD MARYLAND 

HEIGHTS MO 63043

1053 HEADQUARTERS 

PARK FENTON MO 

63026

In emergency, can we call you after 

regular hours? Yes or No
NO NO NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

If yes name party to call CHUCK SMREKER 
RANDY 

HACKWORTH 

RANDY 

HACKWORTH

DIANNA K 

JOHNSTON
CHRIS MCKIM DWAYNE HOLST

RESOURCE 

INTERGRATION 

CENTER (RIC) 

ORDER 

PLACEMENT 

STONE

(F) - FESTUS - 838 

VFW DRIVE, 

FESTUS MO 63028

(S) - SOUTH - 4200 

NEW 

BAUMGARTNER, 

ST. LOUIS MO 

SCOTT LACY 

telephone number 314-267-5828 314-435-1707 314-435-1707 314-402-3983 (314)-347-7037 (573)-579-1074 (866)-739-8855
314-660-1852 

MOBILE

BID ALL AVAILABLE 

CATEGORIES CRUSHED 

STONE PRODUCTS

CLEAN STONE                                                                                   

Cost per Ton

1/4" - - $11.30 N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

3/8" $10.20 $10.90 $10.20 $9.50 $8.75 N/A $8.55
FESTUS - $11.00

SOUTH - NO BID
$10.00

1/2" $11.40 $9.20 $11.40 $9.50 N/A N/A
FESTUS - $11.00

SOUTH - NO BID
$10.00

3/4" $10.10 $9.40 $10.10 $8.75 $8.95 N/A
FESTUS - $7.95

SOUTH - $9.00
$8.60

1" $10.10 $9.40 $10.10 $8.75 $7.65 $8.95 $6.90 (BROWN)
FESTUS - $7.50

SOUTH - $9.00
$7.50

1&1/4" - - - N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
$7.50

1&1/2" $8.80 - $8.80 $7.50 N/A N/A
FESTUS - $7.50

SOUTH - $9.00
$7.50

1&3/4" - - - N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
$7.50

2" $8.80 $8.10 $8.80 $7.50 $7.25 $7.65 $6.20
FESTUS - $7.00

SOUTH - $8.00
$7.25

3" - - - $8.00 $7.65 $6.20
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
$7.25

CRUSHED STONE AND 

GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

2-26-2019



BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

ANTIRE
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QUARRIES - 

TRAUTMAN

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

HOUSE SPRINGS

H SAND AND 

GRAVEL

CENTRAL STONE 

COMPANY - 

ANTIONA 

CENTRAL STONE 
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MATERIALS CO
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HOUSE SPRINGS RD 

HOUSE SPRINGS MO 
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1195 SMIZER MILL RD 

FENTON MO 63026
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PARK FENTON MO 

63026

CRUSHED STONE AND 

GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

2-26-2019

4" $8.80 $8.10 - $7.65 N/A
FESTUS - $7.00

SOUTH - $8.00
$7.25 (5x2 CLEAN)

5" - - - N/A $5.80
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
$7.25

6" - - - $7.75 $8.40 N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

MINUS                                                                                       

Cost per Ton

1/4" $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 $1.00 $2.50 $3.40

FESTUS - $1.00 

SCREENING

SOUTH - $1.00 

SCREENING

$1.00 

SCREENINGS

3/8" $6.10 $6.00 $6.10 N/A $4.35
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

1/2" - - - N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

3/4" $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.50 N/A
FESTUS - $4.25

SOUTH - $4.25
$5.00

1" $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 $6.00
FESTUS - $4.25

SOUTH - $4.25
$5.00

1&1/4" - - - N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

1&1/2" - - - $5.25 N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
$5.00

2" $6.00 $5.70 $6.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 $6.20
FESTUS - $4.95

SOUTH - $4.95
$5.00

2&1/2" - - - N/A N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

3" - - - $5.25 $5.00 $5.50 N/A
FESTUS - NO BID

SOUTH - NO BID
N/A

4" $6.00 $5.70 - N/A $6.20
FESTUS - $5.25

SOUTH - $5.25
$5.00

1/2" - 4" Minus Backfill $6.00 $5.70 - $4.00 $3.90
FESTUS - $5.25

SOUTH - $5.25
N/A

COST PER TON

MODOT TYPE 1 OR 5 BASE $6.40 $5.90 $6.40 $13.00 $5.25 $5.50 $6.20
$5.25 (FESTUS OR 

SOUTH)
$5.20
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GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

2-26-2019

GRAVEL PRODUCTS

COST PER TON

P-GRAVEL - - - $9.00 N/A N/A $13.00 $11.00 N/A NO BID N/A

SCREENED GRAVEL - - - $8.50 N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A

CREEK GRAVEL - - - N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A

B-GRAVEL - - - $6.00 N/A N/A $10.00 $26.10 N/A NO BID N/A

C-GRAVEL - - - $16.50 N/A N/A $20.00 $11.95 N/A NO BID $17.45

CONCRETE ROCK - - - $16.50 N/A N/A N/A - $8.25 NO BID

$17.45 (C GRAVEL) 

LIMESTONE 

GRADE D MODOT 

$9.50

FILTER SAND - - - FILL SAND $6.00 N/A N/A N/A - N/A NO BID N/A

SAND - $10.00 - $19.50 N/A N/A $17.50 $12.00 N/A NO BID $17.45

DIRT  - -

$7.50 TOP SOIL

$5.50 FILL DIRT

3" x 6" GRAVEL 

$8.50

$6.50 N/A

$30/ SINGLE 

AXLE LOAD

$45/LADEM AXLE 

LOAD

BANK $8.00

PULLVERIZED 

AND SCREENED 

$11

N/A NO BID N/A

ADDITIONAL SUPPLIER FEES $ - - $1,500.00
MINIMUM LOAD 

CHARGE IS $30

COMMENTS: 

AFTER HOURS 

OPENING 

CHARGES

BASICALLY 2 TON 

MINIMUM ON 

THSE MATERIALS 

ABOVE

IF YOU CAN NOT HOLD YOUR 

PRICE FOR A FULL YEAR, YOU 

WILL GUARANTEE THIS PRICE TO 

REMAIN IN EFFECT UNITL: 

N/A N/A N/A N/A 12/31/2019 2/28/2020 2/28/2020
PRICES GOOD FOR 

ONE YEAR. 

HAUL CHART MILEAGE                      

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR 

STOCK PILE DELIVERY
SEE NOTES BELOW

0-5 miles $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $3.00 $3.75 $4.00 $3.25 $3.75

5-10 miles $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $3.50 $4.25 $4.50 $3.50 $4.25

10-15 miles $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $4.00 $4.95 $5.00 $3.75 $5.00

15-20 miles $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 $5.00 QUOTE BY JOB QUOTE BY JOB $4.00 $6.25

20-25 miles $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 $5.50 $4.50 $7.00



BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

ANTIRE

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

TRAUTMAN

BUSSEN 

QUARRIES - 

HOUSE SPRINGS

H SAND AND 
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CENTRAL STONE 
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CENTRAL STONE 

COMPANY - MORSE 
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CRUSHED STONE AND 

GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

2-26-2019

25-30 miles $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 $6.00 $4.95 $7.75

30-35 miles $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 $7.00 $5.25 $9.00

35-40 miles $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 $7.50 N/A $10.00

40-45 miles - - - $8.00 N/A $11.00

45-50 miles - - - $8.50 N/A $12.00

over 50 miles - - - $9.00 N/A
CALL FOR 

QUOTE



BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019
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2-26-2019

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR ON 

SITE DELIVERY

0-5 miles $3.70 $3.40 $3.95 $3.00 $3.75 $4.00 $3.25 $4.00 $3.75 $2.25

5-10 miles $4.20 $4.10 $4.55 $3.50 $4.25 $4.50 $3.50 $4.25 $4.25 $2.50

10-15 miles $4.65 $4.65 $5.05 $4.00 $4.95 $5.00 $3.75 $5.50 $5.00 $2.85

15-20 miles $5.00 $5.15 $5.45 $5.00  QUOTE BY JOB  QUOTE BY JOB $4.00 $6.25 $6.25 $3.35

20-25 miles $5.50 $5.55 $5.95 $5.50 $4.50 $7.00 $7.00 $3.50

25-30 miles $6.00 $6.05 $6.45 $6.00 $4.95 $7.75 $7.75 $4.15

30-35 miles $6.50 $6.55 $6.95 $7.00 $5.25 $8.50 $9.00 $4.75

35-40 miles $7.00 $7.05 $7.45 $7.50 N/A $9.25 $10.00 $5.25

40-45 miles - - $8.00 N/A $10.25 $11.00 $5.75

45-50 miles - - - $8.50 N/A $11.25 $12.00 $6.50

over 50 miles - - - $9.00 N/A $0.20
CALL FOR 

QUOTE
$9.00

MINIMIUM DELIVERY REQUIRED NO NO NO YES YES YES N/A YES

IF, YES AMOUNT $

FEES APPLIED FOR 

SHORT LOADS 

VARY BY 

LOCATION

FEES APPLIED FOR 

SHORT LOADS 

VARY BY 

LOCATION

FEES APPLIED FOR 

SHORT LOADS 

VARY BY 

LOCATION

$60.00
15 TON MINIMUM 

CHARGE

NO DELIVERY 

QUOTED.

ALL MATERIAL IS 

FOB BONNE TERRE 

QUARRY

$100.00
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GRAVEL PRODUCTS 2019

2-26-2019

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION 

(Y/N):
Y Y Y N Y Y Y N N Y N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED 

LETTER STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN 

JEFFERSON COUNTY

Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y N

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y N Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
Y Y Y N Y Y Y N Y Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A ]N/A N/A

COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED 

(F) - FESTUS 

LOCATION

(S) - SOUTH 

LOCATION

*DELIVERY IS 

SUBJECT TO AN 18 

TON MINIMUM 

HAUL CHARGE 

PER LOAD. 

*DELIVERY IS 

SUBJECT TO 

WAITING TIME 

AFTER 15 MINUTES 

ON THE JOB $60.00 

PER HOUR. 

ALL MATERIALS 

ARE SUBJECT TO 

AVAILABILITY. 

LOCATION 850 

SULPHUR SPRINGS 

RD

PER TON RATE TO 

STOCKPILE 

YARDS:

DESOTO - $4.50 

TON

HILLSBORO $4.50 

TON

HOUSE SPRINGS - 

$3.35 TON

FOR ANY 

PRODUCT ON THIS 

BID PACKAGE. 

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS






