ROADWAY SIGNS BID TABULATION

ROADWAY SIGNS
BID OPENING

1-30-07

Rocal Inc.

Plastic Safety
Systems

J & A Traffic
Products

Vulcan Signs

Custom
Products Corp

Econo Sign-
Supply

Safety Zone
Specialists,
Inc.

Hall Signs,
Inc.

Osburn
Associates,
Inc.

Korman Signs

Street Sign Blanks

6X24 ALUM $5.98 NO BID NO BID $7.24 $8.65 $11.48 NO BID $8.85 $6.06 $10.00
6X30 ALUM $7.53 NO BID NO BID $9.05 $10.81 $13.62 NO BID $10.90 $7.58 $12.00
6X36 ALUM $9.04 NO BID NO BID $10.86 $12.97 $15.62 NO BID $12.93 $9.09 $14.00
9X24 ALUM $7.99 NO BID NO BID $10.28 $11.90 $14.45 NO BID $11.93 $8.24 $13.50
9X30 ALUM $9.63 NO BID NO BID $12.85 $14.88 $16.07 NO BID $14.76 $10.29 $16.50
9X36 ALUM $11.44 NO BID NO BID $15.42 $17.85 $19.98 NO BID $17.55 $12.35 $19.50
9X42 ALUM $13.34 NO BID NO BID $17.99 $20.83 $22.76 NO BID $20.37 $14.41 $22.50
9X48 ALUM $15.26 NO BID NO BID $20.56 $23.80 $25.48 NO BID $23.17 $16.47 $25.50
9X54 ALUM $17.18 NO BID NO BID $23.13 $26.78 $27.05 NO BID $25.99 $18.53 $29.00
9X60 ALUM $19.19 NO BID NO BID $25.70 $29.75 $29.78 NO BID $28.79 $20.59 $32.00

9" Street Signs

9x24 ALUM $24.00 NO BID NO BID $15.56 $29.42 $19.22 NO BID $16.60 $9.39 $20.50
9X30 ALUM $26.00 NO BID NO BID $19.45 $29.42 $23.25 NO BID $20.63 $11.74 $23.50
9X36 ALUM $28.00 NO BID NO BID $23.34 $29.42 $27.17 NO BID $24.63 $14.09 $26.50
9X42 ALUM $29.80 NO BID NO BID $27.23 $34.60 $31.15 NO BID $28.66 $16.43 $29.50
9X48 ALUM $34.93 NO BID NO BID $31.12 $40.66 $34.95 NO BID $32.67 $18.78 $34.00
9X54 ALUM $39.21 NO BID NO BID $35.01 $47.79 $39.10 NO BID $36.70 $21.13 $39.00
9X60 ALUM $43.88 NO BID NO BID $38.90 $56.14 $43.12 NO BID $40.71 $23.47 $42.00
9" Hl-Intensity
9X24 ALUM $29.80 NO BID NO BID $23.86 $38.36 $40.50 NO BID $19.88 $15.14 $30.00
9X30 ALUM $32.80 NO BID NO BID $29.83 $38.36 $49.50 NO BID $24.81 $18.92 $34.00
9X36 ALUM $34.31 NO BID NO BID $35.79 $38.36 $59.20 NO BID $29.71 $22.70 $37.00
9X42 ALUM $38.03 NO BID NO BID $41.76 $45.06 $68.60 NO BID $34.64 $26.49 $40.80
9X48 ALUM $42.99 NO BID NO BID $47.72 $52.59 $78.00 NO BID $39.54 $30.27 $44.00
9X54 ALUM $46.08 NO BID NO BID $53.69 $61.22 $86.60 NO BID $44.47 $34.05 $49.00
9X60 ALUM $51.04 NO BID NO BID $59.65 $71.05 $95.90 NO BID $49.38 $37.84 $54.00

Highway Signs

R1-1 STOP 24x24 $30.28 NO BID NO BID $17.90 $22.39 $16.95 NO BID $23.57 $23.60 $30.00
R1-1 STOP 30x30 $47.31 NO BID NO BID $27.93 $34.27 $24.96 NO BID $36.55 $36.88 $48.00
R1-2 Yield 30 $29.52 NO BID NO BID $13.59 $18.46 $15.78 NO BID $19.15 $18.44 $32.00
W1-8 CHEVRON

18x24 $22.59 NO BID NO BID $14.28 $17.51 $14.97 NO BID $18.61 $17.70 $24.50

HAZARD/OBJECT
10x30 $15.68 NO BID NO BID $11.29 $12.70 $14.97 NO BID $13.11 $12.29 $20.00

RF-9 or N-5

18" Red Reflector $27.59 NO BID NO BID $14.75 $19.25 $16.75 NO BID $22.75 $15.00 $34.00

HI-INTENSITY
REFLECTIVITY




ROADWAY SIGNS BID TABULATION

ROADWAY SIGNS Safety Zone Osburn
BID OPENING Plastic Safety | J & A Traffic Custom Econo Sign- | Specialists, Hall Signs, Associates,
1-30-07 Rocal Inc. Systems Products Vulcan Signs [Products Corp Supply Inc. Inc. Inc. Korman Signs
HI-INTENSITY R1-
1 STOP SIGNS 24”
X 24” $33.01 NO BID NO BID $21.12 $26.44 $21.42 NO BID $29.52 $26.60 $40.00
HI-INTENSITY R1-
1 STOP SIGNS 30”
X 30” $51.06 NO BID NO BID $32.97 $40.60 $36.93 NO BID $45.73 $41.56 $62.50
APPROPRIATE
COLORS OF 3M
ENGINEER
12x6 $2.03 NO BID NO BID $3.35 $3.67 $4.91 NO BID $3.47 $1.83 $5.00
12x9 $3.04 NO BID NO BID $4.29 $5.50 $6.99 NO BID $4.98 $2.74 $8.00
12x12 $4.05 NO BID NO BID $5.63 $7.06 $7.90 NO BID $6.56 $3.65 $9.00
12x36 $12.15 NO BID NO BID $14.25 $17.51 $14.88 NO BID $18.53 $10.95 $24.00
18x6 $3.04 NO BID NO BID $4.28 $5.50 $7.86 NO BID $4.95 $2.74 $8.00
18x18 $9.11 NO BID NO BID $11.70 $13.67 $12.96 NO BID $14.15 $8.21 $19.00
18x24 $12.15 NO BID NO BID $14.25 $17.51 $14.95 NO BID $18.61 $10.95 $24.00
21x15 $8.87 NO BID NO BID $10.85 $13.30 $11.96 NO BID $14.47 $7.96 $19.00
24x6 $4.05 NO BID NO BID $5.27 $7.06 $7.90 NO BID $6.49 $3.65 $10.00
24x8 $5.39 NO BID NO BID $6.87 $8.10 $11.02 NO BID $8.49 $4.87 $14.00
24x10 $6.76 NO BID NO BID $8.58 $10.17 $10.24 NO BID $10.58 $6.09 $18.00
24x12 $8.10 NO BID NO BID $10.27 $12.15 $11.30 NO BID $12.58 $7.30 $20.00
24x24 $16.20 NO BID NO BID $19.00 $23.34 $17.60 NO BID $24.60 $14.60 $33.00
24x30 $20.25 NO BID NO BID $23.75 $29.11 $24.39 NO BID $30.60 $18.25 $40.00
24x36 $24.30 NO BID NO BID $28.50 $34.29 $26.20 NO BID $36.61 $21.90 $48.00
24x48 $32.40 NO BID NO BID $38.00 $45.83 $35.70 NO BID $49.21 $29.20 $64.00
30x18 $15.19 NO BID NO BID $17.81 $21.89 $17.55 NO BID $23.11 $13.69 $31.00
30x30 $25.31 NO BID NO BID $29.69 $35.80 $28.96 NO BID $38.16 $22.81 $49.00
30x36 $30.38 NO BID NO BID $35.63 $42.97 $31.40 NO BID $45.68 $27.38 $60.00
36x12 $12.15 NO BID NO BID $14.25 $17.51 $14.88 NO BID $18.53 $10.95 $24.00
36x18 $18.23 NO BID NO BID $21.38 $26.27 $21.94 NO BID $27.68 $16.43 $36.00
36x20 $20.25 NO BID NO BID $23.75 $29.11 $22.78 NO BID $30.60 $18.25 $47.00
36x36 $36.45 NO BID NO BID $42.75 $51.20 $37.97 NO BID $54.70 $32.85 $70.00
36x48 $48.60 NO BID NO BID $57.00 $68.27 $46.90 NO BID $74.29 $43.80 $90.00
48x9 $12.15 NO BID NO BID $14.25 $35.89 $14.88 NO BID $21.87 $10.95 $28.00
48x18 $24.30 NO BID NO BID $28.50 $34.29 $27.15 NO BID $39.36 $21.90 $48.00
48x24 $32.40 NO BID NO BID $38.00 $45.83 $35.73 NO BID $49.21 $29.20 $60.00
48x30 $40.50 NO BID NO BID $47.50 $56.89 $41.79 NO BID $61.63 $36.50 $77.00
60x24 $40.50 NO BID NO BID $47.50 $56.89 $41.79 NO BID $76.72 $36.50 $77.00
60x30 $50.63 NO BID NO BID $59.38 $70.95 $50.73 NO BID $91.05 $45.63 $96.00
Yellow/Green
Diamond Grade




ROADWAY SIGNS BID TABULATION

ROADWAY SIGNS Safety Zone Osburn
BID OPENING Plastic Safety | J & A Traffic Custom Econo Sign- | Specialists, Hall Signs, Associates,
1-30-07 Rocal Inc. Systems Products Vulcan Signs [Products Corp Supply Inc. Inc. Inc. Korman Signs
S-1 School Zone
30x30 $53.82 NO BID NO BID $57.56 $60.84 $60.98 NO BID $65.81 $45.94 $94.00
S4-3-School 24x8 $11.10 NO BID NO BID $12.89 $13.41 $16.73 NO BID $14.77 $9.80 $24.00
Diagonal Arrow
30x18 $32.29 NO BID NO BID $35.97 $36.90 $38.88 NO BID $40.77 $27.56 $60.00
Ahead 30x18 $32.29 NO BID NO BID $35.97 $36.90 $38.88 NO BID $40.77 $27.56 $60.00
Construction Signs
Orange HI-Intensity
18x18 $11.54 NO BID NO BID $12.77 $16.04 $16.86 NO BID $17.34 $9.90 $18.00
24x18 $15.39 NO BID NO BID $16.68 $20.67 $17.97 NO BID $22.87 $13.20 $23.00
24x24 $20.52 NO BID NO BID $22.24 $27.56 $22.61 NO BID $30.28 $17.60 $30.00
30x24 25..65 NO BID NO BID $27.80 $34.38 $27.57 NO BID $37.70 $22.00 $38.00
30x30 $31.55 NO BID NO BID $34.75 $42.39 $33.46 NO BID $47.04 $27.50 $47.00
36x18 $23.09 NO BID NO BID $25.02 $31.01 $27.95 NO BID $34.07 $19.80 $34.00
36x36 $46.17 NO BID NO BID $50.04 $60.68 $46.73 NO BID $67.48 $39.60 $68.00
48x18 $30.78 NO BID NO BID $33.36 $40.61 $32.58 NO BID $47.88 $26.40 $46.00
48x24 $41.04 NO BID NO BID $44.48 $54.26 $41.93 NO BID $60.57 $35.20 $58.00
48x48 $82.08 NO BID NO BID $88.96 $107.45 $79.74 NO BID $122.25 $70.40 $122.00
60x36 $76.95 NO BID NO BID $83.40 $100.93 $74.92 NO BID $125.11 $66.00 $118.00
Sign Brackets
90x Style $6.89 NO BID $3.95 $3.94 $4.13 $4.80 NO BID $3.86 $4.75 $8.50
180x Style $6.89 NO BID $3.95 $3.94 $4.06 $4.80 NO BID $3.86 $4.75 $8.50
Cross Piece
BA 7A Style $6.89 NO BID $3.95 $4.57 $4.13 $4.80 NO BID $4.09 $4.75 $9.50
UNIV 457X $6.89 NO BID $4.67 $5.25 $4.13 $4.80 NO BID $3.68 NO BID $9.50
Stop/Slow Paddles
ENGINEER
GRADE
1-11 $47.33 NO BID $43.60 $20.75 $25.17 $28.30 $36.80 $21.28 $26.00 $26.00
12-24 $42.29 NO BID $40.95 $20.43 $25.17 $26.30 $34.40 $21.28 $26.00 $25.00
28" Orange
Traffic Cones
1-11 NO BID NO BID $17.25 $14.50 $16.12 $28.12 $15.05 $18.40 $19.65 $19.50
12-24 NO BID NO BID $16.80 $13.87 $16.12 $27.97 $14.80 $18.40 $19.65 $19.00
Caution Tape
3" x 1000’
1-11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.50 $8.27 $69.95 $9.20 $10.70 $10.20 $18.00
12-24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.75 $8.27 $62.95 $9.00 $10.70 $10.20 $17.50

Yellow Marking
Tape 4x150




ROADWAY SIGNS BID TABULATION

ROADWAY SIGNS Safety Zone Osburn
BID OPENING Plastic Safety | J & A Traffic Custom Econo Sign- | Specialists, Hall Signs, Associates,
1-30-07 Rocal Inc. Systems Products Vulcan Signs [Products Corp Supply Inc. Inc. Inc. Korman Signs
1-11 NO BID NO BID $42.50 NO BID $36.08 $67.12 $48.00 $38.66 $94.74 $175.00
12-24 NO BID NO BID $39.50 NO BID $36.08 $65.37 $46.40 $38.66 $94.74 $170.00
White Marking
Tape 4x150
1-11 NO BID NO BID $42.50 NO BID $36.08 $67.12 $48.00 $38.66 $94.74 $175.00
12-24 NO BID NO BID $39.50 NO BID $36.08 $65.37 $46.40 $38.66 $94.74 $170.00
Letters & Numbers
2" B $6.89 NO BID $2.35 $1.98 $1.82 $3.25 NO BID $2.47 NO BID $4.00
2"C $6.89 NO BID $2.55 $2.15 $1.96 $4.25 NO BID $2.57 NO BID $4.00
3"B $8.51 NO BID $2.84 $2.98 $2.66 $3.80 NO BID $3.07 NO BID $5.50
4" B $9.79 NO BID $3.84 $3.98 $3.43 $4.64 NO BID $3.52 NO BID $6.50
5" B $10.86 NO BID $5.04 $5.15 $7.97 $6.45 NO BID $4.29 NO BID $9.00
6"B $11.94 NO BID $6.35 $6.50 $11.22 $7.80 NO BID $5.67 NO BID $11.00
Letters & Numbers
HI-Intensity
2" B $7.88 NO BID $3.55 $3.15 $2.78 $5.26 NO BID $3.93 NO BID $5.50
3"B $11.91 NO BID $5.60 $5.15 $4.62 $7.53 NO BID $6.09 NO BID $9.50
4" B $13.93 NO BID $7.85 $5.75 $6.73 $8.60 NO BID $7.86 NO BID $11.00
5" B $14.99 NO BID $12.75 $9.95 $13.10 $12.75 NO BID $10.86 NO BID $16.00
6" B $18.63 NO BID $14.44 $11.50 $18.43 $16.50 NO BID $14.95 NO BID $18.00
Black Reflective
Sheeting
2"D $6.89 NO BID $3.25 $2.98 $2.19 $3.95 NO BID $4.30 NO BID $4.00
3"D $8.51 NO BID $3.60 $3.35 $4.47 $4.79 NO BID $5.50 NO BID $5.80
4"D $9.79 NO BID $5.94 $4.15 $4.19 $6.08 NO BID $3.95 NO BID $9.00
4"E $9.79 NO BID $7.70 $4.45 $4.66 $10.22 NO BID $10.10 NO BID $16.00
5"D $10.86 NO BID $7.52 $6.15 $5.64 $6.95 NO BID $10.60 NO BID $24.00
5"E $10.86 NO BID $9.74 $6.15 $6.16 $11.35 NO BID $12.10 NO BID $28.00
6" D $11.94 NO BID $10.29 $7.50 $16.03 $7.97 NO BID $14.20 NO BID $13.00
6" E $11.94 NO BID $12.05 $11.50 $22.16 $12.50 NO BID $17.10 NO BID $30.00
Minimum $ Order $1,500.00 NO BID $100.00 $50.00 $100.00 NONE NONE 500# NONE $500.00
Number of Days
Delivery 45 DAYS 10-14 DAYS [0.45 DAYS AR{ 21-35 DAYS | 12-15 DAYS 14 DAYS 30-45 ARO | 45-60 DAYS 30 DAYS

Comments:




