
WEED CONTROL CHEMICALS BID TABULATION

Weed Control       
Chemicals          

2-6-07
Supreme Turf 
Products Inc. Univar USA Natur Chem Inc. ChemSol CWC Chemical Carso Inc Lesco, Inc.

HERBICIDES
  1.  Glyphosate Pro II    

30 Gallon $795.00 $870.00 $378.00 $1,600.00 NO BID NO BID $800.00

 2.  Roundup "ULTRA" NO BID NO BID $761.40 $860.00 NO BID NO BID $600.00
3.  Roundup APRO      

30 Gallon $1,395.00 $1,262.70 $378.00 $1,410.00 $1,000.00 $367.50 $800.00

COMMENTS:
ALTERNATE TO 
1. RANGER PRO

ALTERNATE TO: 
1. RAZOR PRO   
2. ROUND UP 

ORIGINAL MAX 
3. RAZOR PRO   

ALTERNATE TO: 
3. IMITATOR 

PLUS

ALTERNATE TO:       
1. PROSECUTOR PRO   

2. PROSECUTOR       
3. PROSECUTOR PRO


