
BID TABULATION - AERIAL IMAGERY AND SOFTWARE

AERIAL IMAGERY AND 
SOFTWARE                      

BID OPENING                    
9-22-09

PICTOMETRY 
INTERNATIONAL 
CORPORATION

ESRI

NEIGHBORHOOD 4 WAY $74,655.00 NO BID
COMMUNITY 2 WAY $30,051.00 NO BID

6" ORTHO TILES $474.00 NO BID
12" ORTHO TILES $371.00 NO BID

ONLINE SEAT $1,920.00 NO BID
ADVANCED TRAINING $4,330.00 NO BID

HARD DRIVE $225.00 NO BID
TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 1 & 2 $112,026.00 NO BID

NEIGHBORHOOD 4 WAY $78,803.00 NO BID
COMMUNITY 2 WAY $31,721.00 NO BID

6" ORTHO TILES $5,214.00 NO BID
12" ORTHO TILES $7,791.00 NO BID

ONLINE SEAT N/A NO BID
HARD DRIVE $225.00 NO BID

TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 3 & 4 $123,753.00 NO BID

NEIGHBORHOOD 4 WAY $82,950.00 NO BID
COMMUNITY 2 WAY $33,390.00 NO BID

6" ORTHO TILES $9,954.00 NO BID
12" ORTHO TILES $15,211.00 NO BID

ONLINE SEAT N/A NO BID
HARD DRIVE $225.00 NO BID

TOTAL COST FOR YEAR 5 & 6 $141,730.00 NO BID

TOTAL 6 YEAR COST $377,509.00 NO BID

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES NO BID
E-VERIFY DOCUMENTATION NO NO BID

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES NO BID

COMMENTS:

ADDITIONAL OPITONS - 
ADVANCED TRAINING 

FOR YEAR 3 &4 - $4,330.00, 
YEAR 5 & 6 - $4,330.00 

PRICES ARE THE 
INDIVIDUAL TWO-YEAR 
COSTS WHEN A 6 YEAR 

CONTRACT IS PURCHASED


