
BID TABULATION - ALUMINIZED STEEL TYPE 2 PIPE

ALUMINIZED STEEL       
TYPE 2 PIPE               

BID OPENING              
1-27-09

METAL 
CULVERTS 

INC

METAL 
CULVERTS 

INC

METAL 
CULVERTS 

INC

THOMPSON 
CULVERT 

CO.

THOMPSON 
CULVERT 

CO.

THOMPSON 
CULVERT 

CO.

2 2/3 x 1/2 Corrugation       
16 GAUGE

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

12" $7.55 $7.55 $42.15 $6.88 $6.88 $44.28
15" $9.50 $9.50 $53.55 $8.26 $8.26 $54.99
18" $11.28 $11.28 $69.40 $10.32 $10.32 $71.30
24" $15.09 $15.09 $103.55 $13.07 $13.07 $106.43
30" $18.49 $27.74 $174.70 $16.51 $16.51 $212.33
36" $22.05 $33.08 $281.55 $19.95 $29.93 $342.27
42" $25.78 $38.67 $531.00 $23.40 $35.10 $741.71
48" $29.34 $44.01 $618.00 $26.15 $39.23 $847.19

3 x 1 Corrugation            
16 GAUGE

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

54" $38.98 $58.47 $732.50 $38.02 $57.03 $937.75
60" $43.11 $86.22 $1,098.00 $41.82 $62.73 $1,406.65
66" $47.15 $94.30 $1,180.00 $45.62 $91.24 $1,512.14
72" $51.28 $102.56 $1,309.30 $50.19 $100.38 $1,676.25
84" $61.46 $122.92 $1,547.35 $61.63 $123.26 $1,981.03
96" $69.98 $139.96 $2,052.75 $69.63 $139.26 $2,628.10

14 GUAGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

108" $104.33 $208.66 N/A $96.05 $192.10 NO BID

12 GUAGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

120" $149.38 $298.76 N/A $146.47 $292.94 NO BID

16 GAUGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

17 x 13 $10.18 $10.18 $53.85 $8.99 $8.99 $56.61
21 x 15 $11.96 $11.96 $63.15 $11.24 $11.24 $66.39
24 x 18 $13.91 $13.91 $76.80 $12.74 $12.74 $80.76
28 x 20 $16.11 $16.11 $90.50 $14.24 $14.24 $95.15
35 x 24 $19.50 $29.25 $140.10 $17.99 $17.99 $177.54
42 x 29 $23.24 $34.86 $221.55 $21.73 $32.60 $263.63

12 GAUGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

49 x 33 $46.51 $69.77 $381.80 $42.72 $64.08 $473.99
57 x 38 $52.88 $79.32 $476.10 $48.71 $73.07 $677.27

3 x 1 Corrugation            
14 GAUGE

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

60 x  46 $51.36 $102.72 $695.00 $49.43 $74.15 $869.75
66 x 51 $56.98 $113.96 $918.90 $54.30 $81.45 $1,148.76
73 x 55 $62.34 $124.68 $1,233.10 $59.97 $119.94 $1,541.46
81 x 59 $67.96 $135.92 $1,298.75 $65.64 $131.28 $1,623.52
95 x 67 $80.07 $160.14 $1,453.55 $79.94 $159.88 $1,816.94

12 GAUGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

112 x 75 $127.40 $254.80 $1,883.00 $125.01 $250.02 $2,353.78
128 x 83 $143.47 $286.94 N/A $140.32 $280.64 NO BID

10 GAUGE COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

COST/FOOT 
RIVITED

CONNECTING 
BANDS EA.

GALV. FLARED END
EA.

142 x 91 $205.89 $411.78 N/A $198.99 $397.98 NO BID
COMMENTS:


