BID TABULATION - AMMUNITION

DEL: 60 - 90 DAYS

AMMUNITION LAWMENS &
BID OPENING SHOOTERS BVAC INC GULFSTATES | _ AC’;?&’:L\'SEPDPLY
2-3-09 SUPPLY, INC
PISTOL AMMUNITION
Cost per 1000 @ 42,000 rds.
$217.00PR CS =
TOTAL NO BID $259.00 PER 1,000 $9,114.00 $570.00 M
DEL: 90 - 120 DAYS
SHOTGUN AMMUNITION
12 Gauge 9 Pellet 00 Buckshot
Cost per 1000 @ 3,000 rds.
$95.00 PR CS =
TOTAL NO BID $410.00 PER 1,000 $1,140.00 NO BID
DEL: 30 DAYS
12 Gauge Rifled Slug
Cost per 1000 @ 3,000 rds.
$109.00 PR CS =
TOTAL NO BID $500.00 PER 1,000 $1,308.00 NO BID
DEL: 30 DAYS
RIFLE AMMUNITION
.223 Rem. 55 grain tactical
jacketed soft point rifle round
Cost per 1000 @ 15,000 rds
$470.00 PR 1000 =
TOTAL $524.21/ $7,863.15 $289.97 PER 1,000 $7,05000 $525.00 M

.308 Win. Match 168 Grain
Bow Tail Hollow Point
Ammunition

Cost per 500 rds.

TOTAL

COMMENTS:

$179.07 / $537.21

$635.00 PER 1,000

$359.00 PR 500
DEL: 30 DAYS

PROVIDED COPY
OF INSURANCE

$194.00 PR CS
OF 200




