
BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

BITUMINOUS MATERIAL   
BID OPENING              

1-27-09

Simpson 
Construction 

Materials

Pace 
Construction 

Company

N.B. West 
Contracting 
Company

Lead Belt 
Materials Inc. Fred Weber Inc. Mineral Area 

Asphalt

Liquid Bituminous           
Material  Cost Per Gal. 

Delivered
MC-30 NO BID NO BID $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MC-3000 NO BID NO BID $2.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2 NO BID NO BID $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

CRS-2P NO BID NO BID $2.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SS-1H NO BID NO BID $2.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID

HFE-150 NO BID NO BID $2.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Liquid Bituminous           

Material  Cost Per Gal. Bulk
MC-30 NO BID NO BID $2.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MC-3000 NO BID NO BID $2.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2 NO BID NO BID $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gallon Bucket of CRS-2 NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2P NO BID NO BID $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SS-1H NO BID NO BID $2.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gallon Bucket of SS-1H $35.00 $32.00 $40.00 NO BID $6.00 GAL NO BID
HFE-150 NO BID NO BID $2.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Cold Mix                   
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up

NO BID $74.00 $55.00 $55.00 NO BID NO BID

Modified Cold Mix           
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up

NO BID NO BID $100.00 NO BID $97.50         
SOUTH OR FESTUS

NO BID

Hot Mix                    
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up

$44.75 $43.00 $43.00 $49.75
$43.00 SOUTH       

$47.00 FESTUS OR 
TRAUTMAN

$41.50

Haul Chart                  
Cold Mix Stock Pile

0-5 N/A $4.90 $3.35 $3.50 $3.50 NO BID
5-10 N/A $5.40 $4.15 $4.30 $4.90 NO BID
10-15 N/A $5.90 $4.80 $4.95 $5.00 NO BID
15-20 N/A $6.40 $5.65 $5.95 $5.80 NO BID
20-25 N/A $6.90 $6.25 $6.50 $6.40 NO BID
25-30 N/A $7.25 $6.70 $7.20 $6.75 NO BID
30-35 N/A $7.75 $7.10 $7.60 $7.25 NO BID
35-40 N/A $8.15 $7.45 $8.40 $7.90 NO BID
40-45 N/A $8.65 $7.95 $8.90 $8.40 NO BID
45-50 N/A $9.15 $8.50 $9.50 $8.75 NO BID

50+ N/A $0.50 $8.50 + $.10    
PER TON / MILE

$0.25 NO BID NO BID

Haul Chart                  
Hot Mix Job Site

0-5 $4.00 $4.90 $3.35 $3.50 $3.50 $3.10
5-10 $4.40 $5.40 $4.15 $4.30 $4.90 $4.05
10-15 $4.65 $5.90 $4.80 $4.95 $5.00 $4.80
15-20 $4.98 $6.40 $5.65 $5.95 $5.80 $5.70
20-25 $5.40 $6.90 $6.25 $6.50 $6.40 $6.50
25-30 N/A $7.25 $6.70 $7.20 $6.75 $7.25
30-35 N/A $7.75 $7.10 $7.60 $7.25 $7.85
35-40 N/A $8.15 $7.45 $8.40 $7.90 $8.50
40-45 N/A $8.65 $7.95 $8.90 $8.40 $9.45
45-50 N/A $9.15 $8.50 $9.50 $8.75 $10.15

+50 N/A $0.50 $8.50 + $.10    
PER TON / MILE

$0.25 NO BID $0.20

Prices Firm Until 4/1/09 5/1/09 MONTH TO MONTH 4/30/09 3/31/09 2/28/09

COMMENTS:


