BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL

CRUSHED STONE & WINTER HOUSE SIMPSON
GRAVEL Kﬁ'zﬁiﬁ\lfgp\ BROS TRAUTMAN ANTIRE BUSSEN QSUPEIQE(iS& CONSTRUCTI JOQES-::'ON CENTRAL V\leRIBEEDR
BID OPENING Co MATERIAL QUARRY QUARRY QUARY MATERIALS ON co STONE CO INC
1-27-09 CcO INC MATERIALS
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
174" N/A N/A $8.20 $10.25 $10.25 $8.75 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3/8" N/A N/A $8.20 $10.25 $10.25 $8.75 N/A N/A $9.00 $8.55
172" N/A N/A $8.20 $10.25 $10.25 $8.75 N/A N/A $9.00 $8.55
3/4" N/A N/A $7.70 $8.20 $8.20 $8.25 $7.75 $7.50 $8.15 $7.25
1" N/A N/A $7.70 $8.20 $8.20 $8.25 $7.75 $7.70 $8.15 $7.25
11/4" N/A N/A $7.70 $8.20 $8.20 $7.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
112" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 N/A N/A N/A $6.80
13/4" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
o N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 $6.75 $6.50 $7.45 $6.35
3" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 N/A N/A N/A $6.35
4" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 N/A $6.50 N/A $6.35
5" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 N/A $7.95 N/A N/A NO BID
6" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
MINUS
Cost per Ton
174" N/A N/A $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $4.25 $2.50 $2.50 $1.80 NO BID
3/8" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $4.25 $2.50 N/A $4.40 $4.35
12" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $4.25 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3/4" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 $4.50 $4.70 $4.95 NO BID
1 N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 $4.50 $4.70 $5.10 $4.35
114" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
112" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 N/A N/A N/A $4.35
o N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 $4.50 $4.70 $4.95 $4.35
2 12 N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 N/A $4.70 N/A $4.35
4" N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 N/A $4.70 N/A $4.35
1/2 - 4 Minus Backfill N/A N/A $4.70 $4.90 $4.90 $5.00 $1.50 N/A N/A NO BID
COMMENTS: N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A MIE;D;)CR N/A N/A N/A N/A
MAC
Cost per Ton
174" N/A N/A $7.70 $10.25 $10.25 $8.75 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
172" N/A N/A $7.70 $10.25 $10.25 $8.75 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3/4" N/A N/A $7.70 $8.20 $8.20 $8.25 $7.75 N/A N/A NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL

CRUSHED STONE & WINTER HOUSE SIMPSON
GRAVEL Kﬁ'zﬁi?ﬁgp\ BROS TRAUTMAN ANTIRE BUSSEN QSUP:;E(\;(S& CONSTRUCTI JOQES'::'ON CENTRAL VCER:EDR
BID OPENING Co MATERIAL QUARRY QUARRY QUARY MATERIALS ON co STONE CO INC
1-27-09 (6{0) INC MATERIALS
1" N/A N/A $7.70 $8.20 $8.20 $8.25 $7.75 N/A N/A NO BID
2" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 $6.75 N/A N/A NO BID
3" N/A N/A $6.50 $7.20 $7.20 $7.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3X10 N/A N/A N/A $9.50 $9.50 $9.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
OTHER
Cost Per Ton
3X10 N/A N/A N/A $9.50 $9.50 $9.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
SHOT ROCK N/A N/A $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $5.00 $5.50 $4.00 N/A $4.75
GABION ROCK N/A N/A N/A $9.50 $9.50 N/A $11.50 $9.00 N/A $8.60
QUARRY RUN N/A N/A $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $5.00 $5.50 $4.70 $4.65 $4.75
DIRTY STONE N/A N/A $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $5.50 N/A N/A NO BID
DIRT N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
SAND N/A N/A N/A N/A $4.90 N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.70
DIRTY STONE N/A N/A $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
FILTER ROCK N/A N/A $6.50 $7.10 $7.10 $9.50 N/A N/A N/A NO BID
DIRTY SHOT ROCK N/A N/A $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $5.50 N/A $3.10 $4.75
BLANKET ROCK N/A N/A $10.50 $10.50 $10.50 $10.50 N/A $9.00 $9.75 NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN N/A N/A $10.50 $9.50 $9.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL N/A $7.70 N/A N/A N/A N/A $7.70 N/A N/A NO BID
SCREENED GRAVEL N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
CREEK GRAVEL N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
B-GRAVEL N/A $9.75 N/A N/A N/A N/A $10.00 N/A N/A NO BID
C-GRAVEL N/A $8.90 N/A N/A N/A N/A $8.20 N/A N/A NO BID
CONCRETE ROCK N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
FILTER SAND N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $9.25 N/A N/A NO BID
SAND N/A $9.15 N/A N/A N/A N/A $9.25 N/A N/A NO BID
PULVERIZED
DIRT N/A $13.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A $5.00 N/A N/A NO BID
BANK RUN
$9.00
BLANKET ROCK N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
SHOT ROCK N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
3 X 10 CLEAN N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL

HOUSE

CRUSHED STONE & WINTER SIMPSON
GRAVEL Kﬁzﬁi?ﬁgp\ BROS TRAUTMAN ANTIRE BUSSEN QSUPEIQE(iS& CONSTRUCTI JOQES'::'ON CENTRAL VCERI;EEDR
BID OPENING Co MATERIAL QUARRY QUARRY QUARY MATERIALS ON co STONE CO INC
1-27-09 Co INC MATERIALS
HAUL CHART
STOCK PILE
DELIVERY
0-5 $2.80 $3.90 $3.20 $3.60 $3.60 $3.25 $3.10 $3.00 $3.05 $3.00
5-10 $3.00 $3.90 $3.60 $4.00 $4.00 $3.65 $3.25 $3.50 $3.70 $3.50
10-15 $3.60 $5.05 $4.10 $4.50 $4.50 $4.20 $3.60 $4.00 $4.45 $4.50
15-20 $4.00 $5.45 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $4.15 $4.75 N/A $4.80
20-25 $4.40 $5.85 $5.30 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $4.60 $5.75 N/A $5.50
25-30 $4.80 $6.35 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.00 $6.50 N/A $5.80
30-35 $5.10 $8.15 $6.70 $6.50 $6.50 $6.00 N/A $7.75 N/A $6.20
35-40 $5.40 $9.20 $7.40 $7.00 $7.00 $6.50 N/A $8.75 N/A $6.50
40-45 $5.80 $10.05 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $7.00 N/A $9.75 N/A $7.65
45-50 $6.20 $10.85 $8.70 $9.00 $9.00 $7.50 N/A $10.75 N/A $8.40
+50 $6.80 CALL N/A N/A N/A $8.00 N/A $15.00 N/A NO BID
ADD ON
PRICE ON SITE
DELIVERY
0-5 $2.80 $3.90 $3.20 $3.60 $3.60 $3.25 $3.10 $3.00 $3.05 $3.00
5-10 $3.00 $3.90 $3.60 $4.00 $4.00 $3.65 $3.25 $3.50 $3.70 $3.50
10-15 $3.60 $5.05 $4.10 $4.50 $4.50 $4.20 $3.60 $4.00 $4.45 $4.50
15-20 $4.00 $5.45 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $4.15 $4.75 N/A $4.80
20-25 $4.40 $5.85 $5.30 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $4.60 $5.75 N/A $5.50
25-30 $4.80 $6.35 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.00 $6.50 N/A $5.80
30-35 $5.10 $8.15 $6.70 $6.50 $6.50 $6.00 N/A $7.75 N/A $6.20
35-40 $5.40 $9.20 $7.40 $7.00 $7.00 $6.50 N/A $8.75 N/A $6.50
40-45 $5.80 $10.05 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $7.00 N/A $9.75 N/A $7.65
45-50 $6.20 $10.85 $8.70 $9.00 $9.00 $7.50 N/A $10.75 N/A $8.40
+50 $6.80 CALL N/A N/A N/A $8.00 N/A $15.00 N/A NO BID
ADD $.75/TON - | ADD $.75/TON -
SHOT ROCK GABION ADD $1.00/TON - ADD $1.00 PER SU;’{‘E%LTSTA(‘)RE 1
COMMENTS N/A N/A ADD $1.00/TON - | ADD $1.50/TON - | GABION & DROP N/A N/A N/A TONFORRB.& [T 0 v oo
DROP BALL DROP BALL BALL ROCK QR
ROCK ROCK HAUL PER LOAD
COPY OF INSURANCE N/A YES N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

PROVIDED




