
BID TABULATION - HIGHWAY SALT

HIGHWAY SALT      
BID OPENING        

5-5-09

INTERNATIONAL 
SALT

GUNTHER        
SALT CO

CHICK 
CONSTRUCTION 

PRODUCTS

NORTH 
AMERICAN       

SALT             
COMPANY

CENTRAL        
SALT LLC MORTON SALT CARGILL

EAST GARAGE NO BID $74.75 $84.90 $62.49 $68.77 $66.57 $61.80

WEST GARAGE NO BID $74.75 $84.35 $62.49 $68.77 $65.34 $61.80

NORHT GARAGE NO BID $74.75 $84.35 $62.49 $68.77 $64.08 $61.80

ESTIMATED TIME 
FOR DELIVERY NO BID 1 - 3 DAYS ARO 

PER 1,000 TONS 60 - 90 DAYS 5 - 7 DAYS ARO

25% EACH         
WEEK UNTIL 

DELIVERED IN 
FULL

1 - 5 DAYS ARO

5 - 7 BUSINESS 
DAYS AFTER 
RECEIPT OF 

ORDER

AFFIDAVIT 
COMPLETED NO BID YES YES YES YES YES YES

E-VERIFY 
DOCUMENTATION NO BID NO NO NO NO NO YES

COPY OF INSURANCE 
PROVIDED NO BID NO NO NO NO YES NO

COMMENTS:


